
CRL MP DIARY DATED : 29-08-2024 

S.No. Case No. Proceedings 

1.  

CRL MP 244/2018 
CRL MP SR 21/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

2.  

CRL MP 47/2023 
CRL MP SR 55/2023 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

3.  

CRL MP 343/2020 
CRLMP SR 52/2023 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

4.  

CRL MP 241/2021 
CRLMP SR 20/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

5.  

CRL MP 242/2021 
CRLMP SR 19/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

6.  

CRL MP 244/2021 
CRLMP SR 22/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

7.  

CRL MP 240/2021 
CRLMP SR 25/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

8.  

CRL MP 239/2021 
CRLMP SR 26/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 



Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

9.  

CRL MP 238/2021 
CRLMP SR 27/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

10.  

CRL MP 243/2021 
CRLMP SR 28/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

11.  

CRL MP 114/2023 
CRL MP SR 9/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

12.  

CRL MP 115/2023 
CRL MP SR 9/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

13.  

CRL MP 116/2022 
CRL MP SR 13/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

14.  

CRL MP 117/2022 
CRL MP SR 7/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

15.  

CRL MP 113/2022 
CRL MP SR 18/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

16.  

CRL MP 112/2022 
CRL MP SR 10/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 



17.  

CRL MP 111/2022 
CRL MP SR 16/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

18.  

CRL MP 110/2022 
CRL MP SR 15/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

19.  

CRL MP 109/2022 
CRL MP SR 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

20.  

CRL MP 108/2022 
CRL MP SR 4/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

21.  

CRL MP 118/2022 
CRL MP SR 6/2022 

Special Public Prosecutor is present. Petitioner side 
no representation. Previously Petitioner submitted 
arguments. No representation from Accused 
company. Previously both submitted arguments. 
Special PP reported previous arguments alone are 
relied. Heard,. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

22.  
Crl mp 25/2024  Counsel for petitioner and PP present. Heard from 

both sides. For orders, call on 01-10-2024. 

  



 


