B A&AT—24 yofieReT SEa—UA/DO/DDN/30/2024-2026

o A T A A T A (AL

STRIEGVE UG GIRT USI30d

SIATENR Y]

QEUGH, GIAR, 13 I, 2026 0

A7 23, 1948 TS [¥

BINTEUS 2AMHA
faamrfl vd g ot fovrr

A& 108 / XXXVI (3) /2026 /22 (1) /2026
QEVIGH, 13 3, 2026

srferg==T
fafaer

" e T WRYE @ arEe 200 @ N WEMRT IISUUTel T SwRETS
Ry T gRT uiRd SaREeS S faearE (wa’ﬁ CalRHICE ) IRGERC
2026" WX B 10 oiiel, 2026 BT AR WA W QM A& ITRRATS DY
SRR T 03, A 2026 B TG H WI—NEROT B AR W EGIT GRI
TR faaT ST & |




2 STRTEUS IATENRT wie, 13 e, 2026 S0 (A3 23, 1948 ¥& wwaq)

SRS O R (SUdE) @1 Geiee) SRRRE, 2026
(STRTEvs srfer~w wwar— 03, 99 2026)

| Sile R YR DY I §99 @ fore fAsary amnRe omaT @) 8k
¥ ge™ @ for rRwml @l IR—eTRIRe TN ofR TEEIT 9N @ R
fmwa@ﬁaﬁﬁwmaﬂﬁ%@

rferfags
| WW%WH@#WW%{WWW
| frafoRea w0 # a8 afRfafa |

g A 1. (1) 39 JEFRm & Al IW ST OF
3R A fwarer (Susel o1 weeF) afdifm, 2026 B |
(2) 7% T Tgr &

EahEp] 2. A B W (4) § STeaRag st o, w@iw
srferfraffcm  (5) # aftfa Awr we iR affa Ry § vaeEw

T T : e foar Sar €

SEF & 3. SRl W sfeaga sifvafafal  fafr= wraumst
NSl @ R ge fhy Y g ik wRedl @), g
geTeT SR & aRd B9 @ A W s d 9 @)

TII%T & g, 9= FEiRa s a1 wRa, S
A A B, @ Eaw I @ g9 uikw %
qQTAT I |

agRT 4. 39 JAETH grr Al sfffiy @ deiem ar
e 9, 5 oy iffaffe w R weni
a1 R sffaff arg @& 1 2wl
arerar fafdse @1 1 B, warg wE g,

3R ¥y feem, @ # @ g a7 gl TS
foet @ @ e, i, wae
oo a1 gd # & «foia, weyd ar Suwd e
EPR, TP, qEET A AR W IAD Gy H
foell SuaR @ el @ Rl e wiRa,
e, SR, <19 AT A AT SR i iR
S 9T qd § & een ekl afigRf ar e
oy 7 Rl Bl o o @ wgw w], yew W
SIS



STRIETUS IMERYT To(e, 13 3, 2026 S0 (AT 23, 1948 Ab Wrad)

BfeAsal P
feraror 31 wifeRT

5,

6.

R wr offrm Oy & fedl Rgia o
frag o wenfie effeRar, fvees @& wu o
I TN, Umfa AT ufhar wm faEme ver,. W

iR, fdwem, ge, ug a1 fgfite ™ 31 9

& B0 gY O e e erern & 98 A e
W afffafy g o 5 goggERr e @
rfyg & € 2 S o osaw el AR A

g fbaT AT AT ARIEIIE § AT R

N g offrm gwr fe sl @
woee ar frad @ RN efdeiRar, ug, W,
ugfy, wikar o1 o= vy W A B, S
fere o1 oo W8l B, Y Uadd a1 uedraed el
BT |

afe g AfUfEg @ Suddl B W B § Bl
FHfAE Y= B 2 Al T R U AR
ERT, S 3 AT & Sudyl ¥ ST 7 8l 39
HIGAS Bl G DY ADUI: '

TR QT DI MY 3 R B U B
& 9§ Pl A & UTAR] Tl [HaT ST |

(1) SoRIEvS OF v (Suhdl B )
FeTee, 2025 YAgERNT FRAG foar < & | '
(2) W PR @ B BU A S SRAQY B
B TS PBIT A AT BRATS 39 AR B AR
Susert © T B AASN S |



SINIEUS TR Tole, 13 M, 2026 0 (A7 23, 1948 IF THT)

STl
(EmT 2 ARea)
.| a | wHen HigreT NNICE]
q.
M| @ (3) ) 6)
1 | 2005 06 SCRIGUS -l | ORT 23 H—
B (e SR | () g (2) e uRwenfia
we) TR, | v & o, ererfa—
2005

“(2) PIS HfFT W URT 16 B
SR Wit afda @r fo
(G G B e N o
T STl § T VA i Bl
I B SR S el
o fsa fmar s

(i) SURT (3) &I Wus (4)
e oforenfia @ fea
ST, ererfa—

“(@) aRfFRE @ ou 21
e SrgAfd ar e o
U U B v el vy A
SE1 I <ar € AT R eR
T& |l B U war g A
FefTw & uauel & fod
UPR STATT HRaAl 7, 98 UM
AR B ford Iad & EOR
3R ARHTT T FAR W
% GEIF SR TR TRt
@ ford aH 9 TR W
3R ST I EOIR WU &
A W gfved faar s

(i) SUIRT (3) & WU (8) &
g EfRag we
AR wx fear R,
-

IR URT 23 @I SUERT |
@ & ws () W @ @
IedeT @ AT N il
T EOR SO & QA I A
g TF B PRET IT & |
gfisa foar o




TIRIETE IR TToe, 13 3iiel, 2026 $0 (AF 23, 1948 ¥FH WHA)

2013 07 IENETS g1 | ORT 13 H—
T AR s () T (@) P
AR, 2012 | ghnerflg @we 2y o
3T
“(@) AN W[, W@ ufE FER
@) wve (F) @& [N W
fafg & Jean 99 uds fod
7 for, e dRM oTRW
IR REAT B, AT TP UK
W TF B DI, R
@ T wvs (M) e
graenfog ox foar R,
arerfe—
‘(M) 9 AMEl W oWEl S
T ®, M W S 4 gR
T TP B ADHAT AT AR
FRIANT & Sl & AT oD Bl
8 G AT A W, &fved
forar SmT |
2013 17 IEONRIUE WIRed | IRT 10 H—
AR o ol TR A A B U W, TR
SR BE—PNRT | gy e 7oy Ry SN |
(ST 3R
FIRAIROT &1
fafeermm) arferfram,
2013
2016 18 | SRIEUS ST P | GRT 5 H—
AR fFrepral | vreg iR o “08 WIE' B AN
gaferd HfoM | R, ¥ 3R 8fF 03 W' 9
IRT & GER, | & SR |
[CIRRIGINETYN
gr{ajwmq Uq
3rferspEoT forer
eI, 2016 |
2019 07 SRVNECISS] N | &RT 5 H,—
Aar e wu W, :
_ () SOYRT (1) #, g AR frw
FHGR T F M| ey oy & prwrg & o
INET) SR i ww aw @ wed, @
e AN W O 4 TR W0 T




SURTETS INTERT Tolc, 13 e, 2026 $0 (AT 23, 1948 S ¥

BT & WM WO 3R
| forg Al W S ATl BN
W Th B DAL, TUSAE
BN v e SRl

(i) SUSTRT (2) &7 AT dx 3o

(iii) STIRT (3) T o oY e
ST |

2020

08

STRNGUS Sded
DY SR,

2019

“12. I B3 39 Iffw @
OqRT 3, 4, 5 8 SAT 9 B

@) & 3= e H
TP NI 9 U YRT 3 @l
& i fafafde

2020

11

TENRGUE el
Yerermer (faferas)
IS, 2019

Py CYT W 6 HIE Ah Bl
FREAT 7 W0 50,000 (w0




SIRTETS INTIRIT Tole, 13 e, 2026 30 (AF 23, 1948 P W)

r TE TOIR) TH @ oEe o 0
it frar oA @ <M
W I, F iR fum “sW
T JERRE W
1,00000/ (TR TH &) D
SEE W S 500000/ (W
Uld o) % & 9dbal & ol
el < ¥ afdw g9 @
T # eiftw g @ faf
TF ST 1,000/ (@0 UG
oR) URia & PR AN
T W e fear s el
fedr s uwemad! ]uRifg
B AT § WO 10,00000/ (T
TH @) qF B OgAEE ¥
Tfeg far R <@ 3
SR |

JATST |,

3

MY i |



STURIEUS /TR ole, 13 3Wd, 2026 S0 (AT 23, 1948 P )

RN 3R BRI B U

TR fadas o1 Seey Rt o el & aga Bic arREl
B IRY—H B 8, o e uftdet (e wRaT) @ Aife
- AN 3R memrfe Surt ¥ ufRenfue frar WIQT| UE GER ©% GReR B
- TR SR M WY W YA Y O e g & 3wy ©, i o
ATUR YITAAT Bl IQTAT 1, RMYF G BT B Bl (A9 DY Aiearned o
3iR 3rgUre T3l BT GRAPNOT B 2 |

2— @B A § TR WS AURIEHREAROT (decriminalisation) 3R Us
& MBS (rationalisation) BT GHRTT o1, @i fAvara smenRa A
D1 3N D Ggo a1 O q& T W Slla SR FGHR B Bl GIrHar ol
g foar o w0 |

3—  Udrdd e SeRmEve o fawar (SUdHT ST HeleE) JeAresl, 2025
BT Ul {9erge 8 e SuRISd Ieedl &l Yl HRar © |

gepR e el
A |



TIRTETS JMTERYT Toe, 13 30, 2026 $0 (AT 23, 1948 ¥EH T 9

No. 108/XXXVI1(3)/2026/22(1)/2026
Dated Dehradun, April 13, 2026

| NOTIFICATION

; Miscellaneous

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 ol the
Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
- o ) - ' ;
following English translation of “The Uttarakhand Jan Vishwas (Amendment

Of Provisions) Act, 2026’ (Adhiniyam Sankhya 03, o[ 2026)

As passed by the Uttarakhand Legislative Assemble and assented to

by the Governor on 10 April, 2026.

THE UTTARAKHAND JAN VISHWAS (AMENDMENT
OF PROVISIONS)

ACT, 2026

[Uttarakhand Act No. 03 Of 2026]
AN
ACT
to amend certain enactments for decriminalising and rationalising offences to

further enhance trust-based governance for ease of living and doing business,

be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Uttarakhand in the Seventy
seventh year of Republic of India as follows:-

Short title and 1. (1)This Act may be called the Uttarakhand Jan Vishwas
commencement (Amendment of Provisions) Act, 2026.

{2)It shall come into force at once.

Amendment of 2. The enactments mentioned in column (4) of the Schedule are

certain _ hereby amended to the extent and in the manner mentioned in
enactments column (5) thereof.

Revisions  ef 3. The fines and penalties provided under various provisions in the
fines and enactments mentioned in the Schedule shall be increased by ten
penalties per cent of the minimum amount of fine or penalty, as the case

may be, prescribed therefor, after the expiry of every three years
from the date of commencement of this Act.



10

TINTETS IRATERYT [oiE, 13 30)e, 2026 S0 (AT 23, 1948 UPH HH)

Savings

Power
remove
difficulties

Repeal
Saving

to

and

4.

6.

The amendment or repeal by this Act of any enactment shall not
affect any other enactment in which the amended or repealed
enactment has béen applied, incorporated or referred to;

and this Act shall not affect the validity, invalidity, effect or
consequences of anything already done or suffered, or any right,
title, obligation or liability already acquired, accrued or incurred
or any remedy or proceeding in respect thereof, or any release
or discharge of, or from any debt, penalty, obligation, liability,
claim or demand, or any indemnity already granted, or the proof
of any past act or thing;

nor shall this Act affect any principle or rule of law, or

established jurisdiction, form or course of pleading, practice or
procedure, or existing usage, custom, privilege, restriction,

“exemption, office or appointment, notwithstanding that the

same respectively may have been in any manner affirmed, or
recognised or derived by, in or from any enactment hereby
amended or repealed;

nor shall the amendment or .repeal by this Act of any
enactment revive or restore any jurisdiction, office, custom,
liability, right, title, privilege, restriction, exemption, usage,
practice, procedure or other matter or thing not now existing or
in force.

If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of
this Act, the State Government may, by order, not inconsistent
with the provisions of this Act, remove that difficulty:

Provided that no such order shall be made after the expiry
of a period of two years from the commencement of this Act.

(1) The Uttarakhand Jan Vishwas (Amendment of Provisions)
Ordinance, 2025 is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal anything done or any action
taken under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been
done or taken under the corresponding provisions of this Act.



STRIEUS ATERYT olE, 13 IAIel, 2026 30 (AF 23, 1948 D WH) 11

THE SCHEDULE
- (See Section 2)

No.

Year

No.

Short title

Amendments

(2)

“4)

©)]

(D)
L.

2005

3)
- 06

The Uttarakhand
River Valley
(Development
and Management)
Act, 2005

In section 23,-
(i) sub-section (2) shall be substituted as
follows, namely-

“(2) Any person who obstructs the entry of a
person Authorised under section 16 to entry
into or upon any land or building or molests
such person after such entry shall be
punishable with fine of five thousand rupees”.

(ii) clause (d) of sub-section (3) shall be
substituted as follows, namely-

“(d) For the purpose of obtaining any
permission or NOC under section 21 of
the Act makes a statement which is false
in any material particular or in any way
pollutes the River Valley or otherwise
contravens the provisions of this Act
shall be punishable with fine of
minimum two thousand and maximum of
ten thousand rupees for first offence and
minimum of ten thousand rupees and a
maximum of twenty thousand rupees for
subsequent offences:”

(iii) after clause (d) of sub-section (3)
following proviso shall be inserted, namely-
“Provided that in cases where thereis a
violation of'clause (a) and (b) of sub-section
(3) of section 23, the offender shall be
punished with a fine of fifty thousand
rupees or imprisonment of up to two
months or both.”

2013

07

The Uttarakhand
Flood Plain
Zoning Act, 2012

In section 13, - N
(i) clause (a) and (b) shall be substituted as

follows, namely.- _ 3
(a) with fine which may extend to five
thousand rupees, and




12

STURTEVS IMTERYT Tole, 13 Mhd, 2026 $0 (AT 23, 1948 ¥TFH T¥d)

(b) with further fine which may extend to
one thousand for each day during
which the offence continues after
conviction under clause (a); and

(i1) following new clause (c) shall be inserted,
as follows, namely:-

“(c)In cases where a subsequent offence of
the same nature has been committed a fine
which may extend to twenty thousand rupees
or simple imprisonment for a term which may
extend to two months or both,.”

2013

17

Use.

The Uttarakhand
Plastic And Other
Non-
Biodegradable
Garbage
(Regulation  Of
And
Disposal) Act,
2013

In section 10,-
for the words “ three months”, the words

“one month ” shall be substituted.

2016

18

The Uttarakhand,
Reforms,
Regularization,
Rehabilitation
Resettlement and
Prevention of
Encroachment of
the Slums located
in the Urban
Local Bodies of
the State Act,
2016

In section 5 for the words “six months”, the
words “three months” shall be substituted.

2019

07

The Uttarakhand
Public  Services
(Reservation  for
Economically
Wealker
Sections)Act,
2019

In section 5,-

(i)  insub-section (1), for the words, figures
and sign “be punishable with imprisonment
which may extend to 3 months or with fine
which may extend to 20000 or both;” the
words, figures and sign “be punishable with
fine which may extend to Rs. 40,000/ shall
be substituted; ) '
(ii) sub-section (2) shall be omitted,

(iii) sub-section (3) shall be omitted.




TIRIETS IR Tole, 13 e, 2026 30 (AT 23, 1948 AP | 13

2020

08

The Uttarakhand | Section 12 Shall be substituted as follows,
Organic namely:-

Agriculture
Department Act,

2019

3,4,5, 8 or 9 of this Act, shall be punishable
with a minimum fine of rupees fifty
thousand which may extend to rupees five
lakh and shall, in addition, be required to
call back the prohibited goods as specified
under sub-section (1) of section 3 and sold
by him in the area notified under sub-
section (2) of section 1 within thirty days
and to submit an affidavit to the Regulatory
Authority confirming compliance
therewith:

Provided that any person who defaults
in the payment of such fine shall be liable
to pay an additional amount of rupees one
thousand for every day during which such
default continues.”

2020

11

The Uttarakhand | In sub-section (1) of section 18,

Fruit Nurs.er_ie‘s“
(Regulation) Act,
2019

for the words, figures and sign “on first
conviction shall be punished with the
fine whick may extend to Rs.50,000/-
(Fifty thousand) and in default of
payment of fine with imprisonment
which may extend to six months and be
" punishéd on second or subsequent
conviction with imprisonment which
may extemd to six months and fine
which may extend to Rs. 50,000/- (Fifty
thousand).” the words, figures and sign
“om first conviction shall be punished
with a minimum fine of Rs. 1,00,000/-
(Orpe lakh) which may extend to Rs.
5,00,000/-(Five lakh) and in default of
payment of fine with a further fine of
Rs. 1,000/- (One thousand) per day until
the date of final payment and in cases of




14 SRIRTEUS TR Toie, 13 30ie, 2026 30 (A 23, 1948 ¥F )
a second or subsequent conviction, shall

be punished with a fine which may
extend upto Rs. 10,00,000/- (Ten lakk).”
shall be substituted;.

By Order,

| ARVIND KUMAR,
' Additional Secretary.



STUREUS IMERYT T6ie, 13 I, 2026 $0 (A 23, 1948 P w¥aq)

15

Statement of Objecis and Reasons

The proposed Act seeks to decriminalize minor offences under identified State
Acts by substituting criminal sanctions (especially imprisonment) with monetary
fines and administrative remedies. This reform aligns with Central Government
policies and the Jan Vishwas framework adopted at national level, which is to

promote Ease of Doing Business, reduce judicial burden, encourage investment,

and rationalise compliance mechanisms.

+ 2- To ensure decriminalization and rationalization of penalties by amending

certain Acts, to further strengthen trust-based governance and promote ease of

living and doing business.

3- The proposed Bill is the replacing Bill of the Uttarakhand Jan Vishwas

(Amendment of Provision) Ordinance, 2025 and fulfills the above said objectives.

Pushkar Singh Dhami
Chief Minister

dloTwoyo (3MR0%0) 06 /ﬁmnﬁ / 101—2026—100+500 afa (Fvgex /-afemat)



