P T&AT—23 TSHROT @IT—~UA/DO/DDN/30/2024-2026

TvBIY ToHS FTo/eTos
STNIEVS URGIR gIRT YBIRTG
STHTENT]
faamr aRR¥re
("TFT—L Lug (ai))

QENGH, AR, 07 e, 2026 To
Aq9 17, 1948 TP WA

SIRTEUS I
faurlt & wudg arf fawunr
=T 101 / XXXVI (3) /2026 /32(1) /2026
REIGH, 07 3, 2026

SIBEEET
fafaer

" MRS BT WU @ AT 200 & el HEERH ¥Sgue ¥ SaRrEvg R

. P hY 1e =
W ERT OIRG “EHE ARG wiew], saevs (FawE) o, 2026" ) Rems

06 30IT, 2026 B FTAR UaTH T AR a8 Seerravs @ IR e o2, ad 2026 &
« S
© H TR & ol 39 SRgEET BRT e Rear o 2



STRTETS 3NTERYT TG, 07 30id, 2026 S0 (A7 17, 1948 o1 )

are

M ARG ke, STRREve (WeeE) aiftifam, 2026
(Sovrerve sfdf e wea— 02, a9 2026)

§, 2024)

W ARG Wi, SRETE, 2024 (S
iy hY
PIKIR E9RE % & o,

TENEeS g Gegi-03 A

rferfrgy

o
Freoiea w0

N b
NG O & Oasaiy

T ARMINT B

qu‘(\ﬂ W"‘J

A
Y HERy

PO . ] o e T
99 " IANIETS OYUE—-asel ikl
() & RFEE @

era \ﬁvzm =7 15‘\“09 e

. oran
SRS (Aee) aifE, 2026 ©

(2) o5 grea vgw

.

e

ST
e wina @e
ClEFEs den

N . SEN
SRR ST,

0z,

o= awt o

SRS, 2024

. e eme |
o §) A TUS Wiepe @l 1073 |

Ty 1e74)” TS, i ©E RRE @

P S

NHEH,

oo B v
g Toe W QY

TIRG G |

§

l

|

|

YT Y i
XK !
|

weE, 3@ |

ORT 7 @ 3, e Wiew W O 7§, T () @ T0y w9,
ML . S— T e L e
S ©E "G <Mt T WE W T oY gEg ﬁ‘:.t\i
ACILY
TR |
HRT 10 & 4. | @ wiar § w0 §-
'rc"u:""-w-a'. —
Ri"w)ﬁﬁ‘:ﬁ 3N, - T N e £ 8 > 1 1
Gy o (o) 9 “OF% ORISR B ©E ) U@ 9
s ¥ (%Y Wi,
(3] e & Aw s i .
(i) SuTw (3) ¥, "UE WG Wl @ W W TP
o . .
T veE v Y S

TR BRI W TP W




STRIEYS MR TsTe, 07 3me, 2026 S0 (A% 17, 1948 vd wwaw) 3

(i) =era () % o A ol @ wA W T
o wE v R wiyy

! & VN o e oy
R 12 | T 6. e GIRT DI U 12 o SR () =1 ‘chr g @
STRT 13 W 7. U ST ¥ U 13 9 U (3) @ R F%_%
T o f&ar S, serg—-

G Su-iue. s () ¥ PR e

orRae oW ¥ fow w8 o 9w fow

o Y =i
Ras—{oeds o1 Row o sgom S @ 9
wEier ®U W e ® W %*,\nf?m SRR

;s ‘ NIRRT
gy FEuw PuiRe swarea ool e 8 o
o~ \

N . ., . N .
TET § GF GEieeuE © Wa Shifva 8 s |

Lyvyien b N —&

SRRl 17 @F 8. GG W U 17 B S (2) 3,

o o N e . . ! . N 5 ey

e Ui S O @ Tora O Yeaid BOR B9 % 9l
VRGO QL @ §vS B QIRGR BT SISl @ I W
ey —i P e o . ___{\' anma)
RO T Wiean 2023 (RFRM W, <5, Oy 2023) A

A= s, A 1 e AN
g wenEl & TR SR B Ui, ofp AR
¥ 2. SR L
AR CRETD RS \?a
- SNSRI 1. S [ -~ e e

R 99 W 9. | IO imen O R 19 ¥, WEe ¥ TS R § Wi 0
Py — 10 PEmCS v, —_—

E *u\“w e o ool T el SRR |

e T e T ey —""' “ = s T

A S 10, | 9@ QiEW # YN e ¥ oK HEioned R

e . RTINS TR

19T &I JimRnRg T & e, FIlg—
a — e N e SR . OE. S, . AT

IR “gR. TUINEES UK TWIRG IR @ 0eg eiie-

- S s i e o
(1) TS 99 t0 @ IWUT SU-Ew W WG SN
=0 - ('\ o
B T B, TR 9T O RO8 O Wk O WOR N
o o

AN e M TINGR B awe oiE BNV

T FHT |

() Swm (1) © g W TS onie, WG ARy @
Tt W @ wer, PR wee o AR F wwo @
Sy, SRTE 5 Wy wwa g iR ey smey
' (3) oriclin W, ¥ amw @ g, SiTRG 31

IO R B, S 95 R wue i |




STRTETS MR TI5Te, 07 3ntel, 2026 30 @ 17, 1948 o )

ST oy 4 e TOTRET AT =D —ras oF

YT 24, B it 7 WIET of U 24 9 suerr (1) 5

q:ﬂtg'ﬁh}‘g":ﬁ - . A . v &)
() @S (@) & " fre & oW W WS IR

{&en o, SRiig—

B e vEaTTETS oY
@) & ae & wwe Roe @ [ TP Won =

i ~ s .
v o ey aegites fdar ef

| O UETE O

e 25 12, | ¥@ aRtw 4 uxezs o ORI @) B BT () D
"-‘."w-‘.g-"'"‘ —_ YT 2 =
SRR e wlvenitn we Qe oneT, IR
« . Y i
(i) U Row @ S/ SFEYE @ YT 9O,
N N - ’
TETRYF, TR SIS wE AYE | 0w B W@

SEIT O 2 e oD e o N e aTem Al Sy e Y
4T 28 @ 13, o TR Pl 9T 26 § TR, ¥6 SN TFE SWR 2
S e AN S e =2 < P . W
SRISE @ TS (i) Sl (i) @ wE W ue, @ SR B W

gy - S e Ly o £ — N

T (2} UG OUNET (3) WRUTw o 19 W |
N Pt - 7 . e 4 O, - 5 £ . [N (.
IR 32 @ 14, TE AW W OO 82 W OmnN (1) e s
T WY A SR, SR

) N B e

(1) wig 1 @R W

X e SO G U N 1S W PR, 1, .

@) ITo® Ui @ T Wi ©, G & UR™ 8N 9

~S T VL NS

(i) o1 4 & €S (i) T SeEuw B% [ oww 8,
SHEl U o W ol g alasm, 2008

0o

- X S N N . i
(orifiFre wEm 6, UY 2007) W KOG TOSNIEG B

(i) o 4 & T (v) ¥ Sowem ¥ Ruw @ e
B E TE T WE TS D e e S
DR, T (B WG T RewRa B o wow 8 B




STRTEVS SMTERYT SE, 07 31d, 2026 S0 (A 17, 1948 W& waq)

/e I o . A e - N e B
(v) &7 20 @ Semew o Ruw Rufea o & 98 U

A R 11
o TP B BIGAT D GUS PE G g o anil

N O e
(v) (5d =ite o ko § 98 o1 30 % SWIRI

2

K% e . 0 .3 s e i
(2) o Pt el f amn & SEwT SmERE B B RN
¥ oY

N n,
SING TF SNiRT PYen 8 98 G 4

WO, §
- I —— —--~—1——->K~-—"T"’§=7‘3}7
Il & PRIGE W U org o5y G BT GAE R

—

(i) 9@ STg WM YCORS & S o

N PPN . S —
oo o ot ool wg oNal ©, O98 9K ©

BT N Gi0ST (pa oA SR S @ W W

B,

_— N 0\ L - .
(vii) e @ e orF) veum, Suiee Rl @

LU . S

A . AN Ay o PR » O
T U e SIEGR! [0 T, G SS9 9Y 9NdiY
——— S P A W

=
$ 92
-

[ e, 9 M N .. W |
GEarR UW SEAM 9 emeiy WiRa o ¥
RE W ToEeE wve (@), (@) wn &) @
N Mooy N — o N
ST WaTE N IRE ot R v Y Wi

16.

N SN NN
I 40 SR, sRia—-

TR ) S CON . ., L -
T ARl N, Move SR asaiEl o Yoy

K L L
gt FRiRa v ¥ oeenl Wy werw e o

\ ace
FETO—U5 Tl G | |

TRDIN

7.

| Fel o WY ST 385 Y-

@) s (1) 3 W v Tl @ W WK

(i) S (2) o @ e R s

(i) TR () ¥ U wEaE Ut @ W W

e v Wy Y one |




STRTETS TR Wle, 07 3, 2026 S0 (A7 17, 1948 ¥ )

-

P— " T o 7 U e—
TR 987 @ 18. T YR @ oTw 387 ¥ ST (3) & ¥
AT P— Moo
ST ferrieian soum eiwenfia o & o), srifg-

"(6) TR PIE @he 99, S99 U UIEES §N B

W @ TSAl BTN B] UETe OOy Rt e ©,

o~ o C o as
il I8 BINON Y, fraer oal g a9y 9% o e 8,

?:tlﬁﬁ ECL 23] WN“H \j “\]‘,"‘5%‘"\? @F “ﬂ \E—@r? GISH |

T S o . T WP

G) W BE & ww seo B wwE @) & Soww #

3 : 2 . S Y

TEGTh By ¥ GOl §, B O oY 0% © R W
- N e o o N
ST oo WO o o o o O < aEw

: =75 o v oS T w T
WK1 S ORI @ BE 9 U9

—_— N O N A, — D N
iV Simh B BT Bl Qs df eI DY IQdl Tl
(oY

P Y S e iy = = \ A
@) S PR SO Wl W 380 @ Suww () @

= b S N ¢ . O L &,
SoET U T ocuve o wEarel Hey ¥ wen ©

= == T TS WY TURINTTIOT - - i a at
WO TN U6 @ ONRE SR o g § il

mwn

TG TN TOE TR W Rl WO QR U o § 49

o,
ERS \fim“*ﬂ*w BIRETY, G & H§IW @ E’J‘\"b Nﬂ Em'»’-f S

BECIRS 'a

y S . E—
RO B, O SIvsti YT Off o |}

PR o S s faN ’
A Gy [ IS WinT W OSIW 300 @ UTEl e BT
¥ Le 5 TS —e o AFT=

390%@ T ety we < oo, e

390% W

S ¥ el N grerd
3905, GUImIYl MRS B 8 Wi

T"éaTw@". foE-Rwe, TEorl o=y S SaanoR 2 B
N,

s

v el Tole @y P o @ ?iﬁﬁ oI 12 B

sefa P ToRews @ an) S Sele @

FREIE
freer o o @ o Tar° <T5 GT SNIG® ?ff g
&1 G9! SIEET (ST R |

S50, WG Y e i

O SR @ ousdl o siova oy T @i A SR,
YU B geR o iR Sl g9 wieal @ &iclw'
e W e g AR vt B 3 AR G 79'

SO




STRTEUS 3NTERYT T9E, 07 3id, 2026 S0 (A7 17, 1948 o1 )

o LR Ry Do e . = omm woT—n I
T2 W 200 | u@ wa ¥ emEgEi-2 @ a1 o @9 We3
* ‘\....-_., _ .II y " "'— o g 31
REIEE g Py @ wE W Ceh /U’ s T Y
\Fih—gﬁ"‘fi
) v ""7’::1‘- 1 4 STETD SRS P o R »
v e 21. () v TRe W, SweErs (GRiEE) AR,
wIrgRa 2026 (GRAER o -0z, af 2026) wERr FRRE
o N
TRy GGt B
N s N U S
() T Fm % B BT W) Saa onureYl & SHE o
Co_NC £ s N '_5
TS PR I W ORAOS 59 SICINT B aeeEl SR
R - 8 e\ mera o
J @ JEMA Py AHHD SR |

TS 9,

3RfI< IR,

E=g

3R fuq|




STRTEYS 3MNMTERYT IWie, 07 30id, 2026 S0 (35 17, 1948 o1 )

AN ) \e ‘
Q&Y Uq @RV B e

SHE “””R\d) \L;%qg, GG Us, 2024 (33{{-}(:(&—;1 HE&ar 03, Eﬁ 202)

S B UER Wi fharaas § mw ey, R %ﬂmj—ﬂ q\\, AT G
e f[Alfw anavaaapl @ s e Y g © @O weuEl | -\L,—g)ﬁviﬁ’ vlf{m
S BG G ARe i, SeRrEve (GeE) oSy, 2026 TR G
AT 47 |

| K R 2, T SuRed 9gevl
TehTeR RASTE S ey @ uikwe [Yae §, TR SR 9%

02—
@I el BRAT B |

geT R arl
g&q H3T |



STRTEUS 3MMTERYT We, 07 3, 2026 $0 (@ 17, 1948 3@ ) 9

No. 101/XXXVI1(3)/2026/32(1)/2026
Dated Dehradun, April 07, 2026

NOTIFICATION

Miscellaneous

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English translation of “The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand

(Amendment) Act, 2026’ (Adhiniyam Sankhya 02, of 2026)

As passed by the Uttarakhand Legislative Assemble and assented to

by the Governor on 06 April, 2026.

THE UNIFORM CIVIL CODE, UTTARAKHAND (AMENDMENT)
ACT, 2026
[Uttarakhand Act No. 02 Year 2026]
AN
ACT

further to amend the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 (Act No. 03 of
2024),

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Uttarakhand in the Seventy-seventh
Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

‘Short title and 1. [ (1) This Act may be called the Uniform Civil Code,
commencement Uttarakhand (Amendment) Act, 2026.
(2) It shall come intc force at once.
Amendment in 2. | In the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 (hereinafter
Code referred to as the principal Code) for the words, figures| |
and signs “Criminal Procedure Code, 1973 (Act No 2 year P
1974)”, wherever they occur, the words, figures and signs
“Bharatiya Nagarik Suraksha Saphita, 2023 (Act No. 46 |

of 2023)” shall be substituted.




10

STRTETS 3NTERYT e, 07 3nld, 2026 S0 (@3 17, 1948 v Q)

Amendment of
sectiom 7

In section 7 of the principal Code, in the second proviso of
the sub-section (1), for the words “six months”, the words

“one year” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 10

In the principal Code, in section 10,-
(i) in sub-seciion (2), for the words “six months”, the

words “one year” shall be substituted;
(ii) in sub-section (3), for the words “six months”, the

words “one year” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 11

Amendment of

section 12

In the principal Code, in section 11,-

(i) in sub-section (3), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (4), for the words “six months”, the

words “one year” shall be substituied.

In sub-section (1) of ‘section 12 of the principal Code, for |
the word “Secretary”, the words «p dditional Secretary”

shall be substituted.

In the principal Code, sub-section (3) of Scctnom 13 shall
ely:—

“If the Sub-Registrar fails to take action within the time
period prescribed under sub-section (2), the maitiage,
divorce or declaration of nullity of marriage, as the case
may be, shall automatically get forwarded to the Registrar,
fails to take action within the
the

be substituted as follows, name

and if the Registrar
prescribed time purnod it shall get forwarded o
Regisirar general.”

Amendment of
section 17

In sub-section (2) of section 17 of the principal Code, for
the words “shall be punishable with imprisonment for 2
term which may exiend to three months, or with fine not
exceeding twenty-five thousand rupees, or with both”, the
words, figures and signs “shall be punishable according to
the provisions contained in the Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita,
2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023)” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 19

In section 19
word “punishment”,
substituied.

9 of the principal Code, in the heading, for the
the word “penalty” shall be

292




STRTETS 3MEROT T6(e, 07 e, 2026 S0 (A 17, 1948 ¥% @) 1

1

Insertion of new
section 19 A

E-J

10. -

Afer section 19 of the principal Code, following section

shall be in

“19A. Appea

Registiar-

(1) Where a penaliy has been imposed on a Sub-Registrar
under section 19, he may prefer an appeal within
thirty days before the competent appellate authority
as notified by the State Government.

(2) An appeal under sub-section (1) shall be presenied
along with certified copy of the order of penalty in
the prescribed form and manner, as determined by the
State Government.

serted, namely—

al ﬂ@ﬂﬁnnst penalty impeosed om Sub-

tT’"

(3) The appellate authority may, conﬁmz, modify or anaul
such order as it deems necessary.”

Amendment of
section 24

-In sub-section (1) of section 24 of the pzincipal Code,-

(i) in clause (d) for the sign “.” , the “; or” sign and word
shall be substituted;

(ii) after clause (d), the following clause shall be inserted

as iollows, namely:-

¢ one of the parties to

/n@f identity.”.

i the time of the marria
¢ had WMMGQE"FSwi d hi

“(e) that
the marriag

Amendment of
section 25

12.

In the principal Code, clause (i) of sub-section (3) of
section 25 shall be substituted as follows, namely-

“Gi) the husband has, since ihe
coniracting of the marriage, indulged in rape anal sex,
bestiality or necrophiliac sexual intercourse; or.”

solemnizaiion/

/

Amendment of
section 26

=
w

In section 26 of the principal Code after words, figures
and signs “clauses (i) and (ii) of sub-section (2)”, the
words, figures and signs “sub-section (2) and sub-section
(3)” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 32

i4.

In the principal Code, sub-section (1) of section 32 shall
be substituted as follows, namely—
“(1) Any person who-
(1) having a husband or wife is living, marriage another
person after the commencement of the Code in
contraveniion of clause (i) of ssction 4, shall be




12 STRTEYS 3R T9C, 07 30'd, 2026 $0 (A7 17, 1948 wd W)

(ii) coniracts a marriage in contravention of clause (iii)

punishable under the Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita,
2023 (Act No. 45 0£2023);

of section 4, such act shall be punishable under the
Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No.
6 of 2007);

(iii) procures a marriage in coniravention of clause (iv)
of section 4 shall be punishable with simple
imprisonment for a term which may extend to six
months and with fine not exceeding rupees fifty
thousand, and in default of fine, to undergo further
imprisonment for a term which may exiend fo one

month;

(iv) dissolves a marriage in coniravention of section 29
shall be punishable with imprisoniment for 2 term
which may extend to three years and shall also he
liable to fine;

(v) compels, abeis or induces a person to observe any
condition as is referred to in sub-section (2) of
section 30 before remarviage shall be publishable
with imprisonment for a term which may extend to
three years and shall also be liable to fine of rupees
one lakh, and in defauli of fine, to tmdergo further
imprisonment for a term which may exiend o six
months;

(vi) obtains the consent of a person for marriage by
force, coercion or fraud shall be punishable with
iraprisonment for a term which may exiend to
seven years and shall also be liable fo fine;

(vii) procured the consent for marriage thmuoh
misrepreseniation or concealment of facts 1hm
such act shall be punishable under ‘the Bharatiya
Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Act No. 45 of 2022).”.

Amendment of
section 43

15,

In section 43 of the principal Code, at the end of in sub-

section (1), for the words “the Court shall decrec such
relief accordingly.”, the words and sign “the Court shall
grant relief in accordance with clauses (2), (b) and (c).”
shall be substituied.

Amendment of
section 384

In the principal Code at the end of section 384, the
following words and sign shall be added, namely-




STRTETS THTERYT Iw(e, 07 3Md, 2026 0 @= 17, 1948 w® )

13

“In such cases, the regisirar shall issue a certificate
regarding termination of the live-in relationship to both
the partners, in a format prescribed by the State
Government.”.

©

Amendment of
section 385

In section 385 of the principal Code.-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words and sign "such
partner(s)”, the words "those partners" shall be
substituted;

(ii) sub-section (2) has been omitied;

(iii) in sub-section (3), for the words and sign "such
pariner(s)’, the words "those pariners” shall be
substituted.

Amendment of

section 387

In section 387 of the principal Code, after sub-section (3),
the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely-

“(4) Whoever obiains the consent of any person by
force, coercion or fraud to establish a live-in relationship
shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term which
may extend to seven years and shall also be liable to fine.
(5) Whoever stays in a live-in relationship in
contravention of sub-section (2) of section 380 shall be
punishable with imprisonment for a term which may
‘extend to seven years and shall also be liable to fine:

Provided that, nothing in this sub-section shall

apply to a person who has terminated the live-in
relationship or whose pariner has not been heard of for a
period of seven years or more.
(6) Any major person who lives in a live-in relationship
with minor in contravention of sub-section (3) of section
380 shall be punishable with simple imprisonment for a
term which may extend to six months and with fine which
may extend to fifty thousand rupees; and in default of
payment of such fine, with further imprisonment which
may extend to one month.”,

Tnsertion of new
sections 390A
and 3908

In the principal code after section 390 the following
sections shall be inserted, namely:—
“390A. Power to cancel regisiration-

The power to cancel any registration relating to
martiage, divorce, live-in relationship or succession shall
lie with the Registrar General appointed under Section 12.




14 STRTETS IMERYT TWIe, 07 3ld, 2026 Fo @7 17, 1948 T Q)

Before the cancelling such registration, the applicant shall
be given opportunity of being heard by the Registrar
General.

390B. Recovery of penalty-

Any penalty imposed under the provisions of this
Code shall be recovered like arrears of land revenue or in
such manner as may be specified by rules made under this
Code.”. ‘ J

Amendment of | 20. | In the principal Cods, in serial number 3 of Class-1 of
Schedule-2 Schedule-2, for the word “Widow”, the word “Spouse”

- shall be substituted.

Sﬁlﬁ;zﬂﬁ and 2L. | (1) The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment)
i Ordinance, 2026 (Ordinance No. 02 of 2026) is herehy

repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any
action taken under the said Ordinance shall deemed to
have been done or taken under the corresponding

provisions of this Act. |

By Order,

ARVIND KUMAR,
Additional Secretary.



STRTETS I/ERIT SIE, 07 30, 2026 0 (3 17, 1948 e wwaw) 15

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

- After the enforcement of the Uniform Civil Code, Uttaralkhand, 2024 (Act No. 03

01‘4024), for amending the certain provisions of the Code in light of the experience
l §amed during iis 1mp.1@mema’¢mn, suggesiions received from various staleholders, and
' cmeiging legal requirements the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment)
| Ordinance, 2026 was promulgated.

' 2~ The proposed Bill is the replacing Bill of said Ordinance and fulfills the aforesaid
objectives.

Pushkar Singh Di:ami
Chief Minister.

- HflogHogo (3Ro0) 05 / e / 93—2026—100+500 HfwaT (F¥=gex /Aforat)



