STRTETS IR Toie, 26 A4, 2025 0 (A7 05, 1947 ¥d WHd) 5

No. 127/XXXVI(3)/2025/16(01)/2024
Dated Dehradun, March 26, 2025

NOTIFICATION

Miscellaneous

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English translation of “The Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly
(Members’ Emoluments and ‘Pension) (Amendment) Act, 2025 (Act No. 04 of
2025).

As passed by the Uttarakhand Legislative Assembly and assented to
by the Governor on 21¥ March, 2025.

The Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly (Members’ Emoluments and
Pension) (Amendement) Act, 2025
(Uttarakhand Act No. 04 of 2025)
An
Act

further to amend the Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly (Members’ Emoluments
and Pension) Act, 2008,

It is hereby enacted by the Uttarakhand State Legislature in the Seventy-sixth year of the
. Republic of India as follows:-

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttarakhand State Legislative
Commencement Assembly (Members’ Emoluments and Pension) (Amendment)
Act, 2025,

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force from April 01, 2022.

Amendment of 2. In section 5 of the Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly
section 5 (Membelfs’ Emoluments and Pension) Act, 2008, (hereinafter rpferred
to as principal Act), -

(@) in sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:- j




6 STRIETS JMERT Toie, 26 ATd, 2025 30 (37 05, 1947 16 W)

“Provided that at the end of the year every member of
the Assembly shall be entitled to receive balance amount in
cash out of the amount of railway coupon amounting forty
thousand rupees after availing the railway coupon.”

(i) in sub-section (2),-

(a) for the words “three lac”, the words “three lac forty
thousand” shall be substituted.

(b) for the words “twenty two thousand five hundred
rupees per month”, the words “twenty six thousand
rupees per month” shall be substituted.

(c) for the words “tﬁirty thousand”, the words “twenty eight
thousand” shall be substituted.

(d) afier the second proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

shall.be entitled to receive balance amount in cash out of
the amount of railway coupon amounting twenty eight
thousand rupees after availing the railway coupon.”

Amendment of
section 15

For section 15 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted; namely-

“15. The State Government may provide for grant of a advance loan, )
not exceeding rupees twenty five lac at the applicable interest rate of
GPF, for any purpose, to any member whether or not he holds any
office referred to in clause (f) of section 2, or has held any office as |
member of House which includes Leader of Opposition:

Provided that the amount of advance loan shall be repaid in equal
monthly instalments of ten years.”

Amendment of

section 20

In section 20 of the principal Act-

(i) in sub section (15,' for the words “forty thousand rupees” the
words “sixty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(ii) in the first proviso, for the words “two thousand five hundred
rupees” the words “three thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of

section 11

In sub-section (2) of section 11 of the principal Act, for the words
“two thousand rupees” the words “four thousand five hundred
rupees” shall be substituted,

“Provided also that at the end of the year ex-member |

By Order,

DHANANJAY CHATURVEDI,

Principal Secretary.



r ITREYS IJMERY WE, 26 AIH, 2025 30 (AT 05, 1947 TP 6w 7

Statement of Objects and Reasons

The Ad hoc committee concerning the House, constituency,
service conditions etc., of Hon’ble members’of Uttarakhand Legislative
Assembly (2023-2024) (Fifth Legislative Assembly), in it’s first report,
has recommended to revise the pension, additional pension and other
facilities etc, of the Hon’ble members and ex-membegs of Uttarakhand
Legislative Assembly. To implement the recommendation of the
comumittee, it is proposed to amend “The Uttarakhand State Leglslatlve‘
; Assembly (Members’ Emoluments and Pension) Act, 2008”.

2-  The proposed Bill fulfills the ab_ovc. objective.

Prem Chand Aggarwal
Minister -

flowwogo (3mrogo) 05 fA=mdY / 102—2025—100+500 wferai (e /afomat) |




