No. 327/XXXVI(3)/2024/16(1)/2024
_Dehradun D_ated, October 23, 2024

NOTIFICATION

Miscellaneous

In pursuance of the provision of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English translation of “The Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly
Miscellaneous (Amendment) Act, 2024’ (Uttarakhand Act No. 16 of 2024).

As passed by the Uttarakhand Legislative Assembly and assented to
by the Governor on 21" October, 2024

The Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly Miscellaneous
(Amendment) Act, 2024

(Uttarakhand Act No. 16 of 2024)
An
Act

further to amend the Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly (Members’
Emoluments and Pension) Act, 2008, the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officer’
Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1952 (as applicable in Uttarakhand State) and the
Uttarakhand Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 2009

It is hereby enacted by the Uttarakhand State Legislature in the Seventy-fifth year
of the Republic of India as follows:-

— -
(3 scanned with OKEN Scanner



TEEvE SEURT THE, 23 AACAY, 2024 30 (@IAT 01, 1946 WP wad)

Amendment of
section 20

10.

In section 20 of the principal Act, in the fitst proviso,
for the words “two thousand” the words “two
thousand five hundred” shall be substituted:

The Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers’
Salafies and Allowances) Act, 1952 (as applicable
in Uttarakhand State)

Amend ment of
section 2

e p—

11.

Tn sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Uttar Pradesh

State Legislature (Officers’ Salaries and Allowances)
Act, 1952, in the context of Uttarakhand State, in the
monthly salary of Speaker and Deputy Speaker, for the
words “one lac ten thousand” the words “one lac

fifty thousand” shall be substituted.

o

The Uttarakhand Ministers (Salaries, Allowances
and Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 2009

Amendment of
section 2

12.

In sub-section (1) of section 3 of the Uttarakhand
Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Miscellaneous
Provisions) Act, 2009, for the words “ninety
thousand” the words “ome lac twenty thousand”
shall be substituted.

By Order,

DHANANJAY CHATURVEDI,
Principal Secrefary.

(3 scanned with OKEN Scanner



