Uoliea |&a1—40v0 / S10U-0—30 / 03

LSS (ens¥=a € ulte Rgee M=)

é%?lq\?r JeWfddarR, 04 |, 2006 5‘0
: ém@r 14, 1928 b GH

SR NEGRILE
faerdY vd gada & faarr
e 734/ﬁaTd’r Ud I9ard B /2006
IEIGH, 04 |, 2006

gl Sl
iR

“HIRd 1 Giaa” ar:ﬁéazooa%amnmmmm#mﬁaﬁwm
iR SeRiEd (R wa1 e, 4B aur afteRal & Syaferar ik de) (em |weE)
fagraa, 2006 4R fTa 22 ante, 2006 B FTART U Y AN 9T IS BT AR wEAT
09, T 2006 & ®Y ¥ wdwrERyr @ oAl $W ARREAT g™ UG fHar Smar © |

saxigd (fam war wewl, w6 qor afteiar a1

Syaferdi sk dem) (W wwer) s, 2006

(arferfraw T o9, a9 2006)

IR WY U9 [EE qved (el @ Syafen v v sfefrm,
1980 X SR USW ISy UM Jved (@RERET & da7 a=n #«) afufam,
1952 (STRiaa ¥ T Ugwy BT JUTR WAET HH & forg—

e
ARG TR & gdrgqd a8 § 48 freaq su A afufrafia s




P

IORTIA AR o€, 04 73, 2006 30 (1@ 14, 1928 WP HHad)
AT TH '
- URFHS
wiftra 1—(1) 39 afifram &1 wira - SoRigd (e @ g<at, what

I oy RrBIRAT B Suwfera R Yer) (e waer) aififran, 2008 1

(2) 9 2005 & -Tawx @ ¥ fas @) yga g, fiae @vs 4 & aun
GUS 8 B, Wl HAW: G 2005 B A B W A GUT € 2006 B HS b U
. f&m &1 uga sl

I

IR Yoy eg QT wved (Wewl @) Suafear aﬁ?ﬁ?ﬁ)
Fiftrf=m, 1980 &1 WeEH

ST IR 2-TTR Yo ey e qued (Wewl @t syafat R dvE) Ay,

i Sl 1900 R Tw JeAT ¥ AT Y@ affEE s T 2, wes wfud ot A

i:mj:;:;;fsrms’f Rras a=aifa | i 2, 3 ™ W s W/ e et
g fag ST

1RT 4 BT 3—7a IfRFE @) R 4 ¥ e W E9R Wi 6 3T @ e

e W R TRE TUR TR @ fad Wy

€T 5 BT 4o Iffam 9 g1 5 4-

Yo (ai)qqm@)ﬁwftﬂrﬁamma}mma%waﬁ
gl S g 2g- 91 A R AN TR 0 @
e T B WA W AR TS A W 9N vUd B Jad
HUT B GXEX B G Soid Y o a9 19 g9y de
TR ¥ @ Yod U @ A T

(@) suErRT (2) ¥ e 9 R W @ WM W) s O g9
3" g 3 oEH |

ST 13 B 5—q§rsuﬁrﬁmaﬁamw$mwﬁﬂﬁ-rﬁqﬁﬂmwﬂmﬁ1ﬁ
HeEA Ferfe

13(1)mwmagmﬁaqﬁmﬁ1maﬁwﬁ,ﬁw$

F=aiia Fraafad a1 a9 H 2, ITRidd uRaed FE @1 99 N

aoasd wg T fafr & sefm 7 3l &% &1 guard fey f&=m fed @ a9a
aEn oy @ for fafta dfv @ fFyges ausay a9 79 @1 gHar &N,

(2) SuERT (1) ¥ Fiffe ger o1 ST 9w gRT 99 ¥ I Y U x
Tgadf & o oM @ fau A fear o g 2;

(3) vAs «afdw, & I A6 B IFEMT U9 FT §HIR 8, SANITA
TRags i 9) 99 g1 aoasd Ag fadl fafr @ = <3 I &) &1

qgarE feg e fef A ww o= s 3 fag fafes Ofv /@ Frges
Fapaofa 99 g &1 A ghaAR BT

= ¥e & afe suumr (3) ¥ ffdx afew o amagafaa a1 S
g9 § g3 oAl & a9 fevd @) aftre gaf¥ &1 989 Wy eeAr g

(4) SuuaRT (3) ¥ fffe e &1 Sualy W @fya gRT 99 ¥ 39 W™y
ve Head! o o o @ fav ff fear s g@ar 21




panacs o s sl e s s i o

Y

JOTad AUERY TWE, 04 WL, 2006 30 (FITA 14, 1928 UH THT) 3
6—¥el AT B &RT 15 B SgERT (1) F U= “d | TR a%wm' gRT 15 BT

w® v T W ew v fad e e
79 ARFRH B gRT 15—F A ek "I TAR UiF Wl ¥R D WM uw 15—
T e B BOIR v9d <@ el oA ; a1 waes
a—q;aaﬁﬁuﬂaﬁﬂmmaﬁm(z)ﬁwﬂwﬁﬁﬁﬁaam 1T 16 B
g & WAy, aerfq IUETT (2)
&1 e

(z)mmﬁwﬁmmaﬁwaaﬁmamag
&7 @t TuA aftrre sEre W U BT §®eR B9 SR 30 I, 2006 b
ATt Aae fevan w1 B aqel 98 @1 Wi

9—7el AP P oRT 18—F & @'S (F) § ¥ "<l E9IR BUA” & OW 18D
RF R & % goR Ui v@ fad s BT wHte

10—9a At 9 ary 24 94— aRT 24 BT

@) SueRT (1) § w= S FOR T a%"\nen-rrq?m‘q’ i BOIR
v v o e

(a)nmw#m'ﬁmﬁmm“aﬁwﬁmm'?ﬁ#ﬁ
a3 @ fad e

11— afifram &) g 28 9 SwERT (1-®) @ I ¥ FEfafed awres @
e @ R o, deta— wae

Wﬁﬁ%uﬁﬂﬁmﬁaﬁmﬁéwﬁmmwﬁ
ﬁﬁﬁgmwmaﬁmﬁrmammw#ﬁaﬁﬁmﬁm

El, maﬂaﬁmﬁﬁwﬁmiﬁﬁmﬁaﬂml

I oA

wmmﬁmmﬁ@rﬁmﬁma}quﬁ)
s, 1952 &1 GHE

12-TTR Y ST R Avee (@ReRET @ a9 qem ) affm,
1952 1 ©RT 4 P! SUERT (3) H U=z *qmz:ﬁfr\rmfr @ W W UK TH BN

v v Ry ST

arsT W,
Sy sfexr ey,
gfaa |

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constltunon of India, the

_ Governor is pleased to order the publication of The Uttaranchal (Emoluments and Pension of the State

Assembly Members, Ministers and Officers) (First Amendment) Act, 2006 (Uttaranchal Adhiniyam
Sankhya 09 of 2006).

No. 734/Vidhayee and Sarnisadiya Karya/2006
Dated Dehradun, May 04, 2006

NOTIFICATION
Miscellaneous

As Passed by the Uttaranchal Legislative Assembly and assented to by the
Governor on April 22, 2006.



SORiad MR TuiE, 04 WS, 2006 S0 (FUTE 14, 1928 D W)

Short title
and
Commencement

General
Amendments in
“U.P.ActNo. 23
of 1980

Amendment of
section 4

Amendment of
section 5

Amendment of
section 13

THE UTTARANCHAL (Emoluments and Pension of the State Assembly Mem-
bers, Ministers and Officers) (First Amendment) Act, 2006

( UttarancHAL AcT No. 09 oF 2006)

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members, Emolu-
ments and Pension) Act, 1980 and the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers
and Allowances) Act, 1952 (as applicable to Uttaranchal) :

AN

Act :
Be it enacted by the State Assembly in the Fifty-seventh year of the Republic of
India as follows:-- .

Chapter |

Preliminary

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttaranchal (Emoluments and Pension of
the State Assembly Members, Ministers and (_)ﬂ‘icers) (First Amendment) Act, 2006.

(2) It shall come into force on the 1st day of November, 20,0'5 except section 4
and 8, which shall come into force on the 1st day of June, 2005 and 1st day of May,
2006 respectively. - :

Chapter i

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members, Emoluments
and Pension) Act, 1980

2. In the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members Emoluments and Pen-
sion) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to in this chapter as the principal Act, for the
word “Secretary” wherever occurring including definitions the words, “Secretary/
Principal Secretary" shall be substituted.

3. In'section 4 of the principal Act; for the words “Seven thousand five
hundred Rupees” the words “Fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

4. In section 5 of the principal Act--

(a) In sub-section (1) for the words “Expenses of diesel equivalent to that

- amount of Raitway Coupon for Ninety six thousand rupees and the balance

Twenty four thousand rupees as Railway Coupon,” the words “Expenses

of diesel equivalent to the amount of the Railway coupon for One lac

twenty thousand rupees and the balance Thirty thousand rupees as
Railway Coupon” shall be substituted.

(b) In sub-section (2) for the words “Twenty thousand rupees” the words
“Thirty thousand” shall be substituted.

5. For section 13 of the principal Act, the following section shali be
substituted, namely--

“13.(1) Every member shall be entitled in the manner préscribed with a free
non-transferable pass to travel at any place by the Uttaranchal Transport Corpora-
tion bust including air conditioned or deluxe bus without payment of the passenger
tax due under any law for the time being in force; -

(2) the facility referred to in sub-section (1) may also be availed by a
member for taking one companion along with in the bus. :

(3) Every person who is entitled to pension under chapter Vlli shall be en-
titled in the manner prescribed with a free non-transferable pass to travel at any
place by the Uttaranchal Transport Corporation bus without payment of the passenger
tax due under any law for the time being in force;



FaNiae TR SIS, 04 HY, 2006 30 (S9TE 14, 1928 UdH WHQ)

(4) the pass referred to in sub-section (3) may also be used by such person
for taking one companion along with him in the bus :

Provided that if a person referred to in sub-section (3) travels in air
conditioned bus or a deluxe bus, he shall pay himself the excess amount of fare
difference.

6. In section 15 of the principal Act, in sub section (1) for the words “Three
hundred rupees” the words “Five hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

7. In section 15-A of the principal Act, for the words “Two thousand five
hundred rupees” the words “Six thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

8. For sub-section (2) of section 16 of the principal Act, the following sub-
section shall be substituted; namely--

(2) Where a member has not been provided with any accommodation, he
shall be entitled to an accommodation allowance at the rate of Three hundred rupees
per month and paid house rent allowance upto April 30 2006 shall not be recovered.”

9. In section 18-A of the principal Act, in clause (A) for the words “Two thousand
rupees” the words “Six thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

10. In section 24 of the principal Act--

(a) In sub-section (1) for the words “Two thousand rupees” the words” Three
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(b) In the proviso for the words “Two hundred fifty rupees” the words “Three
hundred rupees”shall be substituted.

11. In section 23 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1-A) the following
proviso shall be inserted at the end, namely--

“Provided that if any other Government dues are reported against such person
whether it is for the period of the membership or for the period he is not to a member
shall also be deducted from the pension of such person.”

Chapter--lli

Amendment of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries
and Allowances) Act, 1952

12. In section 4 of the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Officers Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1952, in sub-section (3) for the words “Five thousand rupees” the
- words “Ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 15

Amendment of
section 15-A

Amendment of
sub-section (2)
of section 16

Amendment of
18--A

Amendment of
section 24

By Order,

Smt. INDIRA ASHISH,
Secretary.

fogwogo (aroz0) 10 furdl /240—-2006—100+500 (HFPIEX /afsmn) |




