STRIEYS ITHERY AGC, 02 AR, 2016 30 (MT90T 11, 1938 I ) 5

No. 239/XXXV1(3)/2016/44(1)/2016
Dated Dehradun, August 02, 2016

NOTIFICATION

Miscellaneous

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English translation of ‘the Uttarakhand (The Uttarpradesh Nagar
Nigam Adhiniyam, 1959) (Amendment) Bill, 2016’ (Adhiniyam Sankhya 16 of
2016).

As Passed by the Uttarakhand Legislative Assembly and assented to
by the Governor on 28 July, 2016. .

THE UTTARAKHAND (THE UTTAR PRADESH NAGAR NIGAM
ADHINIVYAM, 1959) (AMENDMEND) ACT, 2016

(Uttarakhand Act no. 16 of 2016)

[It is here by enacted in the sixty seventh year of the Republic of India as follows]

To further amend The Uttar Pradesh Nagar Nigam Adhiniyam,1959 ( Adaptation And
Modification Order2007)

An

Act

Juorttige. 1. - (1) This bill may be called the The Uttarakhand (The

Uttar Pradesh Nagar Nigam Adhiniyam,1959)
(Amendment) bill, 2016. :
(2) It shall come into force at once.

E::‘:’:;:mm i 2. In The Uttarakhand (The Uttar Pradesh Nagar Nigam
Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam,1959) hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act, where: :
lAgcgg No. II of ever the expression “ Mukhya Nagar Adhikari”, “Apar Mukhya |

Nagar Adhikari”, “Upa Nagar Adikari”, “Sahayak Nagar Adhikari”, |
“ Nagar Pramukh”. “ Up Nagar Pramukh”, Sabhasad and Sabasads,
oceur it shall be read as “Municipal Commissioner”, “Municipal
Commissioner”,* Additional Municipal Commissioner”, “Deputy
Municipal Commissioner” “Assistant Municipal
Commissioner”, “Mayor”. “ Deputy Mayor”, “ Corporator” and
‘Corporators.” B




6 STRTETS IMERT IAGIC, 02 AT, 2016 S0 (M99 11, 1938 IF )

g::;g:T;:t in 3. In Section 174, in sub-section(1)-

: (a) In clause (a) of the Principal Act the following
clause shall be substituted namely-
(A)“In case of railway stations, colleges, schools,
hotels, factories, commercial buildings and other
non-residential buildings, twelve times the values
arrived at on multiplying with multiplier to be fixed
by riles in the monthly rate of rent per square foot of
residential buildings fixed under clause (b) with the
covered area of the building or open area of the land
or both, as the case may be” :

(b) In clause (b) of the Principal Act, for the words
“two years”, the word “ Four years” -shall be
substituted.
'S\'“e_“dme"t in 4.1In Section 177, in clause (b) of the Principal Act, the following clause
ection 177 : .
shall be substituted namely. AN g
177 *(b).buildings and lands or portions thereof solely occupied and
used for public worship.”

g:;fi‘:";g;" of 3. In Section 207 of the Principal Act the following section shall be
: substituted, namely- :
“207. Preparation of assessment list- The Municipal
Commissioner shall cause area wise rental rates
and an assessment list in the city or part thereof
to be prepared from time to time, in accordance
with the manner prescribed in the rules”.

Amendment in 6. In section 207-(A) of the Prinicpal Act, the word “residential”® shall
Section 207-(A) be omitted : :

‘::“f”“""&cﬁo": 7. After Section 207(A) of the Principal Act, the following new Section
2078 207(B) shall be added.namely- ;
“207(B) Submission of the details of houses or lands
- for assessment of tax.-
(i) For the purposes of annual rental value, the owner
or the occupier of every house or land shall submit
a property return upto a date as may be prescribed.
(ii) Any person failing to submit the return to in Sub-
section (1) without proper reasons shall be liable
to pay penalty as may be prescribed.
(iif) The penalty reffered to in Sub-section (2) may be
compounded by the Mugﬁcipal Commissioner.”

g::;jg;“z%‘;“ of 8. In Section 208 of the Principal Act the following section shall be

substituted namely-
“208.Publication  of list-  The Municipal
Commissioner shall publish the list prepared



STRIETS JWIERYT ToIe, 02 I, 2016 F0 (1997 11, 1938 1S ) 7

under section 207 in accordance with the manner
prescribed in the rules.”

Substitution of 9. In Section 209 of the Principal Act the following section shall be

Section 209 .
substituted namely-

“209.0bjections on proposed rates and list.- The

Municipal Commissioner or an officer

authorised by him in this behalf shall dispose off

the objections in accordance with the manners

. prescribed in the rules”.

ge':‘&ggfgfgf in 10. In Section 210, for sub-section (1) of the Principal Act the following
section shall be substituted, namely-

“ 210(1).The Municipal Commissioner or an officer
authorised by him in this behalf, shall
authenticate by his signature the area wise renta]
rates and the assessment list of the city or any

part thereof, as the case may be.”

gx;gg’;;;“ fn 11. In Section 211 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the
~ words “two years” the words * four years” shall be substituted. .

g;';g:';;;‘ in 12. In Section 213 of the Principal Act-

(a) In sub-section (1), for the words “Executive
Committee or its any sub-committee appointed in
this behalf » the words “The Municipal
Commissioner or an officer authorised by him in
this behalf ” shall be substituted. :

(b) In sub-section (1), in the proviso, for the words
“Executive Committee or sub-committee” the
words “The Municipal Commissioner or an officer
authorised by him in this- behalf ” shall be
substituted.

g:;f:;“;;‘;“ o 13. In Section 214 of the Principal Act the following section shall be
substituted namely-

“214. Obligation to supply information for purpose

of amendment-

(I) When any building is constructed or reconstructed
or any addition is made thereto by an owner or
occupier and the covered area exceeds. by more
than 25 per cent then it shall be compulsory for him
to submit its information- to the Municipal
Commissioner within sixty days of the date of
completion or date of occupation whichever is
earlier, in the prescribed form.

(2) The owners or occupiers, who do not submit
information referred to in Sub-section (1) without




STNIEUS JHMERY e, 02 3R, 2016 30 (ATE0T 11, 1938 IH WH)

Amendment in
Section 221-B

Amendment in
Section 222

Amendment in
Section 550

proper reasons, shall be liable to be punished with
fine which may extend to an amount equal to
double of the assessed general tax or Rs. 500.00 per
day of the delay whichever is less.

(3) The Municipal Commissioner may compound the
proposed penalty under Sub-section (2).”

14. In Section 221(B) of the Principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the
words “one thousand” the words. “five thousand” shall be
substituted.

15. In Section 222 of the Principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the
figure “500” the figure “5000” shall be substituted.

16. In Section 550 of the Principal Act- :
(a) In clause (a) for the words “five hundred” the
words “five thousand” shall be substituted.
(b) In clause (a) for the word “twenty” the words
“two hundred” shall be substituted.
(c) In clause (b) for the word “twenty” the words “
two hundred” shall be substituted

By Order,

R. C. KHULBE,
Principal Secretary.

-)



STRIEUS JWMERYT IE, 02 I, 2016 0 (S199 11, 1938 & THaw) 09

VG Y AR BRYN &HT HH

gt o0 SwR YRW ¥ AN SR Hadl W e} PR 8 SwR
yey TR e afifem 1959 ([TEvE www # g waw) # wONE wfd
[EIR IR

2— WWId §ovE @ B89 ¥ SaNgUs oY 9l Wy TR et #
. IFERIe HEEl R WeR FERT SR @ uwEn g d ge 8rh, Wi w@rd

UAT ARG HIT PR WO Ieplord B GBI g I ST B & o) IRT anf
e B iR ureEt @ qedT g R ot F wfde Ye § s gfy @R
P PRU Ghd YT & AR UX 3eplord IFEIS HaT FX SIE 8 X&T o, ST
aREAl # W SR B SR T W 91 SERG Ha R @Y Ao
mmamwwwmw@m@wﬁuwﬁmaﬁmﬁ

gfg 8rft|
3~ Ow [Uys Swed sgewt & il dear &

faw g Tar
HAT |

HoTHoYo (3TR0%0) 18 faurdl / 410—2016—100+500 (Fregex /Afvmat) |




