
Central Regulation 2013 to 2015 

  

2013 

NIL 

 

2014 

NIL 

 

2015 

1. The Dadra and Nagar Haveli Value Added Tax (Amendment) Regulation, 
2015. 

2. The Daman and Diu Value Added Tax (Amendment) Regulation, 2015. 



jftLVªh lañ Mhñ ,yñ—(,u)04@0007@2003—15

vlk/kkj.k
EXTRAORDINARY

Hkkx  II — [k.M 1
PART II — Section 1

izkf/kdkj ls izdkf'kr
PUBLISHED  BY  AUTHORITY

lañ 33] ubZ fnYyh] eaxyokj] flrEcj 15] 2015@ Hkknz 24] 1937 ¼'kd½
No. 33]  NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 15, 2015/BHADRA 24, 1937 (SAKA)

bl Hkkx esa fHkUu i`"B la[;k nh tkrh gS ftlls fd ;g vyx ladyu ds :i esa j[kk tk ldsA
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—15

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 15th September, 2015/Bhadra 24, 1937 (Saka)

THE  DADRA  AND  NAGAR  HAVELI  VALUE  ADDED  TAX
(AMENDMENT)  REGULATION, 2015

NO. 1 OF 2015

Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India.

A Regulation to amend the Dadra and Nagar Haveli Value Added Tax Regulation,
2005.

In exercise of the powers conferred by article 240 of the Constitution, the President is
pleased to promulgate the following Regulation made by him:—

1. (1) This Regulation may be called the Dadra and Nagar Haveli Value Added Tax
(Amendment) Regulation, 2015.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Administrator may, by notification in the
Official Gazette, appoint.

Short title
and
commencement.



2. In the Dadra and Nagar Haveli Value Added Tax Regulation, 2005, in section 4,
in sub-section (1), in clause (b), for the words “four per cent.”, the words “five per
cent.” shall be substituted.

PRANAB MUKHERJEE,
President.

————

DR. SANJAY SINGH,
Secy. to the Government of India.

2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. I]

Amendment
of section 4.

Reg. 2 of
2005.

GMGIPMRND—2496GI(S3)—15-09-2015.

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD,  NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF  PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2015.



THE DAMAN AND DIU VALUE ADDED TAX (AMENDMENT)
REGULATION, 2015

NO. 2 OF 2015

Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India.

A Regulation to amend the Daman and Diu Value Added Tax Regulation, 2005.

In exercise of the powers conferred by article 240 of the Constitution, the President is
pleased to promulgate the following Regulation made by him:—

1. (1) This Regulation may be called the Daman and Diu Value Added Tax (Amendment)
Regulation, 2015.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Administrator may, by notification in the
Official Gazette, appoint.

2.  In the Daman and Diu Value Added Tax Regulation, 2005  (hereinafter referred to as
the principal Regulation), in section 4, in sub-section (1), in clause (b), for the words “four
per cent.”, the words “five per cent.” shall be substituted.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
of section 4.

Reg. 1 of  2005.

jftLVªh lañ Mhñ ,yñ—(,u)04@0007@2003—15

vlk/kkj.k
EXTRAORDINARY

Hkkx  II — [k.M 1
PART II — Section 1

izkf/kdkj ls izdkf'kr
PUBLISHED  BY  AUTHORITY

lañ 38] ubZ fnYyh] xq#okj] fnlEcj 10] 2015@vxzgk;.k 19] 1937 ¼'kd½
No. 38] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, DECEMBER 10, 2015/AGRAHAYANA 19, 1937 (SAKA)

bl Hkkx esa fHkUu i`"B la[;k nh tkrh gS ftlls fd ;g vyx ladyu ds :i esa j[kk tk ldsA
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—15

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

————

New Delhi, the 10th December, 2015/Agrahayana 19, 1937 (Saka)



3. In the principal Regulation, in the Third Schedule, in the heading, for the words “four
per cent.”, the words “five per cent.” shall be substituted.

PRANAB  MUKHERJEE,
President.

————

DR. G. NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

Amendment of
Third Schedule.

GMGIPMRND—3547GI—11-12-2015.

2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ PART II— SEC. 1]




