ORDINANCES, 2016

The Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016.

The Uttarakhand Appropriation (Vote on Account) Ordinance, 2016.

The Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Second Ordinance, 2016.

The Indian Medical Council (Amendment) Ordinance, 2016

The Dentists (Amendment) Ordinance, 2016.

The Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016.

The Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016.

The Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016 (8 of 2016)
The Payment of Wages (Amendment) Ordinance, 2016 (9 of 2016)

10 The Specified Bank Notes (Cessation of Liabilities) Ordinance, 2016

CoNO RN E



W9 T o Te—(TH)04/0007/2003—16  REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

The Gaigt.'e of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY
W [ —E'E 1
PART II — Section 1
TiueR | Thifv@
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

& 9] ¢ fieell, qefmER, sFad 7, 2016/99 17, 1937 (IF)
No.9]  NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, JANUARY 7,2016/PAUSHA 17, 1937 (SAKA)

T A H R TS wen @ St @ Fed i 98 o dher @ S H T s wwh |

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)
New Delhi, the Tth January, 2016/Pausha 17, 1937 (Saka)

THE ENEMY PROPERTY (AMENDMENT AND VALIDATION)
ORDINANCE, 2016

No. 1 or 2016

Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-sixth Year of the
Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Enemy Property Act,
1968 and the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised
Occupants) Act, 1971.

WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the President is
satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for
him to take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause
(1) of article 123 of the Constitution, the Premdent is pleased to
promulgate the following Ordinance:—

1. () ThlS Ordinance may be called the Enemy Property Short title and
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016. commencement.

(2) It shall come into force at once.



THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PART II—

Amendment
of section 2.

2. On and from the date of commencement of the Enemy
Property Act, 1968 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),
in section 2,~

(i) in clause (b),—

(/) for the words “an enemy subject”, the words “an
enemy subject including his legal heir and successor
whether or not a citizen of India or the citizen of a
country which is not an enemy or the enemy, enemy
subject or his legal heir and successor who has changed
his nationality” shall be substituted and shall always be
deemed to have been substituted;

(ID) for the words “an enemy firm”, the words “an
enemy firm, including its succeeding firm whether or not
partners or members of such succeeding firm are citizen
of India or the citizen of a country which is not an enemy
or such firm which has changed its nationality” shall be
substituted and shall always be deemed to have been
substituted; ’

(II) for the words “does not include a citizen of
India”, the words “does not include a citizen of India
other'than those citizens of India, being the legal heir and
successor of the “enemy” or “enemy subject” or “enemy
firm” * shall be substituted and shall always be deemed
to have been substituted;

(IV) the following Explanations shall be inserted
and shall always be deemed to have been inserted at the
end, namely:—

‘Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this
clause, the expression “does not include a citizen of
India” shall exclude and shall always be deemed to
have been excluded those citizens of India, who are
or have been the legal heir and successor of an
“enemy” or an “enemy subject” or an “enemy firm”
which or who has ceased to be an enemy due to
death, extinction, winding up of business or change
of nationality or that the legal heir and successor is a
citizen of India or the citizen of a country which is
not an enemy.

Explanation 2.—For the purposes of this
clause, it is hereby clarified that nothing contained
in this Act shall affect any right of the legal heir

34 of 1968.



Sec. 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

and successor referred to in this clause (not being
inconsistent to the provisions of this Act) which
have been conferred upon him under any law for
the time being in force.’;

(#0) in clause (c), in the proviso,—

(J) after the words “dies in the territories to which
this Act extends”, the words “or dies in any territory
outside: India” shall be inserted and shall always be
deemed to have been inserted;

(II) the following Explanations shall be inserted
and shall always be deemed to have been inserted at
the end, namely:—

‘Explanation 1.— For the purposes of this clause, it is
hereby clarified that “enemy property” shall,
notwithstanding that the enemy or the enemy subject or
the enemy firm has ceased to be an enemy due to death,
extinction, winding up of .business or change of
nationality or that the legal heir and successor is a citizen
of India or the citizen of a country which is not an enemy,
continue and always be deemed to be continued as an
enemy property.

Explanation 2.— For the purposes of this clause, the
expression “enemy property” shall mean and include and
shall be deemed to have always meant and included all
rights, titles and interest in, or any benefit arising out of,
such property.’.

3. On and from the date of conimencement of the principal

Act, in section 5, after sub-section (2), the following shall be
inserted, and shall always be deemed to have been inserted,
namely:—

‘(3) The enemy property vested in the Custodian shall,

notwithstanding that the enemy or the enemy subject or the
enemy firm has ceased to be an enemy due to death,
extinction, winding up of business or change of nationality or
that the legal heir and successor is a citizen of India or the
citizen of a country which is not an enemy, continue to
remain, save as otherwise provided in this Act, vested in the
Custodian.

Explanation—For the purposes of this sub-section,

“enemy property vested in the Custodian” shall include and
always deemed to have been included all rights, titles, and

Amendment of
section 5.



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART I—

Insertion of
new section
5A.

Issue of
certificate by
Custodian.

Insertion of
new section
5B.

Law of
succession
or any
custom or
usage not to
apply to
enemy

property.

Amendment
of section 6.

Prohibition
to transfer
any property
vested in
Custodian
by an
enemy,
enemy
subject or
enemy firm.

interest in, or any benefit arising out of, such property vested in
him under this Act.’.

4. After section 5 of the principal Act, the following section
shall be inserted, namely:—

“SA. The Custodian may, after making such inquiry as he
deems necessary, by order, declare that the property of the
enemy or the enemy subject or the enemy firm described in
the order, vests in him under this Act and issue a certificate
to this effect and such certificate shall be the evidence of the
facts stated therein.”.

5. On and from the date of commencement of the principal
Act, after section 5A (as so inserted by section 4 of this
Ordinance), the following shall be inserted and shall always be
deemed to have been inserted, namely:—

‘SB. Nothing contained in any law for the time being in
force relating to succession or any custom or usage governing
succession of property shall apply in relation to the enemy
property under this Act and no person (including his legal heir
and successor) shall have any right and shall be deemed not to
have any right (including all rights, titles and interests or any
benefit arising out of such property) in relation to such enemy

property.

Explanation—For the purposes of this section, the
expressions "custom" and "usage" signify any rule which, having
been continuously and uniformly observed for a long time, has
obtained the force of law in the matters of succession of
property.’.

6. On and from the date of commencement of the principal
Act, for section 6 of the principal Act, the following section shall
be substituted and shall always be deemed to have been
substituted, namely:—

“6. (1) No enemy or enemy subject or enemy firm shall
have any right and shall never be deemed to have any right to
transfer any property vested in the Custodian under this Act,
whether before or after the commencement of this Act and
any transfer of such property shall be void and shall always
be deemed to have been void.

(2) Where any property vested in the Custodian under
this Act had been transferred, before the commencement of
the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Ordinance, 2016, by an enemy or enemy subject or enemy



Sec. 1}

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

firm and such transfer has been declared, by an order, made
by the Central Government, to be void, and the property had
been vested or deemed to have been vested in the Custodian [
by virtue of the said order made under section 6, as it stood
before its substitution by section 6 of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016] such
property shall, notwithstanding anything contained in any
Jjudgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other
authority, continue to vest or be deemed to have been vested
in the Custodian and no person (including an enemy or
enemy subject or enemy firm) shall have any right or
deemed to have any right (including all rights, titles and
interests or any benefit arising out of such property) over the
said property vested or deemed to have been vested in the
Custodian.”.

7. In section 8 of the principal Act,—

() On and from the date of commencement of the

principal Act, for sub-section (I), the following sub-section
shall be substituted and shall always be deemed to have been
substituted, namely:—

“(I) With respect to the property vested in the
Custodian under this Act, the Custodian may take or
authorise the taking of such measures as he considers
necessary or expedient for preserving such property till
it is disposed of in accordance with the provisions of
this Act.”;

(#9) in sub-section (2),—

(a) after clause (i), the following clause shall be
inserted, namely:—

‘(ia) fix and collect the rent, standard rent, lease
rent, licence fee or usage charges, as the case may be,
in respect of enemy property;

(b) after clause (iv), the following clause shall be
inserted, namely:—

“(iva) secure vacant possession of the enemy
property by evicting the unauthorised or illegal
occupant or trespasser and remove unauthorised or
illegal constructions, if any.’.”.

Amendment
of section 8.



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY {PArT [I—

Insertion of 8. After section 8 of the principal Act, the following section
" section shall be inserted, namely:—

Sale of “8A.(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any
gmpe“y judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other
Cisto dian. authority or any law for the time being in force, the Custodian

may, within such time as may be specified by the Central
Government in this behalf, dispose of whether by sale or
otherwise, as the case may be, with prior approval of the
Central Government, by general or special order, enemy
properties vested in him immediately before the date of
commencement of the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Ordinance, 2016 in accordance with the provisions
of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment
and Validation) Ordinance, 2016.

(2) The Custodian may, for the purpose of disposal of
enemy property under sub-section (/), make requisition of the
services of any police officer to assist him and it shall be the
duty of such officer to comply with such requisition.

(3) The Custodian shall, on disposal of enemy property
under sub-section (/) immediately deposit the sale proceeds
into the Consolidated Fund of India and intimate details
thereof to the Central Government.

(49) The Custodian shall send a report to the Central
Government at such intervals, as it may specify, for the enemy
properties disposed of under sub-section (1), containing such
details, (including the price for which such property has been
sold and the particulars of the buyer to whom the properties
have been sold or disposed of and the details of the proceeds
of sale or disposal deposited into the Consolidated Fund of
India) as it may specify.

(5) The Central Government may, by general or special
order, issue such directions to the Custodian on the matters
relating to disposal of enemy property under sub-section (1)
and such directions shall be binding upon the Custodian and
the buyer of the enemy properties referred to in that sub-
section and other persons connected to such sale or disposal.

(6) The Central Government may, by general or special
order, make such guidelines for disposal of enemy property
under sub-section (/).



5 0f 1908.

SEec. 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY

(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section,
the Central Government may direct that disposal of enemy
property under sub-section (/) shall be made by any other
authority or Ministry or Department instead of Custodian
and in that case all the provisions of this section shall apply
to such authority or Ministry or Department in respect of
disposal of enemy property under sub-section (/).

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections
(1) to (7), the Central Government may deal with or utilise
the enemy property in such manner as it may deem fit.”.

9. After section 10 of the principal Act, the following section

shall be inserted, namely:—

“10A.(1) Where the Custodian proposes to sell any enemy
immovable property vested in him, to any person, he may on
receipt of the sale proceeds of such property, issue a certificate
of sale in favour of such person and such certificate of sale
shall, notwithstanding the fact that the original title deeds of
the property have not been handed over to the transferee, be
valid and conclusive proof of ownership of such property by
such person.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in any law for
the time being in force, the certificate of sale, referred to in
sub-section (/), issued by the Custodian shall be a valid
instrument for the registration of the property in favour of the
transferee and the registration in respect of enemy property for
which such certificate of sale had been issued by the
Custodian, shall not be refused on the ground of lack of
original title deeds in respect of such property or for any such
other reason.”.

10. In section 11 of the principal Act, after sub-section (2), the

following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) The Custodian, Deputy Custodian or Assistant
Custodian shall have, for the purposes of exercising powers
or discharging his functions under this Act, the same powers
as are vested in a civil court under the Code of Civil
Procedure, 1908, while dealing with any case under this Act, in
respect of the following matters, namely:—

(a) requiring the discovery and inspection of
documents;

(b) enforcing the attendance of any person, including

Insertion of
new séction
10A.

Power to issue
certificate of
sale.

Amendment of
section 11.



THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PArT I—

Amendment

of section
17.

Substitution
of new
section for
section 18.

Transfer of
property
vested -as
enemy
property in
certain
cases.

Insertion of
new
section18A.

Incomc not
liable to be
returned.

Insertion of
new section
18B.

any officer dealing with land, revenue and registration
matters, banking officer or officer of a company and
examining him on oath;

(¢) compelling the production of books, documents
and other records; and

(d) issuing commissions for the examination of
witnesses or documents.”.

11. In section 17 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for
the words “two per centum”, at both the places where they occur,
the words "five per centum" shall be substituted.

12. For section 18 of the principal Act, the following section
shall be substituted, namely:—

“18. The Central Government may, on receipt of a
representation from a person, aggrieved by an order vesting a
property as enemy property in the Custodian within a period
of thirty days from the date of receipt of such order and after
giving a reasonable opportunity of being heard, if it is of the
opinion_that any enemy property vested in the Custodian
under this Act and remaining with him was not an enemy
property, it may by general or special order, direct the
Custodian that such property vested as efemy property in the
Custodian may be transferred to the person from whom such
property was acquired and vested in the Custodian.”.

13. On and from the date of commencement of the principal
Act, after section 18 (as so substituted by section 12 of this
Ordinance), the following section shall be inserted and shall
always be deemed to have been inserted, namely:—

“18A. Any income received in respect of the enemy
property by the Custodian shall not, notwithstanding that such
property-had been transferred by way of sale under section 8A
or section 18, as the case may be, to any other person, be
returned or liable to be returned to such person or any other
person.”.

14. After section 18A of the principal Act, (as so inserted by
section 13 of this Ordmance) the following section shall be
inserted, namely:—



SEC. 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

“18B. No civil court or other authority shall entertain any

suit or other proceeding in respect of any property, subject
matter of this Act as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016, or any action
taken by the Central Government or the Custodian in this
regard.”.

15.

In section 20 of the principal Act, for the words "five

hundred rupees" at both the places where they occur, the words
"ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

16. On and from the date of commencement of the principal Act,
in section 22 of the principal Act, after the words “for the time
being in force”, the brackets and words “(including any law of
succession or any custom or usage in relation to succession of
property)” shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to have
been inserted.

17. After section 22 of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted and shall always be deemed to have been inserted with
effect from the 2™ July, 2010, namely:—

“22A. Notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment,

decree or order of any court, tribunal or other authority,—

(a) the provisions of this Act, as amended by the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance,
2016, shall have and shall always be deemed to have effect
for all purposes as if the provisions of this Act, as amended
by the said Ordinance, had been in force at all material
times;

(b) any enemy property divested from the Custodian
to any person under the provisions of this Act, as it
stood immediately before the commencement of the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance,
2016, shall stand transferred to and vest or continue to
vest, free from all encumbrances, in the Custodian in the
same manner as it was vested in the Custodian before such
divesting of enemy property under the provisions of this
Act, as if the provisions of this Act, as amended by the
aforesaid Ordinance, were in force at all material times;

(o) no suit or other proceedings shall, without
prejudice to the generality of the foregoing provisions, be
maintained or continued in any court or tribunal or
authority for the enforcement of any decree or order or
direction given by such court or tribunal or authority

Bar of
jurisdiction.

Amendment of
section 20.

Amendment of
section 22.

Insertion of
new section
22A.

Validation.



10

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ParT H—

Amendment
of section
23.

Power to
removal of
difficulty.

Amendment
of sections 2
and 3 of Act
40 of 1971.

directing divestment of enemy property from the Custodian
vested in him under section 5 of this Act, as it stood before
the commencement of the Enemy Property (Amendment
and Validation) Ordinance, 2016, and such enemy property
shall continue to vest in the Custodian under section 5 of
this Act, as amended by the aforesaid Ordinance, as the
said section, as amended by the aforesaid Ordinance was in
force at all material times;

(d) any transfer of any enemy property, vested in the
Custodian, by virtue of any order of attachment, seizure or
sale in execution of decree of a civil court or orders of any
tribunal or other authority in respect of enemy property
vested in the Custodian which is contrary to the provisions
of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016, shall be
deemed to be null and void and notwithstanding such
transfer, continue to vest in the Custodian under this Act.”.

18. In section 23 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), clause
(d) shall be omitted.

19. (2) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions
of the principal Act, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016, the Central
Government may, by order, published in the Official Gazette,
make such provisions not inconsistent with the provisions of this
Act, as amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Ordinance, 2016, or the Public Premises (Eviction of
Unauthorised Occupants) Act, 1971, as amended by the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016, as may
appear to be necessary for removing the difficulty:

Provided that no such order shall be made under this section
after the expiry of two years from the date on which the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Bill, 2016, replacing the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016,
receives the assent of the President.

(2) Every order made under this section shall be laid, as soon
as may be after it is made, before each House of Parliament.

20. In the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised Occupants).
Act,1971,—

(a) in section 2, in clause (e), after sub-clause (3), the

40 of 1971.



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 11

following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) any premises of the enemy property as defined in
clause (c) of section 2 of the Enemy Property Act,

14 of 1968 1968.”;

(b) in section 3, in clause (a),—

(?) in the second proviso, the word “and” shall be
omitted;

(#) after the second proviso, the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided also that the Custodian, Deputy

Custodian and Assistant Custodian of the enemy

property appointed under section 3 of the Enemy

14 of 1968. Property Act, 1968 shall be deemed to have been
appointed as the Estate Officer in respect of those

enemy property, being the public premises, referred

to in sub-clause (4) of clause (e) of section 2 of this

Act for which they had been appointed as the

Custodian, Deputy Custodian and Assistant

Custodian under section 3 of the Enemy Property

Act, 1968.”.

21. Notwithstanding the cessation of the operation of the Savings.

Ord 40f2010.  Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2010,

34 of 1968, anything done or any action taken under the Enemy Property

40 of 1971. Act, 1968, or the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised
Occupants) Act, 1971, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2010, shall be deemed
to have been done or taken under the corresponding provisions
of those Acts, as amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment
and Validation) Ordinance, 2010, as if the provisions of this Act,
as amended by the said Ordinance had been in force at all
material times.

PRANAB MUKHERIJEE,
President,

DR. G. NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.-

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2016.

GMGIPMRND—4029GI(CRC)—07-01-2016.



T W S Ta—(TH)04/0007/2003—16 REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

HRA & USTUA
The Gazette of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY
7 H—9's 1
PART I — Section 1
TiuyeR § T
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

W 22] ¢ e, Temfar, 7 31, 2016/99 11, 1938 (IF)
No.22] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, MARCH 31,2016/CHAITRA 11, 1938 (SAKA)

WM A S e d T e fF mommirem I WA @ |

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 31st March, 2016/Chaitra 11, 1938 (Saka)
THE UTTARAKHAND APPROPRIATION
(VOTE ON ACCOUNT) ORDINANCE, 2016
No. 2 oF 2016

Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India.

An ordinance to provide for the withdrawal of certain sums from and
out of the Consolidated Fund of the State of Uttarakhand for the
services of a part of the financial year 2016-2017.

WHEREAS by a proclamation issued on the 27th March, 2016 by
the President under article 356 of the Constitution, the powers of the
Legislature of the State of Uttarakhand have been declared to be
exercisable by or under the authority of Parliament;

AND WHEREAS the Parliament is not in session and the President is
satisfied that circumstances exist which rendered it necessary for him
to take immediate action for the purpose of the timely compliance of
financial business of the State of Uttarakhand;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause
(1) of article 123 of the Constitution, the President is pleased to
promulgate the following Ordinance:—

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Uttarakhand gh"“ title and
. . . ommencement.
Appropriation (Vote on Account) Ordinance, 2016.

(2) It shall come into force on the 1st day of April, 2016 .



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

[PART 11—

Withdrawal of
Rs.136.42.43 85,000
from and out of the
Consolidated Fund
of State of
Uttarakhand.

Appropriation.

2. From and out of the Consolidated Fund of the State of
Uttarakhand there may be withdrawn sums not exceeding those
specified in column (3) of the Schedule amounting in the aggregate to
the sum of thirteen thousand six hundred forty-two crore, forty-three
lakh, eighty-five thousand rupees towards defraying the several
charges which will come in course of payment during the financial
year 2016-2017 in respect of the services specified in column (2) of
the Schedule.

3. The sums authorised to be withdrawn from and out of the
Consolidated Fund of the State of Uttarakhand by this Ordinance shall
be appropriated for the services and purposes expressed in the
Schedule in relation to the said year.



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY
THE SCHEDULE
(See sections 2 and 3)

o] B ) B I , ©) ——
No. of vote / Services and purposes Sums not exceeding
Appropriation Voted by Charged on the Total

Parliament Consolidated
Fund
Rs. Rs. Rs.

01 Legislature Revenue 115,583 4,889 120472

Capital 50,667 50,667

02 Governor Revenue 30259 30,259
Capital

03 Council of Ministers Revenue 222266 222266

Capital 2,50,000 2,50,000

04 Judicial Administration Revenue 575,519 171,649 747,168

Capital 1,56,669 1,56,669

05 Election Revenue 5.01.280 5.01.280
Capital

06 Revenue and General Administration Revenue 96,82,014 8,649 | 96.90.663

Capital 65,670 65,670

07 Finance, Tax, Planning, Secretariat and | Revenue

Miscellaneous Services 1,97,97,768 15,825,137 | 3,56,22,905

Capital 421,685 7107434 | 7529119

08 Excise Revenue 79,540 79,540
Capital

09 Public Service Commission Revenue 40,957 102,893 1,43 850

Capital 16,667 16,667

10 Police and Jail Revenue 55.66.720 55.66.720

Capital 80,005 80,005

1 Education, Sports, Youth Welfare and Culture Revenue 2.13,26.708 2,13.26.708

Capital 13,68,529 13,68.529

12 Medical, Health and Family Welfare Revenue 57.61.743 57.61.743

[ Capital 336,177 336,177

13 Water Supply, Housing and Urban Development Revenue 26.93.870 26.93.870

Capital 11,98,335 11,98,335

14 Information Revenue 242250 242250

Capital 4,167 4,167

15 Welfare Revenue 4375641 43.75,641

Capital 64,273 64,273

16 Labour and Employment Revenue 692,198 6.92,198

Capital 44,154 44,154

17 Agriculture Works and Research Revenue 3222097 32,22,097

Capital 9,07,104 9,07,104




Secretary to the Govt. of India.-

4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [Part I— Sgc. 1]
M @ , e
No. of vote / Services and purposes - Sums not exceeding
Appropriation Voted by Charged on the Total
Parliament Consolidated
Fund ]
. . e e e - = RS‘ RS RS. —
_l_g_ Co-operative - Revenue 1,92.476 1,92.476
Capital 21,508 21,508
9 ) Rural Development - ) Revenue 35,93,751 35,93,751
- Capital 2430312 24,30,312
20 | Irrigation and Flood Revenue 15,28,186 15,28.186
Capital 18,88,601 18,88,601
21 Energy Revenue 45,540 45,540
Capital 14,37,467 14,37,467
22 Public Work Revenue 21,31,763 24,333 21,56,096
Capital 57,74,401 57,74,401
23 Industries Revenue 6,51,219 6,51,219
- Capital 9,62,501 9,62,501
24 Transport Revenue 2,13,203 2,13,203
. Capital 2,13,338 2,13,338
25
Food Revenue | 1, 49 79 14,79,791
Capital 37.027 37,027
26 Touri
ourism Revenue 191,841 1.91,841
Capital 539,334 539,334
27 Forest
ores Revenue | 53 33 20,23,368
Capital | 575509 575,509
28 1 H
Animal Husbandary Revenue 865,076 8.65.076
Capital 12,001 12,001
29 Horticult Devel
orticulture Development Revenue 7.19.547 2,600 7.22.147
Capital
30
Welfare of Scheduled Castes Revenue 34.33.748 | 34.33.748
Capital 10,16,732 10,16,732
31 i
Welfare of Scheduled Tribes Revenue 9.90,532 9.90,532
Capital 3,17,514 3,17,514
TOTAL | Revenue | 9.29,56,195 1,61,70,409 | 10,91,26,604
TOTAL | Capital | ;73680 | 7124,101 | 2,72,97,781
GRAND TOTAL 11,31,29.875 | 2,32.94,510 | 13,64,24,385
PRANAB MUKHERIJEE,
President.
- DR. G.NARAYANA RAJU,

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2016.

GMGIPMRND—5366G1(S3)—31-03-2016.



W} g S uel—(TH)04/0007/2003—16  REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

ahT
The Gazetaggw of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY
I II—9vs 1
PART I — Section 1
TSR & Y1
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T 23] ¢ e, wfER, st 2, 2016/9% 13, 1938 (%)
No.23]  NEW DELHIL, SATURDAY, APRIL 2, 2016/CHAITRA 13, 1938 (SAKA)

T W A i g de & o ® e R e otem deer @ w9 § @ . w9 S

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 2nd April, 2016/Chaitra 13, 1938 (Saka)

THE ENEMY PROPERTY (AMENDMENT AND
VALIDATION) SECOND ORDINANCE, 2016
No. 3 OF 2016
Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-seventh
Year of the Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Enemy Property Act,
1968 and the Public Premises (Eviction of
Unauthorised Occupants) Act, 1971.

WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Ordinance, 2016 was promulgated by the
President on the 7™ day of January, 2016; -

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016 to replace the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016 has been
passed by the House of the People and is pending in the
Council of States: '

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill. 2016 has been referred to the Select
Committee of the Rajya Sabha for examination and report
and is pending before the said Committee;



Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 2.

2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [Part II—

AND WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the
President is satisfied that circumstances exist which render
it necessary for him to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred
by clause (1) of article 123 of the Constitution, the
President is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinance:- -

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Second
Ordinance, 2016.

(2) Save as otherwise provided, it shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 7" day of January, 2016.

2. On and from the date of commencement of the
Enemy Property Act, 1968 (hereinafter referred to as the
principal Act), in section 2,—

(7) in clause (b),—

(/) for the words “an enemy subject”, the words
“an enemy subject including his legal heir and
successor whether or not a citizen of India or the
citizen of a country which is not an enemy or the
enemy, enemy subject or his legal heir and successor
who has changed his nationality” shall be substituted
and shall always be deemed to have been substituted;

(1) for the words “an enemy firm”, the words
“an enemy firm, including its succeeding firm
whether or not partners or members of such
succeeding firm are citizens of India or citizens of a
country which is not an enemy or such firm which
has changed its nationality” shall be substituted and
shall always be deemed to have been substituted:

(1) for the words “does not include a citizen of
India”. the words -~ “does not include a citizen of
India other than those citizens of India. being the
legal heir and successor of the “enemy™ or “cnemy
subject” or “enemy firm” ’ shall be substituted and
shall always be deemed to have been substituted;

34 of 1968.



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY

(IV) the following Explanations shall be inserted
and shall always be deemed to have been inserted at
the end, namely:—

‘Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this clause,
the expression “does not include a citizen of India”
shall exclude and shall always be deemed to have
been excluded those citizens of India, who are or
have been the legal heir and successor of an
“enemy” or an “enemy subject” or an “enemy firm”
which or who has ceased to be an enemy due to
death, extinction, winding up of business or change of
nationality or that the legal heir and successor is a
citizen of India or the citizen of a country which is
not an enemy.

FExplanation 2.—For the purposes of this clause,
it is hereby clarified that nothing contained in this
Act shall affect any right of thc legal heir and
successor referred to in this clause (not being
inconsistent to the provisions of this Act) which have
been conferred upon him under any other law for the
time being in force.’;

(ii) in clause (c), in the proviso,- -

(1) after the words “dies in the territories to which
this Act extends”, the words “or dies in any territory
outside India” shall be inserted and shall always be
deemed to have been inserted;

(1) the following Explanations shall be inserted
and shall always be deemed to have been inserted at
the end, namely:—

‘Explanation 1.~—For the purposes of this clause,
it is hereby clarified that “enemy property” shall,
notwithstanding that the enemy or the enemy subject
or the enemy firm has ceased to be an enemy due to
death. extinction. winding up of business or change
of nationality or that the legal heir and successor is a
citizen of India or the citizen of a country which 1s
not an enemy. continue and always be deemed to be
continued as an enemy property.



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PArT [I—

Explanation 2.—For the purposes of this clause,
the expression “enemy property” shall mean and
include and shall be deemed to have always meant
and included all rights, titles and interest in, or any
benefit arising out of, such property.’.

Amendment of 3. On and from the date of commencement of the

section 3. principal Act, in section 5, after sub-section (2), the
following shall be inserted, and shall always be deemed
to have been inserted, namely:—

‘(3) The enemy property vested in the Custodian
shall, notwithstanding that the enemy or the enemy
subject or the enemy firm has ceased to be an enemy
due to death, extinction, winding up of business or
change of nationality or that the legal heir and
successor 1s a citizen of India or the citizen of a
country which is not an enemy, continue to remain,
save as otherwise provided in this Act, vested in the
Custodian.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-
section, “enemy property vested in the Custodian”
shall include and shall always be deemed to have
been included all rights, titles, and interest in, or any
benefit arising out of, such property vested in him

under this Act.’.

Insertion of new 4. After section 5 of the principal Act, the following

section SA. section shall be inserted, namely:—

Issue of “SA. The Custodian may, after making such

?F”i“;‘?“c by inquiry as he deems necessary. by order, declare that

- Usto n. .

prtodian the property of the enemy or the enemy subject or the

enemy firm described in the order, vests in him under
this Act and issue a certificate to this effect and such
certificate shall be the evidence of the facts stated
therein.”.

Insertion ot 5. On and from the date of commencement of the

new section principal Act, after section 5A (as inscrted by scction 4

B of Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)

Ordinance, 2016, the following shall be inserted and
shall always be deemed to have been inserted, namely:—-



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY 5

‘SB. Nothing contained in any law for the time Law of
being in force relating to succession or any custom or —Succession or
usage governing succession of property shall apply in a“yocusuir? or
relation to the enemy property under this Act and no :;:T; :ooen:my
person (including his legal heir and successor) shall property.
have any right and shall be deemed not to have any
right (including all rights, titles and interests or any
benefit arising out of such property) in relation to

such enemy property.

Explanation—For the purposes of this section,
the expressions "custom" and "usage" signify any rule
which, having been continuously and uniformly
observed for a long time, has obtained the force of
law in the matters of succession of property.’.

6. On and from the date of commencement of the Amendment of
principal Act, for section 6 of the principal Act, the scetion®.
following section shall be substituted and shall always be
deemed to have been substituted, namely:—

“6. (1) No enemy or enemy subject or enemy firm Prohibition to
shall have any right and shall never be deemed to transferany
have any right to transfer any property vested in the Pr(g)enty dV.eStzd
Custodian under this Act, whether before or after the :;1 eﬁzrgvlan Y
commencement of this Act and any transfer of such ¢pemy Sil[,ject
property shall be void and shall always be deemed to  or enemy firm.

have been void.

(2) Wherc any property vested in the Custodian
under this Act had been transferred, before the
commencement of the Enemy Property (Amendment
and Validation) Second Ordinance, 2016, by an
enemy or enemy subject or enemy firm and such
transfer has been declared, by an order, made by the
Central Government, to be void, and the property had
been vested or deemed to have been vested in the
Custodian [by virtue of the said order made under
section 6, as it stood before its substitution by section
6 of the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Second Ordinance. 2016] such property
shall. notwithstanding anything contained in any
judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or
other authority. continue to vest or be deemed to have
been vested in the Custodian and no person
(including an enemy or enemy subject or enemy
firm) shall have any right or deemed to have any



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PArT II—

right (including all rights, titles and interests or any
benefit arising out of such property) over the said
property vested or deemed to have been vested in
the Custodian.”.

Amendment 7. In section 8 of the principal Act,—
of section 8.

(i) On and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act, for sub-section (/), the following sub-
section. shall be substituted and shall always be
deemed to have been substituted, namely:-—

“(1) With respect to the property vested in the
Custodian under this Act, the Custodian may take
or authorise the taking of such measures as he
considers necessary or expedient for preserving
such property till it is disposed of in accordance
with the provisions of this Act.”;

(ii) in sub-section (2),

(a) after clause (i), the following clause shall
be inserted, namely:—

“(ia) fix and collect the rent, standard
rent, lease rent, licence fee or usage charges,
as the case may be, in respect of enemy
property;

(b) after clause (iv), the following clause shall
be inserted, namely:—

“(iva) secure vacant possession of the
ecnemy property by evicting the unauthorised
or illegal occupant or trespasser and remove
unauthorised or illegal constructions, if any:™.

Insertion of 8. Afier section 8 of the principal Act. the following

2‘\“ section scction shall be inserted, namely:-

O

Sale of “8A (7) Notwithstanding anything contained in

Efof’m;? by any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal
ustodian.

or other authority or any law for the time being in
force. the Custodian may. within such time as may
be specified by the Central Government in this



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY

behalf, dispose of whether by sale or otherwise, as
the case may be, with prior approval of the Central
Government, by general or special order, enemy
properties vested in him immediately before the date
of commencement of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Second Ordinance,
2016 in accordance with the provisions of this Act, as
amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Second Ordinance, 2016.

(2) The Custodian may, for the purpose of
disposal of enemy property under sub-section (/),
make requisition of the services of any police officer
to assist him and it shall be the duty of such officer to
comply with such requisition.

(3) The Custodian shall, on disposal of enemy
property under sub-section (/) immediately deposit
the sale proceeds into the Consolidated Fund of India
and intimate details thereof to the Central
Government.

(4) The Custodian shall send a report to the
Central Government at such intervals, as it may
specify, for the enemy properties disposed of under
sub-section (/), containing such details, (including
the price for which such property has been sold and
the particulars of the buyer to whom the properties
have been sold or disposed of and the details of the
proceeds of sale or disposal deposited into the
Consolidated Fund of India) as it may specify.

(5) The Central Government may, by general or
special order, issue such directions to the Custodian
on the matters relating to disposal of enemy property
under sub-section (/) and such directions shall be
binding upon the Custodian and the buyer of the
cnemy properties referred to in that sub-section and
other persons connected to such sale or disposal.

(6) The Central Government may. by gencral or
special order, make such guidelines for disposal of
enemy property under sub-section (/).



8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PArT II—

(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in this
section, the Central Government may direct that
disposal of enemy property under sub-section (/)
shall be made by any other authority or Ministry or
Department instead of Custodian and in that case all
the provisions of this section shall apply to such
authority or Ministry or Department in respect of
disposal of enemy property under sub-section (/).

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-
sections (/) to (7), the Central Government may deal
with or utilise the enemy property in such manner as
it may deem fit.”.

[nsertion of 9. After section 10 of the principal Act, the following
r]‘g”;\ section  gection shall be inserted, namely:—
Power to issue “10A.(/) Where the Custodian proposes to sell
Z:lr:’f icate of any enemy immovable property vested in him, to any
‘ person. he may on receipt of the sale proceeds of
such property, issuc a certificate of sale in favour of
such person and such certificate of sale shall,
notwithstanding the fact that the original title deeds
of the property have not been handed over to the
transferee, be valid and conclusive proof of
ownership of such property by such person.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in any
law for the time being in force, the certificate of sale,
referred to in sub-section (/), issued by the Custodian
shall be a valid instrument for the registration of the
property in favour of the transferee and the
registration in respect of enemy property for which
such certificate of sale had been issued by the
Custodian, shall not be refused on the ground of lack
of original title deeds in respect of such property or
for any such other reason.”.

Amendment of 10. In section 11 of the principal Act, after sub-
section J] scction (2). the following sub-section shall be inserted.
namecly:

=“(3) The Custodian. Deputy Custodian or
Assistant Custodian shall have. for the purposes of
exercising powers or discharging his functions under
this Act. the same powers as are vested in a civil



5 0f 1908.

Ord. 1 of
2016.

Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY

court under the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908, while
dealing with any case under this Act, in respect of the
following matters, namely:—

(a) requiring the discovery and inspection of
documents; '

(b) enforcing the attendance of any person,
including any officer dealing with land, revenue
and registration matters, banking officer or officer
of a company and examining him on oath;

(¢) compelling the production of books,
documents and other records; and

(d) 1ssuing commissions for the examination
of witnesses or documents.”.

11. In section 17 of the principal Act, in sub-section
(1). for the words “two per centum”, at both the places
where they occur, the words "five per centum” shall be
substituted.

12. For section 18 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be substituted, namely:

“18. The Central Government may, on receipt of a
representation from a person, aggrieved by an order
vesting a property as enemy property in the Custodian
within a period of thirty days from the date of receipt
of such order and after giving a reasonable
opportunity of being heard, if it is of the opinion that
any enemy property vested in the Custodian under
this Act and remaining with him was not an enemy
property. it may by general or special order. direct the
Custodian that such property vested as enemy
property in the Custodian may be transferred to the
person from whom such property was acquired and
vested in the Custodian.™.

13. On and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act. after secuon 18 |as substituted by section
12 of Fnemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Ordinance. 2016]. the following section shall be inserted
and shall always be deemed to have been inserted,
namely:

Amendment of
section 17.

SubsHtution of
new section for
section 18.

Transfer of
property vested
as enemy
property in
certain cases.

Insertion of new
section 18A.



Income not
liable to be
returned.

Insertion of
new section
18B.

Bar of
jurisdiction.

Amendment

of section 20.

Amendment

of section 22.

Insertion of
new section

22A.

Validation.

10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY  [PArT H—

“18A. Any income received in-respect of the
enemy property by the Custodian shall not,
notwithstanding that such property had been
transferred by way of sale under section 8A or section
18, as the case may be, to any other person, be
returned or liable to be returned to such person or any
other person.”.

14. After section 18A of the principal Act [as
inserted by section 13 of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016], the
following section shall be inserted, namely:- -

“18B. No civil court or other authority shall
entertain any suit or other proceeding in respect of
any property, subject-matter of this Act as amended
by the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Second Ordinance, 2016, or any action taken by the
Central Government or the Custodian in this regard.”.

15. In section 20 of the principal Act, for the words
“five hundred rupees™ at both the places where they occur,
the words “ten thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.

16. On and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act, in section 22 of the principal Act, after the
words “for the time being in force”, the brackets and
words “*(including any law of succession or any custom or

usage in relation to succession of property)” shall be

inserted and shall always be deemed to have been
inserted.

17. After section 22 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to have
been inserted with effect from the 2™ July, 2010, namely:

“22A. Notwithstanding anything contained 1n any
judgment. decrce or order of any court. tribunal or
other authority.

(a) the provisions of this Act, as amended by
the I'nemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Second Ordinance, 2016, shall have and shall
always be deemed to have effect for all purposes
as if’ the provisions of this Act, as amended by the
said Ordinance. had been in force at all material times;

Ord. 1 of 2016.



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 11

(b) any enemy property divested from the
Custodian to any person under the provisions of
this Act, as it stood immediately before the
commencement of the Enemy  Property
(Amendment and Validation) Second Ordinance,
2016, shall stand transferred to and vest or
continue to vest, free from all encumbrances, in
the Custodian in the same manner as it was vested
in the Custodian before such divesting of enemy
property under the provisions of this Act, as if the
provisions of this Act, as amended by the
aforesaid Ordinance, were in force at all material
times;

(¢) no suit or other proceedings shall, without
prejudice to the generality of the foregoing
provisions, be maintained or continued in any
court or tribunal or authority for the enforcement
of any decree or order or direction given by such
court or tribunal or authority directing divestment
of enemy property from the Custodian vested in
him under section 5 of this Act, as it stood before
the commencement of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Second Ordinance,
2016, and such enemy property shall continue to
vest in the Custodian under section 5 of this Act,
as amended by the aforesaid Ordinance, as the said
scction, as amended by the aforesaid Ordinance
was in force at all material times;

(d) any transfer of any enemy property. vested
in the Custodian, by virtue of any order of
attachment. seizure or sale in execution of decree
of a civil court or orders of any tribunal or other
authority in respect of enemy property vested In
the Custodian which is conirary to the provisions
of this Act. as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Second Ordinance.
2016. shall be deemed to be null and void and
notwithstanding such transfer. continue to vest in
the Custodian under this Act.”.

18. In scction 23 of the principal Act, in sub-scction  Amendment of
(7). clausce (d) shall be omitted. seeton 2o



Power to
remove
difficulties.

Amendment of
sections 2 and
3ot Act 40 of
1971.

12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY  [ParT II—

19. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Second Ordinance,
2016, the Central Government may, by order, published
in the Official Gazette, make such provisions not
inconsistent with the provisions of this Act, as amended
by the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Second Ordinance, 2016, or the Public Premises
(Eviction of Unauthorised Occupants) Act, 1971, as
amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Second Ordinance, 2016, as may appear to be
necessary for removing the difficulty:

Provided that no such order shall be made under this
section after.the expiry of two years from the date on
which the Bill replacing the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Second Ordinance, 2016,
receives the assent of the President.

(2) Every order made under this section shall be laid,
as soon as may be after it is made, before each House of
Parliament.

20. In the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised
Occupants) Act, 1971,

(a) in section 2, in clause (e), after sub-clause (3).
the following sub-clause shall be inserted. namely:—

“(4) any premises of the enemy property as
defined in clause (¢) of section 2 of the Enemy
Property Act, 1968.7;

(h) in section 3, in clause (a). -

(/) in the second proviso, the word ~and™ shall
be omitted;

(i) after the second proviso. the following
proviso shall be inserted. namely:

“Provided also that the Custodian. Depuly
Custodian and Assistant Custodian of the enemiy
property appointed under section 3 of the FEnemy
Property Act. 1968 shall be deemed to have been
appointed as the Estatc Officer in respect of thosc

40 of 1971.

34 of 1968.

24 of 1968.



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY 13

cncmy  property, being the public  premises.
referred 1o in sub-clause (4) of clause (¢) of section
2 of this Act for which they had been appointed
as the Custodian, Deputy Custodian and

Assistant Custodian under section 3 of the Enemy
Property Act, 1968.”.

21. Notwithstanding the cessation of the operation of  Savings.
thc  Enemy  Property (Amendment and Validation)

2;?(')40; Ordinance. 2010. anything donc or any action taken
3406 1968, under the Enemy Property Act. 1968. or the Public

Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised Occupants) Act.
40 of 1971. 1971, as amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment
and Validation) Ordinance, 2010, shall be deemed to
have been done or taken under the corresponding
provisions of those Acts, as amended by the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2010,
as 1 the provisions of this Act, as amended by the said
Ordinance had been in force at all material times.

Ord. I of 22. (1) The Enemy Property (Amendment and Repealand
2016. Validation) Ordinance, 2016 is hereby repealed. Savings.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or
34 of 1968. any action taken under the Enemy Property Act, 1968 as
amended by the said Ordinance, shall be decmed to have
been done or taken under the corresponding provisions of
the said Act, as amended by this Ordinance.

PRANAB MUKHERJEE,

President.

" DR.G. NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India. -

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2016.

GMGIPMRND—11GI(CRC)—02-04-2016.



T T G wer—(TR)04/0007/2003—16 ~ REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

AdSTUA
The Gazette of IJudia

EXTRAORDINARY
9a [I—gvs 1
PART H — Section 1
TfYeR | yifvE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Te 35] 2 fieel, raar, uE 24, 2016/59 3, 1938 (VF)
No. 35] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, MAY 24,2016/JYAISTHA 3, 1938 (SAKA)

T W A =1 7 g @ St € R o 9% oo dee @ w9 F @ S w9

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 24th May, 2016/Jyaistha 3, 1938 (Saka)

THE INDIAN MEDICAL COUNCIL (AMENDMENT)
ORDINANCE, 2016
No. 4 oF 2016
Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Indian Medical Council
Act, 1956.

WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the President is
satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for
him to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by
clause (1) of article 123 of the Constitution, the President is
pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance:—

1. (I) This Ordinance may be called the Indian Medical  Shorttitle and
Council (Amendment) Ordinance, 2016. commencement.

(2) Tt shall come into force at once.



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [ParT I—SEC. 1]

Insertion of new 2. In the Indian Medical Council Act, 1956 (hereinafter 102 of 1956.
section 10D referred o as the principal Act), after section 10C, the following

section shall be inserted, namely:—
Uniform ?““‘;mce «10D. There shall be conducted a uniform entrance
;ﬁg?;gf;ﬁ;mo;nd examination to all medical educational institutions at the
post-graduate undergraduate level and post-graduate level through such
level. designated authority in Hindi, English and such other

Janguages and in such manner as may be prescribed and the
designated authority shall ensure the conduct of uniform
entrance examination in the aforesaid manner:

Provided that notwithstanding any judgment or order of
any court, the provisions of this section shall not apply in
relation to the uniform entrance examination at the
undergraduate level for the academic year 2016-2017
conducted in accordance with any regulations made under this
Act in respect of State Government seats (whether in
Govérnment medical college or in a private medical college)
where such State has not opted for such examination.”.

Am‘?ndf;em of 3. In section 33 of the principal Act, after clause (ma), the
section 33. following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(mb) the designated authority, other languages and the
manner of conducting of uniform entrance examination to all
medical educational institutions at the undergraduate level and
post-graduate level;”.

PRANAB MUKHERIJEE,
President.

DR. G. NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

RAM Digitally signed by

RAM DAYAL

DAYAL Date: 2016.05.24

17:10:26 +05'30'

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2016.

GMGIPMRND—1053GI(S3)—24-05-2016.



3
W W g T—(TF)04/0007/2003—16 REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

Hd & ASTUA
The Gazette of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY
a1 II—Evs 1
PART II — Section 1
TiYSR | T

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T 36) 72 feeh, AR, WS 24, 2016/59 3, 1938 (H)
No. 36] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, MAY 24, 2016/ JYAISTHA 3, 1938 (SAKA)

3| 9 # i e gen @ it € e 9% e dae 3 w9 A W@ W 9

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilatien.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 24th May, 2016/Jyaistha 3, 1938 (Saka)

THE DENTISTS (AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2016

No. 5 0r 2016

Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Dentists Act, 1948.

WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the President is
satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for
him to take immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by
clause (1) of article 123 of the Constitution, the President is

pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance:—

1. (/) This Ordinance may be called the Dentists Shorttitcand
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2016. commencement,

(2) It shall come into force at once.



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 1]

1‘"5"5"“0';(;)[')"”CW 2. In the Dentists Act, 1948 (hereinafter referred to as the 16071948
eeton 10 principal Act), after section 10C, the following section shall be
inserted, namely:- -

Uff“b,"mt?““'?“““ “10D. There shall be conducted a uniform entrance
:lel;g;(ﬁ';teo;nd examination to all dental educational institutions at the
post-graduate undergraduate level and post-graduate level through such
level. designated authority in Hindi, English and such other

languages and in such manner as may be prescribed and the
designated authority shall ensure the conduct of uniform
entrance examination in the aforesaid manner:

Provided that notwithstanding any judgment or order of
any court, the provisions of this section shall not apply, in
relation to the uniform entrance examination at the
undergraduate level for the academic year 2016-2017
conducted in accordance with any regulations made under this
Act, .in respect of State Government seats (whether in
Government dental college or in private dental college) where
such State has not opted for such examination.

Amendment of 3. In section 20 of the principal Act, after clause (4), the
section 20. . . v
following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ha) the designated authority, other languages and the
manner of conducting of uniform entrance examination to all
dental educational institutions at the undergraduate level and
post-graduate level;”..

PRANAB MUKHERIJEE,
President.

" DR. G. NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

Digitally signed by
RAM RAM DAYAL

Date: 2016.05.24
DAYAL 17:14:56 +05'30'

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2016.

GMGIPMRND—1054GI(S3)—24-05-2016.



T G S q@—(TT)04/0007/2003—16  REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

MR = JAST9A
The Gazetle of India

EXTRAORDINARY
i I —@vs 1
PART I — Section 1
R § Fhiim
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T 40] 74 feeelt, AerEr, W 31, 2016/59% 10, 1938 (TF)
No. 40] NEW DELHI, TUESDAY, MAY 31, 2016/JYAISTHA 10, 1938 (SAKA)

T W # o 7 e <t it @ Fied 76 9 Tert Wewer & w9 H @ o wa |

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 31st May, 2016/Jyaistha 10, 1938 (Saka)

THE ENEMY PROPERTY (AMENDMENT AND
VALIDATION) THIRD ORDINANCE, 2016

No. 6 or 2016

Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-seventh
Year of the Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Enemy Property
Act, 1968 and the Public Premises (Iiviction of
Unauthorised Occupants) Act, 1971.

WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendmem and
Validation) Ordinance, 2016 was promulgated by the
President on the 7" day of January, 2016;

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016 to replace the Lnemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016 has been
passed by the Housc of the Pcople and is pending in the
Council of Statcs;



Short litke and
commencement,

THEGAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [Part II—

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016 has ‘been referred to the Seclect
Committee of the Rajya Sabha for its examination and

report;

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Second Ordinance was promulgated by the
President on the 2nd April, 2016;

AND WHEREAS the Select Committee submitted its
Report, along with the Encmy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016 incorporating therein the
amendments decided by the Committee on the 6™ May,

2016;

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016, as reported by thc Sclect
Committee, could not be taken up for consideration and
passing in the Council of States;

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Second Ordinance, 2016 will cease to operate
on the 5" day of June, 2016;

AND WHEREAS it is considered nccessary to give
continued effect to the provisions of the lnemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Second Ordinance, 2016
along with the amendments as decided by thc Select
Committee;

AND WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the
President is satisfied that circumstances exist which render
it nccessary for him to take immediate action;

NoOw, THEREFORE, in excrcise of the powers conferred
by clause (1) of article 123 of the Constitution, the
President is pleased to promulgatc the following
Ordinance:— -

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called thc Enemy

Property (Amendment and Vahidation) Third Ordinance,
2016.

(2) Save as otherwise provided, it shall be deemed to
have come into force on the 7" day of January, 2016.




Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 3

Amendment of 2. On and from the date of commencement of the
section 2. Enemy Property Act, 1968 (hereinafier referred to as the 34 of 1968.

principal Act), in section 2,
(¥) in clause (b),

(J) for the words “an encmy subjcct”, the words
“an enemy subject including his legal heir and
successor whether or not a citizen of India or the
citizen of a country which is not an enemy or the -
enemy, enemy subject or his legal heir and successor
who has changed his nationality” shall be substituted
and shall always bc-deemed to have been substituted;

(/) for the words “an encmy firm”, the words
“an enemy firm, including its succeeding firm
whether or not partners or members of such
succeeding firm are citizens of India or citizens of a
country which is not an enemy or such firm which
has changed its nationality” shall be substituted and
shall always be deemed to have becn substituted;

(I1]) for thc words “docs not include a citizen of
India”, the words ¢ “does not includc a citizen of
India other than those citizens of India, being the
legal heir and successor of the “enemy” or “enemy
subject” or “enemy firm” ’ shall be substituted and
shall always be deemed to have been substituted;

(IV) the following Explanations shall be inserted
and shall always be deemed to have been inserted at
the end, namely:—

‘Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this clause,
the expression “does not include a citizen of India”
shall exclude and shall always be deemed to have
been excluded those citizens of India, who are or
have been the legal heir and successor of an
“enemy” or an “‘enemy. subject” or an “enemy firm”
which or who has ceased to be an cnemy due to
death, extinction, winding up of business or changc of
nationality or that the legal heir and successor is a
cttizen of India or the citizen of a country which is
not an enemy.



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PArT II—

Ixplanation 2. Yor the purposes of this clause,
it is hereby clarificd that nothing contained in this
Act shall affect any right of the legal heir and
successor referred to in this clause (not being
inconsistent to the provisions of this Act) which have
been conferred upon him under any other law for the
time being in force.”;

(7)) in clause (c), in the proviso, -

(/) after the words “dies in the territories to which
this Act extends”, the words “or dics in any territory
outside India” shall be inserted and shall always be
deemed to have been inserted;

(10) the tollowing Fxplanations shall be inserted
and shall always be deemed to have been inserted at
the end, namely:

‘fixplanation 1.- For the purposes of this clause,
it is hereby clarified that “enemy property” shall,
notwithstanding that the enemy or the enemy subject
or the enemy firm has ceased to be an enemy due to
death, extinction, winding up of business or change
of nationality or that the lcgal heir and successor is a
citizen of India or the citizen of a country which is
not an encmy, continue and always be deemed to be
continued as an cnemy property.

Explanation 2.-—For the purposes of this clause,
the expression “enemy property” shall mean and
include and shall be dcemed to have always meant
and included all rights, titles and interest in, or any
benefit arising out of, such property.’.

Amendmentof 3 On and from the date of commencement of the

section 3. principal Act, in section 5, after sub-scction (2), the
following shall be inserted, and shall always be deemed
to have been inserted, namely:- -

‘(3) The cnemy property vested in the Custodian
shall, notwithstanding that the encmy or the enemy
subject or the enemy firm has ccased to be an enemy
duc to death, extinction, winding up of business or

~change of nationality or that thc legal heir and
successor Is a citizen of India or the citizen of a
country which is not an encmy, continuc to remain,
save as otherwise provided in this Act, vested in the



Insertion. of new
section 5A.

Issue of
certificate by
Custodian.

Insertion of
new section
5B.

Skc. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

Custodian.

Explanation.-- -For the purposes of this sub-
section, “enemy property vested in the Custodian”
shall includc and shall always bc deemed to have
been included all rights, titles, and interest in, or any
bencfit arising out of, such property vested in him
under this Act.’. '

4. After section 5 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely:— -

“5A. The Custodian may, after making such
inquiry as he deems necessary, by order, declarc that
the property of the enemy or the enemy subject or the
enemy firm described in the order, vests in him under
this Act and issuc a certificate to this effect and such

~ certificate shall be the evidence of the facts stated

therein.”.

5. On and from the datc of commencement of the
principal Act, after section 5A (as inserted by section 4
of Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Ordinance, 2016, the following shall be inserted and
shall always be deemed to have been inserted, namely:—

‘5B. Nothing contained in any law for the time
being in force relating to succession or any custom or
usage governing succession of property shall apply in
relation to the enemy property under this Act and no
person (including his legal heir and successor) shall
have any right and shall bc deemed not to have any
right (including -all rights, titles and interests or any
benefit arising out of such property) in relation to
such enemy property. .

Explanation. --For the purposcs of this scction,

the cxpressions "custom" and "usage" signify any rule

- which, having been continuously and uniformly

observed for a long time, has obtained the force of
law in the matters of succession of property.’.

6. On and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act, for section 6 of the principal Act, the
[ollowing section shall be substituted and shall always be
deemcd to have been substituted, namely:

Law of
succession or -
any custom or
usage not to
apply to enemy

property.

Amendment of
section 6.



Amecndment
of section 8.

THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY  [ParT II—

“6. (1) No encmy or encmy subject or enemy firm
shall have any right and shall never bc deemed to
have any right to transfer any property vested in the
Custodian under this Act, whether before or after the
commencement of this Act and any transfer of such
property shall be void and shall always be deemed to
have been void. :

(2) Where any property vested in the Custodian
under this Act had been . transferred, before the
commencement of the Enemy Property (Amendment
and Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016, by an enemy
or enemy subject or enemy firm and such transfer
has been declared, by an order, made by the Central
Government, to be void, and the property had heen
vested or deemed to have been vested in the
Custodian |[by virtue of the said order made under
section 6, as it stood before its substitution by scction
6 -of thc Fnemy Property (Amcndment and
Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016} such property
shall, notwithstanding anything contained in any

judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or .

other authority, continue to vest or be deemcd to have
been vested in the Custodian and no person
(including an enemy or cnemy subject or enemy
firm) shall have any right or deemed to have any
right (including all rights, titles and intcrests or any
benefit arising out of such property) over the said
property vested or deemed to have been vested in
the Custodian.”.

7. In section 8 of the principal Act,

(/) On and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act, for sub-section (1), the following sub-
scction shall bc substituted and shall always bec
deemed to have been substituted, namely:

“(1) With respect to the property vested in the
Custodian under this Act, the Custodian may take
or authorisc the taking of such measures as he
considers necessary or cxpedient for preserving
such property till it is disposed of in accordance
with the provisions of this Act.”; '

Prohibition to
transfer any
property vested
in Custodian by
an enemy,
enemy subject
or enemy firm.



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

(i1) in sub-section (2),---

(a) after clause (i), the followmg clause shall
be inserted, namcly -----

“(ia) fix and collect the rent, standard
rent, lease rent, licence fee or usage charges,
as the case may be, in respect of enemy
property;

(b) after clause (iv), the following clause shall
be inserted, namely: :

“(iva) secure vacant possession of the
enemy property by evicting the unauthorised
or illegal occupant or trespasser and remove
unauthorised or illegal constructions, if any;”.

Insertion of 8. After section 8 of the pr1n01pal Act ‘the following
gf\w section scction shall be inserted, namely:-—
Sale of “8A.(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in
gr:s’:ggé by any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal
n. . . . .
or other authority or any law for thc time being in

force, the Custodian may, within such time as may
be specified by the Central Government in this
behalf, disposc of whether by sale or otherwise, as
the case may bc, with prior approval of the Central
Government, by general or special order, enemy
properties vested in him immediately before the date
of commencement of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016
in accordance with the provisions of this Act, as
amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016.

(2) The Custodian may, for the purpose of
disposal of enemy property under sub-section (7),
make requisition of the services of any police officer
to assist him and it shall be the duty of such officer to
comply with such requisition.

(3) The Custodian shall, on disposal of enemy
property under sub-section (/) immediately deposit
the sale proceeds into the Consolidated Fund of India
and intimate details thercof to the Central

Government.



Insertion of
new section
10A.

Power to issue
certificate of
sale.

THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [Part II—

(4) The Custodian shall send a rcport to the
Central Government at such intervals, as it may
specify, for the enemy properties disposed of under
sub-section (/), containing such details, (including
the price for which such property has been sold and
the particulars of the buyer to whom the properties
have been sold or disposed of and the details of the
proceeds of salc or disposal deposited into the
Consolidated Fund of India) as it may specify.

(5) The Central Government may, by general or
special order, issue such directions to the Custodian
on the matters relating to disposal of enemy property
under sub-scction (/) and such directions shall be
binding upon the Custodian and the buyer of the
enemy propertics referred to in that sub-section and
other persons connected to such sale or disposal.

(6) The Central Government may, by general or
special order, make such guidelines for disposal of
cnemy property under sub-scction (/).

(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in this
scction, the Central Government may direct that
disposal of enemy property undcr sub-section (/)
shall be madc by any other authority or Ministry or
Department instcad of Custodian and in that case all
the provisions of this section shall apply to such
authority or Ministry or Department in respect of
disposal of enemy property under sub-section (7).

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-

‘sections (/) to (7), the Central Government may deal

with or utilise the enemy property in such manner as
it may decm fit.”.

9. After section 10 of the principal Act, the following

section shall be inscrted, namely:

“10A.(7) Where the Custodian proposes to sell
any enemy immovable property vested in him, to any
person, he may on receipt of the sale proceeds of
such property, issuc a certificate of sale in favour of
such person and such certificate of sale shall,
notwithstanding the fact that the original title deeds
of the property have not been handed over to the



Sec. 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 9

Amendment of

transferec, be valid and conclusive proof of
ownership of such property by such person.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in  any |

law for the time being in force, the certificate of sale,
referred to in sub-section (1), issued by the Custodian
shall be ‘a valid instrument for the registration of the
property in favour of the transferee and the
registration in respect of enemy property for which
such certificate of sale had been issued by the
Custodian, shall not be refused on the ground of lack
of original title deeds in respect of such property or

for any such other reason.”.

10. In section 11 of the principal Act, after sub-

section 1. geetion (2), the following sub-section shall be inserled,

namcly:-—

5 of 1908.

(1),

“(3) 'The Custodian, Deputy Custodian or
Assistant Custodian shall have, for the purposes of
exercising powers or discharging his functions under
this Act, the same powers as arc vested in a civil
court under the Code of Civil Procedurc,1908, while
dealing with any case under this Act, in respect of the
following matters, namely: - -

(@) rcquiring the discovery and inspection of
documents; :

(b) enforcing ‘the attendancc of any person,
including any officer decaling with land, rcvenue
and registration matters, banking officer or officer
of a company and examining him on oath;

(c) compelling the production of books,

documents and other records; and

(d) issuing commissions for the examination
of witnesses or documents.”. '

11. In section 17 of the principal Act, in sub-scction
for the words “two per centum”, at both the places

where they occur, the words "five per centum” shall be
substituted.

'Amendment of
section 17.



Ord. 1 of.
2016.

Income not -
liable to be
returned.

Insecrtion of
new scctions
181 and 18C.

Exclusion of
jurisdiction of
Civil Courts.

THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [ParT [I—

12. For section 18 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be substituted, namely: -

“18. The Central Government may, on receipt of a
representation from a person, aggricved by an order
vesting a property as cnemy property in the Custodian

within a period of thirty days from the datc of receipt
of such order or from the date of its publication in the

Official Gazette, whichever is earli¢r and after giving
a rcasonablc opportunity of being heard, if it is of the
opinion that any enemy property vested in the
Custodian under this Act and remaining with him was
not an enemy property, it may by general or special
order, direct the Custodian that such property vested
as enemy property in the Custodian may be
transferrcd to the person from whom such property
was acquired and vested in the Custodian.”.

13. On and from the datc of commencement of the

principal Act, after section 18 [as substituted by section

12 of I'nemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Ordinancc, 2016}, the following section shall be inserted
and shall always bc deemed to have been inserted,

namely:

“18A. Any income received in respect of the
encmy property by the Custodian shall not,
notwithstanding that such property had been
transferred by way of salc under scction 8A or scction
18, as the case may be, to any other person, be
returned or liable to be returned to such person or.any

other person.”.

14. After section 18A of the principal Act [as
inscricd ™ by scction 13 of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016}, the
following scctions shall be inscrted, namely:

18B. Save as otherwise provided in this Act, no civil
court or authority shall have jurisdiction to entertain any
suit or procdedings in respect of any property, subject
matter of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016, or
any action taken by the Central Government or the
Custodian in this regard.

Substitution of
new section for
section 18.

Transfer of
property vested
as enemy
property in
certain cases.

Insertion of new
sectionl8A.

Ord. 1 of 2016.



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 11

Appcal to 18C. Any person aggrieved by an order of the

High Court. Central Government under scction 18 of this Act,
may, within a period of sixty days from the date of
communication or recmpt of the order, filc an appeal
to the High Court on any question of fact or law
arising out of such orders, and upon such appecal the
High Court may, aftcer hearing the partics, pass such
orders thereon as it thinks proper:

Provided that the High Court may, if it is satisfied
that the appellant was prevented by sufficient cause
from filing an appeal within the said period, allow it
to be filed within a further period not exceeding sixty
days.

Explanation.- In this section, “High Court”
means the High Court of a State or Union territory in
which the - propcrty referred to in section 18 is

situated.”

Amendment 15. In section 20 of the principal Act, for the words
of section 20 «five hundred rupees” at both the places where they occur,
the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Amendment 16. On and from the datc of commencement of the
of seetion 22. principal Act, in section 22 of the principal Act, after the
words “for the time being in force”, the brackets and

words *‘(including any law of succession or any custom or

usage in relation to succession of property)” shall be

. inserted and shall always be deemed to have been

inserted.

Insertion of 17. After section 22 of the principal Act, the following
ggx section section shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to have
' been inserted with effect from the 2™ July, 2010, namely:
Validation. “22A. Notwithstanding anything contained in any

judgment, decrec or order of any court, tribunal or
other authority,

(a) the provisions of this Act, as amended by
thc Encmy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Third Ordinance, 2016, shall have and shall always
be deemed to have effect for all purposes as if the
provisions of this Act, as amended by the said



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PArT II—

Ordinance, had been in force at all material times;

(b) any enemy property divested from the
Custadian to any person under the provisions of
this Act, as it stood immediately before the
commencement  of the Enemy  Property
(Amendment and Validation) Third Ordinance,
2016, shall stand transferred to and vest or
continue to vest, free from all encumbrances, in
the Custodian in the same manner as it was vested
in the Custodian beforc such divesting of enemy
property under the provisions of this Act, as if the
provisions of ‘this Act, as amended by the
aforesaid Ordinance, were in force at all material
times; :

(¢) no suit or other proceedings shall, without
prejudicc to the generality of the foregoing.
provisions, be maintained or continucd in any
court or tribunal or authority for the enforcement
of any decree or order or direction given by such
court or tribunal or authority directing divestment
of enemy property from the Custodian vested in -
him under scction 5 of this Act, as it stood before
the commencement of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Third Ordinance,
2016, and such cnemy property shall continue to
vest in the Custodian under section 5 of this Act,
as amended by the aforesaid Ordinance, as the said
section, as amended by the aforesaid Ordinance
was in force at all material times;

(d) any transfer of any enemy property, vested
in the Custodian, by virtue of any order of
attachment, scizure or sale in cxccution of decree
of a civil court or orders of any tribunal or other
authority in respect of enemy property vested in
the Custodian which is contrary to the provisions
of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Third Ordinance,
2016, shall be deemed to be null and void and
notwithstanding such transfer, continue to vest in
the Custodian under this Act.”.

18. In section 23 of the principal Act, in sub-scction Amendment of
(2), clausc (d) shall be omitted. section 23.



Power Lo
remove
difficultics.

Amendment of
sections 2 and
3-of Act 40 of
1971.

Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

13

19. (/) If any difficulty arises in giving cffcct to the

provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Ilnemy
“Property (Amendment and Validation) Third Ordinance,

2016, the Central Government may, by order, published

in the Official Gazette, make such provisions not’

inconsistent with the provisions of this Act, as amended
by the Encmy Property (Amendment -and Validation)
Third Ordinance, 2016, or the Public Premiscs (Eviction
of Unauthorised Occupants) Act, 1971, as amended by
the Enemy Propcrty (Amendment and Validation) Third

- Ordinance, 2016, as may appear to be necessary for

removing the difficulty:

Provided that no such order shall be made under this
scction after the expiry of two years from thc date on
which the Bill replacing the FEnemy Property

" (Amendment .and Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016,

receives the assent of the President.

(2) Every order made under this section shall be laid,
as soon as may be after it is made, before each House of
Parliament.

20. In the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised
Occupants) Act, 1971,

(a) in section 2, in clause (e), after sub-clause (3),
the following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely:

“(4) any premises of the enemy property as
defined in clause (c) of section 2 of the Enemy
Property Act, 1968.”;

(b) in section 3, in clause (a),
(#) in the second proviso, the word “and” shall

be omitted;

| (ii) after the second proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely: -

“Provided also that the Custodian, Deputy
Custodian and Assistant Custodian of the enemy
property appointed under section 3 of the Enemy

40 of 1971.

34 of 1968.



14 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY  [PART I[I—SkC. 1]

Property Act. 1968 shall be decemed to have been 34 of 1968

appointed as the Estate Officer in respect of those
cnemy property, being the public premises,
referred to in sub-clause (4) of clausc (e) of section
2 of this Act for which they had been appointed
as the Custodian, Deputy Custodian and
Assistant Custodian under section 3 of the Enemy
Property Act, 1968.”.

21. Notwithstanding the cessation of the operation of Savings.
Ord.4 of thc Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
2010, ] Ordinance, 2010, anything donec or any action taken
34 of 1968. under the Enemy Property Act, 1968, or the Public
Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised Occupants) Act,
40 of 1971. 1971, as amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment
and Validation) Ordinance, 2010, shall be deemed to
have becn. donc or taken under the corresponding
provisions of those Acts, as amended by the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2010,
as if the provisions of this Act, as amended by the said
Ordinance had been in force at all material times.

Ord. 3 of 22. (]) The Encmy Property (Amendment and Repealand
2016. Validation) Second Ordinancc, 2016 is hereby repealed..  S2Vine.

(2) Notwithstanding such repcal, anything done or
34 of 1968. any action taken under the Enemy Property Act, 1968 as .
amended by the said Ordinance, shall be dcemed to have
been done or taken under the corresponding provisions of
the said Act, as amended by this Ordinance.

PRANAB MUKHERIJEE,
President.

DR. G. NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

MANOJ 28 ™
KUMARZ33% s

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2016.

GMGIPMRND—1111GI(CRC)—31-05-2016.



W W B Te—(T7)04/0007/2003—16 REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

MR S IS5
The Gazette of Iudia

EXTRAORDINARY
W 0I—&vs 1
PART II — Section 1
wivsR ¥ v
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

W 53) | ¢ ool TRaR, T 28, 2016/ WK 6, 1938 ()
No. 53] NEW DELHI, SUNDAY, AUGUST 28, 2016/BHADRA 6, 1938 (SAKA)

W e dE T iR F e dsT d S @ ED |

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 28th August, 2016/Bhadra 6, 1938 (Saka)

THE ENEMY PROPERTY (AMENDMENT AND
VALIDATION) FOURTH ORDINANCE, 2016

No. 7 OF 2016

Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-seventh Year of
the Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Enemy Property Act,
1968 and the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised
Occupants) Act, 1971.

WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Ordinance, 2016 was promulgated by the
President on the 7th day of January, 2016;

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016 to replace the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016 has been
passed by the House of the People and is pending in the
Council of States;



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

[Part II—

Short title  and
commencement.

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016 was referred to the Select Committee
of the Rajya Sabha for its examination and report;

AND WHEREAS in order to give continued effect to the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance,
2016, the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Second Ordinance was promulgated by the President on the
2nd April, 2016;

AND WHEREAS the Select Committee submitted its
Report, along with the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016 incorporating therein the amendments
recommended by the said Committee, on the 6th May, 2016;

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016, as reported by the Select Committee,
could not be taken up for consideration and passing in the
Council of States;

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016 incorporating the
recommendations of the Select Committee was promulgated
by the President on the 31st May, 2016 which will cease to
operate on the 28th day of August, 2016;

AND WHEREAS it is considered necessary to give
continued effect to the provisions of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016 along
with the amendments as recommended by the Select
Committee;

AND WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the
President is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it
necessary for him to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by
clause (1) of article 123 of the Constitution, the President is
pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance:—

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016.

(2) Save as otherwise provided, it shall be deemed to have
come into force on the 7*" day of January, 2016.



SEc. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

2. On and from the date of commencement of the Enemy Amendment of
34 of 1968. Property Act, 1968 (hereinafter referred to as the principal section2.
Act), in section 2,—

(i) in clause (b),—

(D) for the words “an enemy subject”, the words “an
enemy subject including his legal heir and successor
whether or not a citizen of India or the citizen of a country
which is not an enemy or the enemy, enemy subject or his
legal heir and successor who has changed his nationality”
shall be substituted and shall always be deemed to have
been substituted;

(II) for the words “an enemy firm”, the words “an
enemy firm, including its succeeding firm whether or not
partners or members of such succeeding firm are citizens
of India or citizens of a country which is not an enemy or
such firm which has changed its nationality” shall be
substituted and shall always be deemed to have been
substituted;

() for the words “does not include a citizen of
India”, the words ¢ “does not include a citizen of India
other than those citizens of India, being the legal heir and
successor of the “enemy” or “enemy subject” or “enemy
firm” * shall be substituted and shall always be deemed to
have been substituted;

(IV) the following Explanations shall be inserted and
shall always be deemed to have been inserted at the end,
namely:—

‘Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this clause,
the expression “does not include a citizen of India”
shall exclude and shall always be deemed to have
been excluded those citizens of India, who are or have
been the legal heir and successor of an “enemy” or an
“enemy subject” or an “enemy firm” which or who has
ceased to be an enemy due to death, extinction, winding
up of business or change of nationality or that the legal
heir and successor is a citizen of India or the citizen of
a country which is not an enemy.



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ParT IT—

Explanation 2.— For the purposes of this clause, it
is hereby clarified that nothing contained in this Act
shall affect any right of the legal heir and successor
referred to in this clause (not being inconsistent to the
provisions of this Act) which have been conferred upon
him under any other law for the time being in force.’;

(if) in clause (¢), in the proviso,—

(J) after the words “dies in the territories to which this
Act extends”, the words “or dies in any territory outside
India” shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to
have been inserted;

(1) the following Explanations shall be inserted and
shall always be deemed to have been inserted at the end,
namely:—

‘Explanation 1.— For the purposes of this clause,
it is hereby clarified that “enemy property” shall,
notwithstanding that the enemy or the enemy subject
or the enemy firm has ceased to be an enemy due to
death, extinction, winding up of business or change of
nationality or that the legal heir and successor is a
citizen of India or the citizen of a country which is not
an enemy, continue and always be deemed to be
continued as an enemy property.

Explanation 2.— For the purposes of this clause,
the expression “enemy property” shall mean and
include and shall be deemed to have always meant and
included all rights, titles and interests in, or any
benefit arising out of, such property.’.

Amendment of 3. On and from the date of commencement of the

section 5. principal Act, in section 5, after sub-section (2), the following
shall be inserted, and shall always be deemed to have been
inserted, namely:—

*(3) The enemy property vested in the Custodian shall,
notwithstanding that the enemy or the enemy subject or
the enemy firm has ceased to be an enemy due to death,
extinction, winding up of business or change of
nationality or that the legal heir and successor is a citizen
of India or the citizen of a country which is not an enemy,
continue to remain, save as otherwise provided in this Act,
vested in the Custodian.



SEC. 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

Explanation.—For the purposes of this sub-section,
“enemy property vested in the Custodian” shall include
and shall always be deemed to have been included all
rights, titles, and interests in, or any benefit arising out of,
such property vested in him under this Act.’.

4. After section 5 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely:—

“5A. The Custodian may, after making such inquiry
as he deems necessary, by order, declare that the property
of the enemy or the enemy subject or the enemy firm
described in the order, vests in him under this Act and
issue a certificate to this effect and such certificate shall
be the evidence of the facts stated therein.”.

5. On and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act, after section 5A [as so inserted by section 4 of
the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance,
2016], the following shall be inserted and shall always be
deemed to have been inserted, namely:—

‘5B. Nothing contained in any law for the time being
in force relating to succession or any custom or usage
governing succession of property shall apply in relation to
the enemy property under this Act and no person
(including his legal heir and successor) shall have any
right and shall be deemed not to have any right (including
all rights, titles and interests in, or any benefit arising out
of, such property) in relation to such enemy property.

Explanation.— For the purposes of this section, the
expressions "custom" and "usage" signify any rule which,
having been continuously and uniformly observed for a
long time, has obtained the force of law in the matters of
succession of property.”.

6. On and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act, for section 6 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be substituted and shall always be deemed to
have been substituted, namely:

Insertion of new
section 5A.

Issue of certificate
by Custodian.

Insertion of new
section 5B.

Law of
succession or any
custom or usage
not to apply to
enemy property.

Amendment of
section 6.



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

[ParT II—

Prohibition to
transfer any
property vested
in Custodian by
an enemy,
enemy subject
or enemy firm.

Amendment
of section 8.

“6. (1) No enemy or enemy subject or enemy firm
shall have any right and shall never be deemed to have
any right to transfer any property vested in the Custodian
under this Act, whether before or after the commencement
of this Act and any transfer of such property shall be void
and shall always be deemed to have been void.

(2) Where any property vested in the Custodian under
this Act had been transferred, before the commencement
of the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Fourth Ordinance, 2016, by an enemy or enemy subject
or enemy firm and such transfer has been declared, by an
order, made by the Central Government, to be void, and
the property had been vested or deemed to have been
vested in the Custodian [by virtue of the said order made
under section 6, as it stood before its substitution by
section 6 of the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016] such property shall,
notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment,
decree or order of any court, tribunal or other authority,
continue to vest or be deemed to have been vested in the
Custodian and no person (including an enemy or enemy
subject or enemy firm) shall have any right or deemed to
have any right (including all rights, titles and interests in,
or any benefit arising out of, such property) over the said
property vested or deemed to have been vested in the
Custodian.”.

7. In section 8 of the principal Act,—

(i) on and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act, for sub-section (I), the following sub-
section shall be substituted and shall always be deemed to
have been substituted, namely:—

“(1) With respect to the property vested in the
Custodian undcr this Act, the Custodian may take or
authorise the taking of such measures as he considers
necessary or expedient for preserving such property
till it is disposed of in accordance with the provisions
of this Act.”;

(i7) in sub-section (2),—

(a) after clause (i), the following clause shall be
inserted, namely:—



SEc. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 7

“(ia) fix and collect the rent, standard rent,
lease rent, licence fee or usage charges, as the case
may be, in respect of enemy property;”;

(b) after clause (iv), the following clause shall be
inserted, namely:—

“(iva) secure vacant possession of the enemy
property by evicting the unauthorised or illegal
occupant or trespasser and remove unauthorised or
illegal constructions, if any.”.

8. After section 8 of the principal Act, the following Insertion of new
section shall be inserted, namely:— section 8A.

“8A.(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any Sale of property
judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other by Custodian.
authority or any law for the time being in force, the
Custodian may, within such time as may be specified by
the Central Government in this behalf, dispose of whether
by sale or otherwise, as the case may be, with prior
approval of the Central Government, by general or special
order, enemy properties vested in him immediately before
the date of commencement of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016 in
accordance with the provisions of this Act, as amended by
the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Fourth
Ordinance, 2016.

(2) The Custodian may, for the purpose of disposal of
enemy property under sub-section (/), make requisition of
the services of any police officer to assist him and it shall
be the duty of such officer to comply with such
requisition.

(3) The Custodian shall, on disposal of enemy
property under sub-section (/) immediately deposit the
sale proceeds into the Consolidated Fund of India and
intimate details thereof to the Central Government.

(4) The Custodian shall send a report to the Central
Government at such intervals, as it may specify, for the
enemy properties disposed of under sub-section (1),
containing such details (including the price for which
such property has been sold and the particulars of the
buyer to whom the properties have been sold or disposed



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

[ParT II—

Insertion of
new section
10A.

Power to issue
certificate of
sale.

of and the details of the proceeds of sale or disposal
deposited into the Consolidated Fund of India), as it may
specify.

(5) The Central Government may, by general or
special order, issue such directions to the Custodian on
the matters relating to disposal of enemy property under
sub-section (/) and such directions shall be binding upon
the Custodian and the buyer of the enemy properties
referred to in that sub-section and other persons
connected to such sale or disposal.

(6) The Central Government may, by general or
special order, make such guidelines for disposal of enemy
property under sub-section (/).

(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in this
section, the Central Government may direct that disposal
of enemy property under sub-section (/) shall be made by
any other authority or Ministry or Department instead of
Custodian and in that case all the provisions of this
section shall apply to such authority or Ministry or
Department in respect of disposal of enemy property
under sub-section (/).

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-
sections (/) to (7), the Central Government may deal with
or utilise the enemy property in such manner as it may
deem fit.”.

9. After section 10 of the principal Act, the following

section shall be inserted, namely:—

“10A. (1) Where the Custodian proposes to sell any
enemy immovable property vested in him, to any person,
he may on receipt of the sale proceeds of such property,
issue a certificate of sale in favour of such person and
such certificate of sale shall, notwithstanding the fact that
the original title deeds of the property have not been
handed over to the transferee, be valid and conclusive
proof of ownership of such property by such person.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in any law
for the time being in force, the certificate of sale, referred
to in sub-section (/), issued by the Custodian shall be a
valid instrument for the registration of the property in



SEc. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 9

favour of the transferee and the registration in respect of
enemy property for which such certificate of sale had
been issued by the Custodian, shall not be refused on the
ground of lack of original title deeds in respect of such
property or for any such other reason.”.

10. In section 11 of the principal Act, after sub-section ~Amendment of
(2), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:— section 11.

“(3) The Custodian, Deputy Custodian or Assistant
Custodian shall have, for the purposes of exercising
powers or discharging his functions under this Act, the
same powers as are vested in a civil court under the Code

5 of 1908. of Civil Procedure,1908, while dealing with any case
under this Act, in respect of the following matters,
namely:—

(a) requiring the discovery and inspection of
documents;

(b) enforcing the attendance of any person,
including any officer dealing with land, revenue and
registration matters, banking officer or officer of a
company and examining him on oath;

(¢) compelling the production of books, documents
and other records; and

(d) issuing commissions for the examination of
witnesses or documents.”.

11. In section 17 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), Amendment of
for the words “two per centum?, at both the places where they ~section 17.
occur, the words "five per centum” shall be substituted.

12. For section 18 of the principal Act, the following Substitution of

section shall be substituted, namely:— "evl’, Se";i;“ for
seclion .

~18. The Central Government may, on receipt of a Transfer of

representation from a person, aggrieved by an order Property vestedas
vesting a property as enemy property in the Custodian ?:ir:ga‘;;i};::z
within a period of thirty days from the date of receipt of )
such order or from the date of its publication in the

Official Gazette, whichever is earlier and after giving a

reasonable opportunity of being heard, if it is of the

opinion that any enemy property vested in the Custodian



10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

[ParT II—

under this Act and remaining with him was not an enemy
property, it may by general or special order, direct the
Custodian that such property vested as enemy property in
the Custodian may be transferred to the person from
whom such property was acquired and vested in the

Custodian.”.
Insertion of new 13. On and from the date of commencement of the
sectionI3A. principal Act, after section 18 [as so substituted by section 12
of the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Ordinance, 2016], the following section shall be inserted and
shall always be deemed to have been inserted, namely:—
Income not “18A. Any income received in respect of the enemy
liable t‘; be property by the Custodian shall not, notwithstanding that
returned. such property had been transferred by way of sale under
section 8A or section 18, as the case may be, to any other
person, be returned or liable to be returned to such person
or any other person.”.
Insertion of new 14. After section 18A of the principal Act [as so inserted

sections 18B by section 13 of the Enemy Property (Amendment and

and 18C. Validation) Ordinance, 2016], the following sections shall be
inserted, namely:—

Exclusion of “18B. Save as otherwise provided in this Act, no civil

jurisdiction of court or authority shall have jurisdiction to entertain any

civil courts. suit or proceedings in respect of any property, subject
matter of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016, or
any action taken by the Central Government or the
Custodian in this regard.

Appeal to High 18C. Any person aggrieved by an order of the Central

Court. Government under section 18 of this Act, may, within a

period of sixty days from the date of communication or
receipt of the order, file an appeal to the High Court on
any question of fact or law arising out of such orders, and
upon such appeal the High Court may, after hearing the
parties, pass such orders thereon as it thinks proper:

Provided that the High Court may, if it is satisfied that
the appellant was prevented by sufficient cause from
filing an appeal within the said period, allow it to be filed
within a further period not exceeding sixty days.

Ord. 1 of 2016.



SEC. 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

11

Explanation.—In this section, “High Court” means the
High Court of a State or Union territory in which the
property referred to in section 18 is situated.’.

15. In section 20 of the principal Act, for the words “five
hundred rupees” at both the places where they occur, the words
“ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

16. On and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act, in section 22 of the principal Act, after the
words “for the time being in force”, the brackets and words
“(including any law of succession or any custom or usage in
relation to succession of property)” shall be inserted and shall
always be deemed to have been inserted.

17. After section 22 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to have
been inserted with effect from the 2nd July, 2010, namely:—

“22A. Notwithstanding anything contained in any
judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other
authority,—

(a) the provisions of this Act, as amended by the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Fourth
Ordinance, 2016, shall have and shall always be
deemed to have effect for all purposes as if the
provisions of this Act, as amended by the said
Ordinance, had been in force at all material times;

() any enemy property divested from the
Custodian to any person under the provisions of this
Act, as it stood immediately before the commencement
of the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Fourth Ordinance, 2016, shall stand transferred to and
vest or continue to vest, free from all encumbrances, in
the Custodian in the same manner as it was vested in
the Custodian before such divesting of enemy property
under the provisions of this Act, as if the provisions of
this Act, as amended by the aforesaid Ordinance, were
in force at all material times:

(¢) no suit or other proceedings shall, without
prejudice to the generality of the foregoing provisions,
be maintained or continued in any court or tribunal or

Amendment of
section 20.

Amendment of
section 22.

Insertion of new
section 22A.

Validation.



12

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

[ParT II—

Amendment of
section 23.

Power to
remove
difficulties.

authority for the enforcement of any decree or order or
direction given by such court or tribunal or authority
directing divestment of enemy property from the
Custodian vested in him under section 5 of this Act, as
it stood before the commencement of the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Fourth
Ordinance, 2016, and such enemy property shall
continue to vest in the Custodian under section 5 of
this Act, as amended by the aforesaid Ordinance, as if
the said section, as amended by the aforesaid
Ordinance was in force at all material times;

(d) any transfer of any enemy property, vested in
the Custodian, by virtue of any order of attachment,
seizure or sale in execution of decree of a civil court or
orders of any tribunal or other authority in respect of
enemy property vested in the Custodian which is
contrary to the provisions of this Act, as amended by
the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Fourth Ordinance, 2016, shall be deemed to be null and
void and notwithstanding such transfer, continue to
vest in the Custodian under this Act.”.

18. In section 23 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
clause (d) shall be omitted.

19. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Fourth Ordinance,
2016, the Central Government may, by order, published in the
Official Gazette, make such provisions not inconsistent with
the provisions of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016, or the
Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised Occupants) Act,
1971, as amended by the Enemy Properly (Amendment and
Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016, as may appear to be
necessary for removing the difficulty:

Provided that no such order shall be made under this
section after the expiry of two years from the date on which
the Bill replacing the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016, receives the assent of the
President.

(2) Every order made under this section shall be laid, as
soon as may be after it is made, before each House of
Parliament.

40 of 1971.



SEC. 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

13

34 of 1968.

34 of 1968.

Ord. 4 of 2010.

34 of 1968.

40 of 1971,

Ord. 6 of 2016.

20. In the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised
Occupants) Act,1971,—

(a) in section 2, in clause (e), after sub-clause (3), the
following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) any premises of the enemy property as defined
in clause (c) of section 2 of the Enemy Property Act,
1968.”;

(b) in section 3, in clause (a),—

(i) in the second proviso, the word “and” shall be
omitted;

(ii) after the second proviso, the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided also that the Custodian, Deputy
Custodian and Assistant Custodian of the enemy
property appointed under section 3 of the Enemy
Property Act, 1968 shall be deemed to have been
appointed as the Estate Officer in respect of those
enemy property, being the public premises, referred to
in sub-clause (4) of clause (e) of section 2 of this Act
for which they had been appointed as the Custodian,
Deputy Custodian and Assistant Custodian under
section 3 of the Enemy Property Act, 1968.”.

21. Notwithstanding the cessation of the operation of the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance,
2010, anything done or any action taken under the Enemy
Property Act, 1968, or the Public Premises (Eviction of
Unauthorised Occupants) Act, 1971, as amended by the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance,
2010, shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the
corresponding provisions of those Acts, as amended by the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance,
2010, as if the provisions of this Act, as amended by the said
Ordinance had been in force at all material times.

22. (/) The Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Third Ordinance, 2016 is hereby repealed.

Amendment of
sections 2 and 3
of Act 40 of 1971.

Savings.

Repeal and
savings.



14 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ParT II—SEC. 1]

(2) Notwithstanding such repeai, anything done or any
action taken under the Enemy Property Act, 1968 as amended 34 of 1968.
by the said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done or
taken under the corresponding provisions of the said Act, as
amended by this Ordinance.

PRANAB MUKHERJEE,
President.

DR. G. NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

RAM oo

DAYAL 255 w0550

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI,
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2016.

GMGIPMRND—2520GI(CRC)—28-8-2016.



e Ho S Te—(T1)04/0007/2003—16 REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/000‘7/2003—16

HA =
- The Gazette of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY
I I—E's 1
PART II — Section 1
TSR § THivE

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

He 58] ¢ feoeht, TR, feawR 22, 2016/919 1, 1938 (W)
No.58] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, DECEMBER 22,2016/PAUSHA 1, 1938 (SAKA)

39 i ¥ i 7 e §t St @ R e 9w oo dee @ w9 W s e |

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department) .

New Delhi, the 22nd December, 2016/Pausha 1, 1938 (Saka)

THE ENEMY PROPERTY (AMENDMENT AND VALIDATION)
FIFTH ORDINANCE, 2016

No. 8 oF 2016

Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Enemy Property Act,
1968 and the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised
Occupants) Act, 1971.

WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Ordinance, 2016 was promulgated by the President on the 7th day
of January, 2016;

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016 to replace the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016 has been passed
by the House of the People and is pending in the Council of -
States;



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—

" AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016 was referred to the Select Commiittee of the
Rajya Sabha for its examination and report;

AND WHEREAS in order to give continued effect to the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016.
the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Sccond
Ordinance was promulgated by the President on the 2"¢ day of
April, 2016;

AND WHEREAS the Select Committee submitted its Report,
along with the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Bill, 2016 incorporating therein the amendments recommended
by the said Committee, on the 6th day of May, 2016,

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Bill, 2016, as reported by the Select Committec,
could not be taken up for consideration and passing in the
Council of States;

AND WHEREAS the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Third Ordinance, 2016 incorporating the
recommendations of the Select Committee was promulgated by
the President on the 31st day of May, 2016 and the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Bill, 2016, as reported by
the Select Committee could not be taken up for consideration and
passing in the Council of States;

AND WHEREAS in order to give continued effect to the
provisions of the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Third  Ordinance, 2016, along with the amendments as
recommended by the Select Committee, the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016 was
promulgated by the President on the 28" day of August, 2016,
which will cease to operate on the 27" day of December, 2016;

AND WHEREAS it is considered necessary to give continued
effect to the provisions of the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Fourth Ordinance, 2016 along with the amendments
as recommended by the Select Committee;

AND WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the President
is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for
him to take immediate action;



34 of 1968.

Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY 3

. NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conterred by
clause (1) of article 123 of the Constitution, the President is
pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance:- -

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016.

(2) Save as otherwise provided, it shall be deemed to have
come into force on the 7" day of January. 2016.

2. On and from the date of commencement of the Enemy
Property Act, 1968 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),
in section 2, -

(i) in clause (b), —

(D) for the words “an enemy subject”, the words “an
enemy subject including his legal heir and successor whether
or not a citizen of India or the citizen of a country which is
not an enemy or the enemy, enemy subject or his legal heir
and successor who has changed his nationality” shall be
substituted and shall always be deemed to have been
substituted;

(II) for the words “an enemy firm”, the words “an enemy
firm, including its succeeding firm whether or not partners or
members of such succeeding firm are citizens of India or
citizens of a country which is not an enemy or such firm
which has changed its nationality” shall be substituted and
shall always be deemed to have been substituted;

({ID) for the words “does not include a citizen of India™,
the words ¢ “does not include a citizen of India other than
those citizens of India, being the legal heir and successor of
the “enemy” or “enemy subject” or “enemy firm” ° shall be
substituted and shall always be deemed to have been
substituted;

(IV) the following Explanations shall be inserted and
shall always be deemed to have been inserted at the end,
namely:—

‘Explanation 1.—For the purposes of this clause, the
expression “does not include a citizen of India” shall
exclude and shall always be deemed to have been
excluded those citizens of India, who are or have been the

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 2.



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [ParT II—

legal heir and successor of an “cnemy” or an “encmy
subject” or an “enemy firm” which or who has ceased to
be an enemy due to death, extinction, winding up of
business or change of nationality or that the legal heir and
successor is a citizen of India“or the citizen of a country
which is not an enemy.

Explanation 2.~ - For the purposes of this clause, it is
hereby clarified that nothing contained in this Act shall
affect any right of the legal heir and successor referred to
in this clause (not being inconsistent to the provisions of
this Act) which have been conferred upon him under any
other law for the time being in force.’;

(ii) in clause (¢), in the proviso,—

(/) after the words “dies in the territories to which this Act
extends”, the words “or dies in any territory outside India”
shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to have been
inserted; '

(1) the following Explanations shall be inserted and shall
always be deemed to have been inserted at the end, namely:

‘Explanation 1.— For the purposes of this clause, it is
hereby clarified that “enemy property” shall,
notwithstanding that the enemy or the enemy subject or
the enemy. firm has ceased to be an enemy due to death,
extinction, winding up of business or change of
nationality or that the legal heir and successor is a citizen
of India or the citizen of a country which is not an enemy,
continue and always be deemed to be continued as an
cnemy property.

Explanation 2.— For the purposes of this clause, the
expression “enemy property” shall mean and include and
shall be deemed to have always meant and included all
rights, titles and interests in, or any benefit arising out of,
such property.’.

Amendment 3. On and from the date of commencement of the principal

ofsection 5. Act in section 5, after sub-section (2), the following shall be
inserted, and shall always be deemed to have been inserted,
namely:—

‘(3) The enemy property vested in the Custodian shall,
notwithstanding that the enemy or the enemy subject or the
enemy firm has ceased to be an enemy due to death,



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 5

extinction, winding up of business or change of nationality or
that the legal heir and successor is a citizen of India or the
citizen of a country which is not an enemy, continue to
remain, save as otherwise provided in this Act, vested in the
Custodian. )

Explanation—For the purposes of this sub-section,
“enemy property vested in the Custodian” shall include and
shall always be deemed to have been included all rights, titles,
and interests in, or any benefit arising out of, such property
vested in him under this Act.”.

4. After section 5 of the principal Act, the following section
shall be inserted, namely:—

“5A. The Custodian may, after making such inquiry as he
deems necessary, by order, declare that the property of the
enemy or the enemy subject or the enemy firm described in
the order, vests in him under this Act and issue a certificate to
this effect and such certificate shall be the evidence of the
facts stated therein.”.

S. On and from the date of commencement of the principal
Act, after section 5A [as inserted by section 4 of the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016], the
following shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to have
been inserted, namely:—

‘5B. Nothing contained in any law for the time being in
force relating to succession or any custom or usage governing
succession of property shall apply in relation to the enemy
property under this Act and no person (including his legal heir
and successor) shall have any right and shall be deemed not to
have any right (including all rights, titles and interests in, or
any benefit arising out of, such property) in relation to such
enemy property.

Explanation.-— For the purposes of this section, the
expressions "custom”" and "usage" signify any rule which,
having been continuously and uniformly observed for a long
time, has obtained the force of law in the matters of
succession of property.’.

6. On and from the date of commencement of the principal
Act, for section 6 of the principal Act, the following section shall
be substituted and shall always be deemed to have been

Insertion of new
section 5A.

Issue of
certificate by
Custodian.

Insertion of new
section 5B.

Law of
succession or
any custom or
usage not to
apply to enemy

property.

Amendment of
section 6.



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—

substituted, namely:—

Prohibition to “6. (/) No enemy or enemy subject or enemy firm shall

transfer any have any right and shall never be deemed to have any right to

SZ‘:’C‘?{V“ transfer any property vested in the Custodian under this Act,

Custodian by whether before or after the commencement of this Act and

an enemy, any transfer of such property shall be void and shall always be

cnemy deemed to have been void.

subject or

cnemy firm.

(2) Where any property vested in the Custodian under this

Act had been transferred, before the commencement of the
Fnemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Fifth
Ordinance, 2016, by an enemy or cnemy subject or enemy
firm and such transfer has been declared, by an order, made
by the Central Government, to be void, and the property had
been vested or deemed to have been vested in the Custodian
[by virtue of the said order made under section 6, as it stood
before its substitution by section 6 of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016] such
property shall, notwithstanding anything contained in any
judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other
authority, continue to vest or be deemed to have been vested
in the Custodian and no person (including an enemy or
enemy subject or enemy firm) shall have any right or be
deemed to have any right (including all rights, titles and
interests, or any benefit arising out of, such property) over
the said property vested or deemed to have been vested in
the Custodian.”.

Amendment 7. In section 8 of the principal Act,

of section 8.

(/) on and from the date of commencement of the
principal Act, for sub-section (/), the following sub-section
shall be substituted and shall always be deemed to have been
substituted, namely:—

“(I) With respect to the property vested in the
Custodian under this Act, the Custodian may take or
authorise the taking of such measures as he considers
necessary or expedient for preserving such property till it
is disposed of in accordance with the provisions of this
Act.”;

(i) in sub-section (2),—

(a) after clause (i), the following clause shall be



Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY ' 7

ihserted, namely:- -

“(ia) fix and collect the rent, standard rent, lease
rent, licence fee or usage charges, as the case may be,
in respect of the enemy property;”;

(b) after clause (iv), the following clause shall be
inserted, namely:---

“(iva) secure vacant possession of the enemy
property by evicting the unauthorised or illegal
occupant or trespasser and remove unauthorised or
illegal constructions, if any.”.

8. After section 8 of the principal Act, the following section Insertion of new
shall be inserted, namely:——- section 8A.

“8A.(I) Notwithstanding anything contained in any Sale of
judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other Property by
authority or any law for the time being in force, the Custodian.
Custodian may, within such time as may be specified by the
Central Government in this behalf, dispose of whether by sale
or otherwise, as the case may be, with prior approval of the
Central Government, by general or special order, enemy
properties vested in him immediately before the date of
commencement of the Enemy Property (Amendment and
Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016 in accordance with the
provisions of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016.

(2) The Custodian may, for the purpose of disposal of
enemy property under sub-section (/), make requisition of the
services of any police officer to assist him and it shall be the
duty of such officer to comply with such requisition.

(3) The Custodian shall, on disposal of enemy property
under sub-section (/) immediately deposit the sale proceeds
into the Consolidated Fund of India and intimate details
thereof to the Central Government.

(4) The Custodian shall send a report to the Central
Government at such intervals, as it may specify, for the
enemy properties disposed of under sub-section (1),
containing such details (including the price for which such
property has been sold and the particulars of the buyer to
whom the properties have been sold or disposed of and the
details of the proceeds of sale or disposal deposited into the



Insertion of
new section
10A.

Power to
issue
certificate of
sale.

8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—

Consolidated Fund of India). as it may specify.

(5) The Central Government may. by general or special
order, issue such directions to the Custodian on the matters
relating to disposal of enemy property under sub-section (/)
and such directions shall be binding upon the Custodian and
the buyer of the enemy properties referred to in that sub-
section and other persons connected to such sale or disposal.

(6) The Central Government may, by general or special
order, make such guidelines for disposal of enemy property
under sub-section (/).

(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in this section,
the Central Government may direct that disposal of enemy
property under sub-section (/) shall be made by any other
authority or Ministry or Department instead of the Custodian
and in that case all the provisions of this section shall apply to
such authority or Ministry or Department in respect of
disposal of enemy property under sub-section (/).

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections
(1) to (7), the Central Government may deal with or utilise

the enemy property in such manner as it may deem fit.”.

9. After section 10 of the principal Act, the following section

shall be inserted, hamely:~

“10A. (/) Where the Custodian proposes to sell any
enemy immovable property vested in him, to any person, he
may on receipt of the sale proceeds of such property, issue a
certificate of sale in favour of such person and such
certificate of sale shall, notwithstanding the fact that the
original title deeds of the property have not been handed over
to the transferee, be valid and conclusive proof of the
ownership of such property by such person.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in any law for
the time being in force, the certificate of sale, referred to in
sub-section (/), issued by the Custodian shall be a valid
instrument for the registration of the property in favour of the
transferee and the registration in respect of enemy property
for which such certificate of sale had been issued by the
Custodian, shall not be refused on the ground of lack of
original title deeds in respect of such property or for any such
other reason.”.



5 of 1908.

Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 9

10. In section 11 of the principal Act, afier sub-section (2),

the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:-

“(3) The Custodian, Deputy Custodian or Assistant
Custodian shall have, for the purposes of exercising powers or
discharging his functions under this Act, the same powers as
are vested in a civil court under the Code of Civil
Procedure,1908, while dealing with any case under this Act.
in respect of the following matters, namely:—

(a) requiring the discovery and inspection of
documents;

(b) enforcing the attendance of any person, including
any officer dealing with land, revenue and registration
matters, banking officer or officer of a company and
examining him on oath;

(¢) compelling the production of books, documents
and other records; and

.

(d) issuing commissions for the examination of
witnesses or documents.”.

11. In section 17 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for

the words “two per centum”, at both the places where they occur,
the words "five per centum" shall be substituted.

12. For section 18 of the principal Act, the following section

shall be substituted, namely:—

“18. The Central Government may, on receipt of a
representation from a person, aggrieved by an order vesting a
property as enemy property in the Custodian within a period
of thirty days from the date of receipt of such order or from
the date of its publication in the Official Gazette, whichever is
earlier and after giving a reasonable opportunity of being
heard, if it is of the opinion that any enemy property vested in
the Custodian under this Act and remaining with him was not
an enemy property, it may by general or special order, direct
the Custodian that such property vested as enemy property in
the Custodian may be transferred to the person from whom
such property was acquired and vested in the Custodian.”.

Amendment of
section ] 1.

Amendment of
section 17.

Substitution of
new section for
section 18.

Transfer of
property vested
as enemy
property in
certain cases.



Insertion of
new
section | 8A.

Income not
liable to be
returned.

Insertion of
new sections

188 and 18C.

Exclusion of
Jjurisdiction
of civil
courts.

Appeal to
High Court.

Amendment

of section 20.

10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [ParT II—

13. On and from the date of commencement of the principal
Act, after section 18 |as substituted by section 12 of the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2016], the
following section shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to
have been inserted, namely:-—

“18A. Any income received in respect of the enemy
property by the Custodian shall not, notwithstanding that such
property had been transferred by way of sale under section 8§A
or section 18, as the case may be, to any other person, be
returned or liable to be returned to such person or any other
person.”.

14. After section 18A of the principal Act [as so inserted by
section 13 of the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Ordinance, 2016}, the following sections shall be inserted,
namely:—

‘18B. Save as otherwise provided in this Act, no civil
court or authority shall have jurisdiction to entertain any suit
or proceedings in respect of any property, subject matter of
this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment
and Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016, or any action taken
by the Central Government or the Custodian in thig regard.

18C. Any person aggrieved by an order of the Central
Government under section 18 of this Act, may, within a
period of sixty days from the date of communication or
receipt of the order, file an appeal to the High Court on any
question of fact or law arising out of such orders, and upon
such appeal the High Court may, after hearing the parties,
pass such orders thereon as it thinks proper:

Provided that the High Court may, if it is satisfied that the
appellant was prevented by sufficient cause from filing an
appeal within the said period, allow it to be filed within a
further period not exceeding sixty days.

Explanation——In this section, “High Court” means the
High Court of a State or Union territory in which the property
referred to in section 18 is situated.’.

15. In section 20 of the principal Act, for the words “five
hundred rupees” at both the places where they occur, the words
“ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Ord. 1 of 2016.



SEC. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY 11

16. On and from the date of commencement of the principal
Act, in section 22 of the principal Act, after the words “for the
time being in force”, the brackets and words “(including any law
of succession or any custom or usage in relation to succession of
property)” shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to have
been inserted.

17. After section 22 of the principal Act, the following section
shall be inserted and shall always be deemed to have been inserted
with effect from the 2nd July, 2010, namely: - -

“22A. Notwithstanding anything contained in any
judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other
authority,—

(a) the provisions of this Act, as amended by the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Fifth
Ordinance, 2016, shall have and shall always be deemed to
have effect for all purposes as if the provisions of this Act,
as amended by the said Ordinance, had been in force at all
material times;

(b) any enemy property divested from the Custodian to
any person under the provisions of this Act, as it stood
immediately before the commencement of the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Fifth Ordinance,
2016, shall stand transferred to and vest or continue to
vest, free from all encumbrances, in the Custodian in the
same manner as it was vested in the Custodian before such
divesting of enemy property under the provisions of this
Act, as if the provisions of this Act, as amended by the
aforesaid Ordinance, were in force at all material times;

(¢) no suit or other proceedings shall, without prejudice
to the generality of the foregoing provisions, be
maintained or continued in any court or tribunal or
authority for the enforcement of any decree or order or
direction given by such court or tribunal or authority
directing divestment of enemy property from the
Custodian vested in him under section 5 of this Act, as it
stood before the commencement of the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016, and
such enemy property shall continue to vest in the
Custodian under section 5 of this Act, as amended by the

aforesaid Ordinance, as if the said section, as amended by -

the aforesaid Ordinance was in force at all material times;

Amendment of
section 22.

Insertion of
new section
22A.

Validation.



Amendment

of section 23.

Power to
remove
difficulties.

Amendment
of sections 2
and 3 of Act
40 of 1971.

12 , THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PART IF—

(d) any transfer of any enemy property, vested in the
Custodian, by virtue of any order of attachment, seizure or
sale in execution of decree of a civil court or orders of any
tribunal or other authority in respect of enemy property
vested in the Custodian which is contrary to the provisions
of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016, shall
be deemed to be null and void and notwithstanding such
transfer, continue to vest in the Custodian under this Act.”.

18. In section 23 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
clause (d) shall be omitted.

19. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the Enemy
Property (Amendment and Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016, the
Central Government may, by an order, published in the Official
Gazette, make such provisions not inconsistent with the
provisions of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Fifth Ordinance, 2016, or the
Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised Occupants) Act, 1971,
as amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Fifth Ordinance, 2016, as may appear to be necessary for
removing the difficulty:

Provided that no such order shall be made under this section
after the expiry of two years from the date on which the Bill
replacing the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Fifth
Ordinance, 2016, receives the assent of the President.

(2) Every order made under this section shall be laid, as soon
as may be after it is made, before each House of Parliament.

20. In the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised
Occupants) Act,1971,—

(@) in section 2, in clause (e), after sub-clause (3), the
following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) any premises of the enemy property as defined in
clause (c) of section 2 of the Enemy Property Act, 1968.”;

(b) in section 3, in clause (a),—

40 of 1971.

34 of 1968.



34 of 1968.

Ord. 4 of
2010.

34 of 1968.

40 of 1971.

Ord. 7 of
2016.

34 of 1968.

Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY 13

(i) in the second proviso. the word —and”™ shall be
omitted:

(i) after the second proviso, the following proviso
shall be inserted, namely:-—

“Provided also that the Custodian, Deputy Custodian
and Assistant Custodian of the enemy property appointed
under section 3 of the Enemy Property Act. 1968 shall be
deemed to have been appointed as the Lstate Officer in
respect of those enemy property, being the public premises,
referred to in sub-clause (4) of clause (e) of section 2 of
this Act for which they had been appointed as the
Custodian, Deputy Custodian and Assistant Custodian
under section 3 of the Enemy Property Act, 1968.”.

21. Notwithstanding the cessation of the operation of the
Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2010,
anything done or any action taken under the Enemy Property Act,
1968, or the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorised
Occupants) Act, 1971, as amended by the Enemy Property
(Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 2010, shall be deemed
to have been done or taken under the corresponding provisions
of those Acts, as amended by the Enemy Property (Amendment
and Validation) Ordinance, 2010, as if the provisions of those
Acts, as amended by the said Ordinance had been in force at all
material times.

22. (1) The Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation)
Fourth Ordinance, 2016 is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the Enemy Property Act, 1968 as amended by the
said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done or taken
under the corresponding provisions of the said Act, as amended

by this Ordinance.

Savings.

Repeal and
savings.

PRANAB MUKHERIJEE,

President.

DR. G NARAYANARAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

PRINTED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI

AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI—2016.

MANOJ bvos
KUMAR

ally signed

KUM AR pate: 20161223

GMGIPMRND—3985GI(S3)}—22.12.2016.

01:07:15 +05'30"



TS do G ger—(TT)04/0007/2003—16 REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

AT
The Gazetmtg of Judia

EXTRAORDINARY
w1 I—9vs 1
PART II — Section 1
TSR | wHiE
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

W 62] ¢ fieeht, goan, fam 28, 2016/ 7, 1938 (¥79F)
No. 62] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, DECEMBER 28, 2016/PAUSHA 7, 1938 (SAKA)

i  Hem @ St § e e 9T e dee @ w9 H @ o a9

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 28th December, 2016/Pausha 7, 1938 (Saka)

THE PAYMENT OF WAGES {AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2016
No.9 oF 2016

Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India.

An Ordinance further to amend the Payment of Wages Act, 1936.

WHEREAS the Payment of Wages {Amendment) Bill, 2016 has been
introduced in the House of the People on the 15" December, 2016 and
is pending in that House;

AND WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the President is
satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to
take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1)
of article 123 of the Constitution, the President is pleased to
promulgate the following Ordinance:—



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [Part II—SEc. 1]

Short title and 1.(2) This Ordinance may be called the Payment of Wages
commencement.  Amendment) Ordinance, 2016.

(2) it shall come into force at once.

Substitution 2. For section 6 of the Payment of Wages Act, 1936, the following
of section 6 of : . A

i d of 1936 section shall be substituted, namely:

Wages to be “6. All wages shall be paid in current coin or currency notes
paid ;"r‘z‘;fr'r::‘w or by cheque or by crediting the wages in the bank account of the
notes or by empioyee;

cheque.or

crediting in bank Provided that the appropriate Government may, by

account.

naotification in the Official Gazette, specify the industrial or other
establishment, the employer of which shall pay to every person
employed in such industrial or other establishment, the wages only
by cheque or by crediting the wages in his bank account.”,

PRANAB MUKHERIEE,
President.

DR. G. NARAYANARAIJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

UPLOADED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI-110002
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI-110054.
Digitally signed
MANOJ syuvos

KUMAR
KU MAR Date: 2016.12.28

23:46:31 +05'30"

GMGIPMRND—4014GI(CRC)—28-12-2016.



T do B T@—(T)04/0007/2003—16  REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—16

HHd &
The Gazette of Ind

PART II — Section 1

R 9 T
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

 63] 7§ feoeht, TR, fwr 30, 2016/ 99 9, 1938 (W)
No.63]  NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, DECEMBER 30, 2016/PAUSHA 9, 1938 (SAKA)

- 7 9§ i s we & o Rl 7R 9 e Wewer & w9 @ S 6 |

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

- MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)
New Delhi, the 30th December, 2016/Pausha 9, 1938 (Saka)

THE SPECIFIED BANK NOTES (CESSATION OF LIABILITIES)

ORDINANCE, 2016
No.10 or 2016
Promulgated by the President in the Sixty-seventh Year of the

Republic of India.

An Ordinance to provide for cessation of liabilities on the specified
bank notes and for matters connected therewith or incidental thereto.

WHEREAS, the Central Government, on the recommendations of the
Central Board of the Reserve Bank, vide notification No. S.0. 3407(E),
dated the 8% November, 2016, declared the then existing series of the
bank notes of the denominational value of five hundred rupees and one
thousand rupees to cease to be legal tender with effect from the 9%
November, 2016 to the extent specified therein;

AND WHEREAS, a part of the series of bank notes in circulation
which have ceased to be legal tender on account of the said notification
has come back to the Reserve Bank of India;

AND WHEREAS, such bank notes which have ceased to be legal
tender are a liability in the books of accounts of the Reserve Bank of
India under section 34 of the Reserve Bank of India Act, 1934;

AND WHEREAS, it is necessary to have clarity and finality to the
liabilities of the Reserve Bank of India and the Central Government
arising from such bank notes which have ceased to be legal tender on the
basis of the said notification;



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PArT II—

Short title and
commencement.

Definitions.

Specified bank
notes to cease to be
liability of Reserve
Bank or Central
Government.

AND WHEREAS, Parliament is not in session and the President is
satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to
take immediate action;

NOW. THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by article 123
of the Constitution, the President is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinance:—

1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Specified Bank Notes
(Cessation of Liabilities) Ordinance, 2016.

(2) It shall come into force on the 31 day of December, 2016.
2. (1) In this Ordinance, unless the context otherwise requires,—
(a) “appointed day” means the 31% day of December, 2016;

(b) “grace period” means the period to be specified by the
Central Government, by notification, during which the specified
bank notes can be deposited in accordance with this Ordinance;

(c) “notification” means a notification published in the Official
Gazette;

(d) “Reserve Bank” means the Reserve Bank of India
constituted by the Central Government under section 3 of the
Reserve Bank of India Act, 1934;

(e) “specified bank note” means a bank note of the
denominational value of five hundred rupees or one thousand
rupees of the series existing on or before the 8™ day of November,
2016.

(2) The words and expressions used and not defined in this
Ordinance but defined in the Reserve Bank of India Act, 1934 or the
Banking Regulation Act, 1949 shall have the meanings respectively
assigned to them in those Acts. '

3. On and from the appointed day, notwithstanding anything
contained in the Reserve Bank of India Act, 1934 or any other law for
the time being in force, the specified bank notes which have ceased to be
legal tender, in view of the notification of the Government of India in
the Ministry of Finance, number S.0.3407(E), dated the 8 November,
2016, issued under sub-section (2) of section 26 of the Reserve Bank of
India Act, 1934, shall cease to be liabilities of the Reserve Bank under
section 34 and shall cease to have the guarantee of the Central
Government under sub-section (1) of section 26 of the said Act.

20f 1934.

2 of 1934.
10 of 1949.

20f 1934.



10 of 1949.

Sec. 1] " THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY

4.(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 5, (e
following persons holding specified bank notes on or before the 8" day
of November, 2016 shall be entitled to tender within the grace period
with such declarations or statements, at such offices of the Reserve Bank
or in such other manner as may be specified by it, namely:—

(i) a citizen of India who makes a declaration that he was
outside India between the 9" November, 2016 to 30" December,
2016 subject to such conditions as may be specified, by
notification, by the Central Government; or

(ii) such class of persons and for such reasons as may be
specified, by notification, by the Central Government.

(2) The Reserve Bank may, if satisfied, after making such
verifications as it may consider necessary that the reasons for failure to
deposit the notes within the period specified in the notification referred

“to in section 3, are genuine, credit the value of the notes in his Know

Your Customer compliant bank account in such manner as may be
specified by it.

(3) Any person, aggrieved by the refusal of the Reserve Bank to
credit the value of the notes under sub- section (2), may make a
representation to the Central Board of the Reserve Bank within fourteen
days of the communication of such refusal to him.

Explanation— For the purposes of this section, the expression
“Know Your Customer compliant bank account” means the account
which complies with the conditions specified in the regulations made by
the Reserve Bank under the Banking Regulations Act, 1949.

5. On and from the appointed day, no person shall, knowingly or
voluntarily, hold, transfer or receive any specified bank note:

Provided that nothing contained in this section shall prohibit the
holding of specified bank notes—

(a) by any person—
(i) up to the expiry of the grace period; or
(ii) after the expiry of the grace period,

(A) not more than ten notes in total, irrespective of the
denomination; or

(B) not more than twenty-five notes for the purposes
of study, research or numismatics;

(b) by the Reserve Bank or its agencies, or any other person
authorised by the Reserve Bank;

(c) by any person on the direction of a court in relation to any
case pending in that court.

Exchange ol
specified bank

notes.

Prohibition on
holding,
transferring or
receiving specified
bank notes.



THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PARTII—

Penalty for
contravention of
section 4.

Penalty for
contravention of
section 3.

Offences by
companies.

Special provisions

0. Whoever knowingly and wilfully makes any declaration or
statement specified under sub-section (1) of section 4, which is false in
material particulars, or omits to make a material statement, or makes a
statement which he does not believe to be true, shall be punishable with
fine which may extend to fifty thousand rupees or five times the amount
of the face value of the specified bank notes tendered, whichever is
higher.

7. Whoever contravenes the provisions of section 5, shall be
punishable with fine which may extend to ten thousand rupees or five
times the amount of the face value of the specified bank notes involved
in the contravention, whichever is higher.

8. (1) Where a person committing a contravention or default
referred to in section 6 or section 7 is a company, every person who, at
the time the contravention or default was committed, was in charge of,
and was responsible to, the company for the conduct of the business of
the company, as well as the company, shall be deemed to be guilty of
the contravention or default and shall be liable to be proceeded against
and punished accordingly:

Provided that nothing contained in this sub-section shall render any
such person liable to punishment if he proves that the contravention or
default was committed without his knowledge or that he had exercised
all due diligence to prevent the contravention or default.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), where
an offence under this Ordinance has been committed by a company and
it is proved that the same was committed with the consent or connivance
of, or is attributable to any neglect on the part of, any director, manager,
secretary, or other officer or employee of the company, such director,
manager, secretary, other officer or employee shall also be deemed to be
guilty of the offence and shall be liable to be proceeded against and
punished accordingly. :

Explanation—For the purpose of this section,—

(a) “a company” means any body corporate and includes a
firm, trust, a co-operative society and other association of
individuals;

(b) “director”, in relation to a firm or trust, means a partner in
the firm or a beneficiary in the trust.

9. Notwithstanding anything contained in section 29 of the Code of

relating to offences.  Criminal Procedure, 1973, the court of a Magisﬁate of the First Class or

the court of a Metropolitan Magistrate may impose a fine for
contravention of the provisions of this Ordinance.

20f 1974.



Skc. 1] . THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY , 5

10. No suit, prosecution or other legal proceeding shall lie against  Protection of action
the Government, the Reserve Bank or any of their officers for anything taken in good faith.
done or intended to be done in good faith under this Ordinance.,

11. (1) The Centra) Government may, by notification, make rules Power to make
for carrying out the provisions of this Act. rules.

(2) Every rule made under this Ordinance shall be laid, as soon as
may be after it is made, before each House of Parliament while it is in-
session for a total period of thirty days which may be comprised in one
session or in two or more successive sessions, and if, before the expiry
of the session immediately following the session or the successive
sessions aforesaid, both Houses agree in making any modification in the -
rule or both Houses agree that the rule should not be made, the rule shall
thereafter have effect only in such modified form or be of no effect, as
the case may be; so however, that any such modification or annulment
shall be without prejudice to the validity of anything previously done
under that rule.

12.(1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of Power to remove
this. Ordinance, the Central Government may, by order published in the difficulties. .
Official Gazette, make such provisions not inconsistent with the
provisions of this Ordinance, as may appear to it to be necessary or
expedient for removing the difficulty.

(2) Every order made under this section shall, as soon as may be
after it is made, be laid before each House of Parliament.

PRANAB MUKHERJEE,
President.

DR. G NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

UPLOADED BY THE GENERAL MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI-110002
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI-110054.

Digitally signed by
MANOJ MANOJ KUMAR

GMGIPMRND—4022GI(CRC)—30.12.2016. KUMAR De2ore230



