RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

ag 3, 3 0] WIMER, AT 88, 00/ %, Tk R3¢ [ g 3 fFwa : ¥9& RW.00

STHTARUT SHHTEH ¢
TTTerhel UhTIT

R faurmesm Afufaw T TSadeEl et Feet TRy T hod fatrew s
fafa o = faummeeA st fadad (St ET).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees (Amendment)
Act, 2016 (Mah. Act No. XIII of 2017), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

PRAKASH H. MALI,
Principal Secretary to Government,
Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XIII OF 2017.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the “Maharashira Government Gazette”, on the 16th January 2017).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and
Preservation of Trees Act, 1975.

XLII\f,a};f WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra (Urban

1975. Areas) Protection and Preservation of Trees Act, 1975, for the purposes
hereinafter appearing; it is hereby enacted in the Sixty-seventh Year of the
Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection Short title and
and Preservation of Trees (Amendment) Act, 2016. commencement.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may,
by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

®)

HAT 3MS-2¢—2



2 HERTZ I T SFETRTT WA 36, SHART L&, R0R9/WT 36, Tk 233¢

Amen‘imeni 0? 2. In section 4 of the Maharashtra (Urban Areas) Protection and
Mot XTIV o Preservation of Trees Act, 1975 (hereinafter referred to as “ the principal

1975. Act”), in sub-section (1),—

(a) for the words “ every month ” the words “ every fortnight ” shall be
substituted ;

(b) for the words “forty-five days ” the words “ twenty-one days ” shall
be substituted.

Amendment of 3. In section 8 of the principal Act,—
section 8 of

Mah. XLIV of

1975 (a) in sub-section (2), for the words “ Tree Authority ” the words “ Tree

Officer ” shall be substituted ;
(b) in sub-section (3),—
(i) for clause (a), the following clauses shall be substituted, namely :—
“(a) On receipt of such application, the Tree Officer shall,—

(1) give public notice by advertising it in at least one local
newspaper ;

(i) affix such notice on the conspicuous part of the tree that is
to be felled ;

(iti) personally inspect the tree; and
(iv) hold an inquiry.

The Tree Officer shall, after expiry of the period of submission of
objections and suggestions which shall not be less than seven days, submit
his report alongwith objections or suggestions, if any, received to the Tree
Authority or an officer mentioned in sub-section (6), as the case may be :

Provided that, the Tree Officer shall submit his report within a period
of twelve days from the date of receipt of the application :

Provided further that, no personal inspection of the trees by the Tree
Officer shall be required, if the applicant submits images and details of the
trees to be felled, by using Information Technology enabled system developed
by the urban local authority which suffices the requirement of submission of
report by the Tree Officer :

Provided also that, no such permission shall be refused if, in the opinion
of the Tree Authority or the Officer, as the case may be, the tree is dead, or
diseased or windfallen, or it constitutes a danger to life or property, or
obstructs traffic; and if any objection is received against such permission,
the matter shall be placed before the Tree Authority or the Officer, as the
case may be, for reconsideration, and a decision shall be taken within two
weeks after giving a hearing to the person who has raised the objection.

(a-1) The Officer referred to in sub-section (6) or the Tree Authority, as
the case may be, shall allow the application, with or without conditions or,
may refuse it, within a period of forty-five days from the date of receipt
of the application.”;

4

(1) in clause (b), for the words “ six months ” the words “ three

months ” shall be substituted ;

Mah.
XLIV of
1975.



TERTE IEA SIS STERUT HAT 318, THART €, 0R19/UIN €, Ik %3¢ ;
(c) in sub-section (4),—

(i) for the words “If the Tree Authority fails to inform ” the words
“ Subject to the provisions of sub-section (5), if the Tree Authority fails
to inform ” shall be substituted ;

(i) for the words “sixty days” the words “ forty-five days ” shall be
substituted ;

(d) for sub-section (5), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely :(—

“(5) Where permission to fell a tree is granted or deemed to have
been granted under sub-section (4), the applicant shall plant twice the
number of trees to be felled of the same or other suitable local species
on the same site and if required at other suitable places as decided
by the Authority. The number of trees to be planted on the same site
and that on other suitable place alongwith location of such suitable
place shall be mentioned in the permission to be granted by the
Authority. The trees shall be planted within fifteen days from the date
the tree is felled, or such extended time as the Tree Officer may allow
in this behalf:

Provided that such extended time granted shall not exceed fifteen
days. ”;

(e) after sub-section (5), the following sub-section shall be added,
namely :(—

“(6) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, if the number
of trees proposed to be felled is twenty-five or less, in such cases all the
functions and powers of the Tree Authority shall be exercised by the
Municipal Commissioner of Municipal Corporation or the Chief Officer
of Municipal Council or the Chief Executive Officer of the Authority as
the case may be.”.

4. In section 10 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words Amendment of

i ion 10 of
“one or more trees” the words “twice the number of trees” shall be f&:ﬂog@?voof

substituted. 1975.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJ SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE
OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJl SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM
JAGANNATH GOSAVI.



