GOVERNMENT OF MAHARASHTRA
LAW AND JUDICIARY DEPARTMENT

BOMBAY ACT NO. IV OF 1950.

THE MAHARASHTRAMERGED SRTES
(LAWS)ACT.

(As modifiedupto the 17th June2013)

£

PrRINTED IN INDIA BY THE MANAGER, CENTRAL JalL PRESS NAGPUR AND
PuBLISHED BY THE DIRECTOR, GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND
PusLicaTIONS, MAHARASHTRA STATE, MUMBAI-400 004

2013

[Price—Rs. 10.0D
J-1079



1950: Bom. V]
THE MAHARASHTRA MERGED STATES (LAWS) ACT.
CONTENTS

PREAMBLE.
SECTIONS

1. Shorttitle.

2. Definitions.

3. Extension of laws.

4, Repeal of corresponding laws.

5. Certain laws to continue in force in certain States.

6. Saving of Limitation.

FIRST SCHEDULE.
SECOND SCHEDULE.
THIRD SCHEDULE.
FOURTH SCHEDULE.

FIFTH SCHEDULE.

J-1079-1

0]



26
Geo. 5
Ch. 2.

Bom.
Ordi-
nance

No.
VI of
1949.

BOMBAY ACT No. IV OF 19501
[THE MAHARASHTRA MERGED STATES (LAwS) AcT.]
[30th March, 195(Q.
(ThisAct received the assent by President on the 27th March 1950; assent was first
published in thd&8ombay Government Gazette the 30th March 1950.)
Amended by Bom. 44 of 1950.
Amended by Bom. 46 of 1950.
Amended by Bom. 21 of 1951.
Amended by Bom. 32 of 1951.
Amended by Bom. 36 of 1951.
Amended by Bom. 12 of 1952,
Amended by Bom. 24 of 1952.
Amended by Bom. 21 of 1953.
Amended by Bom. 49 of 1953.
Amended by Bom. 45 of 1955.
Amended by Mah. 24 of 2012 (22-8-2012)
AnAct toextend certain Actsand Regulationsto certain areasadministered asparts
of the Sateof Bombay.
WHEREAS by order under section 2962the Government of Indiact, 1935, provision
had been made for the administration of certain areas comprised in the merged States as if
they formed part of the Province of Bombay;

AND WHEREAS the Bombay Merged States (Laws) Ordinance, 1949, has been
promulgated under section 88 of the saddl extending certaiActs and Regulations to
the said merged States;

AND WHEREAS the territory of the State of Bombay now comprises the territories of
the said merged States;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to extend certéiots and Regulations to the said
areas;

It is hereby enacted as follows :—

1. ThisAct may be called[the Maharashtra Mged Sates (LawspAct]. Short title.

2. InthisAct, the expression “mged Sates” has the same meaning as in tiaéeS’ pefinitions.
Merger (GovernordProvinces) Orded 949.

3. (1) All'the Acts and Regulations specified in the First Schedule, and so much of ., .
the Acts and Ordinance specified in the Second Schedule as relates to mattegs jMyith
respect to which the State Legislature has power to make laws are hereby extended to, and
shall be in force in the merged States.

(2) TheActs specified in the first column of tAénird Schedule shall be amended in
their application to the merged States specified in the second column in the manner set
forth in the third column of that Schedule.

(3) (a) Subject to the provisions of claud® &nd the proviso to sub-sectial) (of
section 4, all appointments, delegations, notifications, orders, bye-laws, rules and regula-
tions made, issued or prescribed underfatyOrdinance or Regulation hereby extended
to the merged States shall be deemed to extend to and be in force in the merged States.

! For Satement of Objects and ReasaseeBombay Government Gazette50,PartV, p. 137.
2The short title was amended for “the Bombay st Sates (Laws)Act, 1950” by Mah. 24 of 2012,
s. 2 and Schedule, entry 41, & f. 1-5-1960.



Repeal of
correspond-

ing laws.

Certain
laws to
continue in
force in
certain
States.

Saving of
Limitation.

Repeal.

Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. [1950: Bom. 1V

(b) Where any such appointment delegation, notification, otges-law rule, or
regulation has been made, issued or prescribed in respect of any specified local area, it
shall be deemed to extend to and to be in force also in any area of the merged States which
has been included in such local area under any law for the time being in force.

4. (1) Ifimmediately before the commencement of fds, there is in force in any of
the meged $ates arAct, Ordinance, Regulation or any other law corresponding to an
Act, Ordinance or Regulation specified in the First or Second Schedule, whether by virtue
of an Order under the Extra-Provincial Jurisdichath, 1947, applying thaict, Ordinance
or Regulation or by virtue of any other legislative pavgeich law corresponding to tR@. Vil
Act or Regulation specified in the First Schedule or any part of such law correspon%p to
so much of a\ct or Ordinance specified in the Second Schedule as relates to matters
with respect to which the State Legislature has power to make laws, shall upon the
commencement of thisct cease to havefett in any such mged Sate :

Provided that all appointments, delegations, notifications, orders, bye-laws, rules and
regulations which have been made, issued or prescribed under such law or any part of
such law exclusively in respect of any area of the merged States forming part of the
Districts of Banas Kantha, Sabar Kantha, Mehsamaeli, Baroda and Kolhapur and in
force immediately before the commencement ofAlkisn any such area shall be deemed
to have been made, issued or prescribed under the corresponding provisioAatf the
Ordinance or Regulation extended to the merged States under section 3 and shall continue
in force until it is altered, repealed or amended by a competent authority

(2) Without prejudice to the generality of, and subject to the provisions contained in
sub-sectior{1) the laws specified in the Fourth Schedule shall cease to have effect and
are hereby repealed.

5. Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions the enactments
specified in the first column of the Fifth Schedule shall continue in force in the merged
States specified in the second column of that Schedule as if they are enacted by the State
Legislature until they are altered, repealed or amended by the said Legislature or any other
competent authority

6. Notwithstanding anything contained in thAst, if the period of limitation x of
prescribed by the Indian Limitatigkct, 1908, for any suit, appeal or application is las®s.
than the period prescribed by any corresponding law in force in the merged States
immediately before the commencement of an Order applying to any of the said Staﬂléj%)ghe
Indian LimitationAct, 1908, under the Extra-Provincial Jurisdicthmt, 1947, such suit,y v,
appeal or application may be instituted within two years next after the date @f the
commencement of such order or within the period prescribed by such corresponding4aw
whichever period first expires.

7. The Bombay Merged States (Laws) Ordinance, 1949, is hereby repealed aBgit-is
hereby declared that the provisions of section 7 of the Bombay General Glet 4894, Ordi-

shall apply to the repeal, as if that Ordinance were an enactment. e

VI of
1949.
Bom.
| of
1904.



1950 : Bom. V] Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

FIRST SCHEDULE
The Bombay Regulation, 1827 (VIII of 1827).
The Criminal Courts (Substitution of Letter for Summons) Regulation, 1827 (XIll of 1827).
The Bombay Regulation, 1827 (XXV of 1827).
The Markets and Faifsct, 1862 (Bom. I\Vof 1862).
The Bombay f2am-\ésselé\ct, 1864 (Bom. |l of 1864).
The Bombay High Court (Letters Pateft), 1866 (XXIII of 1866).
The Bombayillage PoliceAct, 1867 (BomVIll of 1867).
The Bombay Ferries and Inlandssel#\ct, 1868 (Bom. Il of 1868).
The Bombay Civil Courtact, 1869 (XIVof 1869).
The Civil JailsAct, 1874 (Bom. Il of 1874).
TheTolls on Roads and Bridgést, 1875 (Bom. Il of 1875).
The Bombay Revenue Jurisdictiaat, 1876 (X of 1876).
The Bombay Land Revenue Code, 1879 (Bom. V of 1879).
The Bombay IrrigatioAct, 1879 (BomVII of 1879).
The Bombay Landing anharfage FeeAct, 1882 (BomVIl of 1882).
The Bombay Publiduthorities Sealéct, 1883 (BomV of 1883).
The Protection of Pilgrim&ct, 1887 (Bom. Il of 1887).
The Bombay Prevention of GambliAgt, 1887 (Bom. I\Vof 1887).
The Bombayillage Sanitatior\ct, 1889 (Bom. | of 1889).
The Bombay District Polic&ct, 1890 (Bom. I\Vof 1890).
The Bombay Municipal Servam&t, 1890 (BomV of 1890).
The Bombay DistricVaccinatiorAct, 1892 (Bom. | of 1892).
The Bombay District Municipaict, 1901 (Bom. Ill of 1901).
The Bombay General Clauskst, 1904 (Bom. | of 1904).
The Bombay Court dVardsAct, 1905 (Bom. | of 1905).
The MamlatdarsCourtsAct, 1906 (Bom. Il of 1906).
The Bombay Race Courses Licensiag, 1912 (Bom. 11l of 1912).
The Bombay Medicact, 1912 (BomVI of 1912).
The Bombay Smoke Nuisandsst, 1912 (BomVIl of 1912).
The Bombayfown Planningict, 1915 (Bom. | of 1915).
The Bombay Public Conveyandsst, 1920 (BomVIl of 1920).
The Bombay Pleadetct, 1920 (Bom. XVII of 1920).
The Bombay Entertainments Dutgt, 1923 (Bom. | of 1923).
The Bombay Local Boardsct, 1923 (BomVI of 1923).
The BombayPrevention of Prostitutidnt, 1923 (Bom. XI of 1923).
The Bombay Prevention édulterationAct, 1925 (BomYV of 1925).
The Bombay Bettinfax Act, 1925 (BomVI of 1925).
The Bombay Co-operative Societed, 1925 (BomVII of 1925).
The Bombay Municipal Boroughget, 1925 (Bom. XVIII of 1925).



Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. [1950: Bom. 1V

The Invalidation of Hindu Ceremonial Emolumentst, 1926 (Bom. XI of 1926).
The Bombay Non-AgriculturistéoansAct, 1928 (Bom. Ill of 1928).
The Bombay Maternity Benefct, 1929 (BomVIl of 1929).

The Bombay Borstal Schoaksct, 1929 (Bom. XVIII of 1929).

The Bombay Local Funéludit Act, 1930 (Bom. XXVof 1930).

The BombayMeights and Measuresct, 1932 (Bom. XVof 1932).
The Bombay (DistrictfobaccoAct, 1933 (Bom. Il of 1933).

The Bombayillage Panchayatéct, 1933 (BomVI of 1933).

The Bombay Live-stock ImprovemeAtt, 1933 (Bom. XXII of 1933).
The Bombayfrade Disputes ConciliatioAct, 1934 (Bom. I1X of 1934).
The Bombay Devadasis Protectidiot, 1934 (Bom. X of 1934).

The Bombay Nurses, Midwives and Healfisitors RegistrationAct, 1935 (Bom.VII
of 1935).

The Bombay Publigrusts Registratiodct, 1935 (Bom. XXVof 1935).

The Bombay Moto¥ehiclesTax Act, 1935 (Bom. XXXIVof 1935).

The Bombay Famine Relief Furftt, 1936 (Bom. XIX of 1936).

The Bombay Opium Smokingct, 1936 (Bom. XX of 1936).

The Bombay Parsi Publicusts Registratioct, 1936 (Bom. XXIIl of 1936).
The Bombay Provisional Collection BixesAct, 1938 (Bom. I\Vof 1938).

The Bombay Probation of hdersAct, 1938 (Bom. XIX of 1938).

The Bombay Medical Practitionefsct, 1938 (Bom. XXVI of 1938).

The Bombay LiftsAct, 1939 (Bom. X of 1939).

The Bombay Revenugibunal Act, 1939 (Bom. XII of 1939).

The BombayAgricultural Produce Market8ct, 1939 (Bom. XXII of 1939).

The Bombay Fodder and Grains Contal, 1939 (Bom. XXVI of 1939).

The Bombay Land Improvement Schendes, 1942 (Bom. XXVIII of 1942).

The Bombay Cotton Contrdict, 1942 (Bom. XXX of 1942).

The Bombay Increase ofeé@np DutiesAct, 1943 (Bom. XIVof 1943).

The Bombay Increase of Court-Fe&st, 1943 (Bom. X\Vof 1943).

The Bombay Growth of Foodcropgst, 1944 (BomVIIl of 1944).

The Bombay Beggar&ct, 1945 (Bom. XXIII of 1945).

The Bombay SaleEax Act, 1946 (BomV of 1946).

The Bombay Sales of Motor SpirifaxationAct, 1946 (BomVI of 1946).

The Bombay Electricity (Special Powersdt, 1946 (Bom. XX of 1946).

The Bombay Essential Commodities and Cattle (Congot) 1946 (Bom. XXII of 1946).
The Bombay Prevention of Hindu Bigamous Marriageg 1946 (Bom. XXVof 1946).
The Bombay Cotton (&tistics)Act, 1946 (Bom. XXVII of 1946).

The Bombay Home Guardsct, 1947 (Bom. Ill of 1947).

The Bombay Public Security Measurst, 1947 (BomVI of 1947).

The Bombay Harijan (Removal of Social Disabilitiég)t, 1946 (Bom. X of 1947).



1950 : Bom. V] Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

The Bombay Industrial Relatiorsct, 1946 (Bom. XI of 1947).

The Bombay Hindu Divorcéct, 1947 (Bom. XXII of 1947).

The Bombay (Emgency Powers)Vhipping Act, 1947 (Bom. XXVII of 1947).
The Bombaygricultural Debtors RelieAct, 1947 (Bom. XXVIII of 1947).
The Bombay Money-lendeisct, 1946 (Bom. XXXI of 1947).

The Bombaydjudication Proceedings (@nsfer and Continuancéyt, 1947 (Bom. XXXIV
of 1947).

The Bombay Harijafiemple EntryAct, 1947 (Bom. XXXVof 1947).

The Bombay Essential Suppliee(fiporary Powers) and the Essential Commodities and
Cattle (Control) (Enhancement of Penaltids}, 1947 (Bom. XXXVI of 1947).

The Bombaygricultural Pests and DiseasAst, 1947 (Bom. XLIII of 1947).
The Bombay Habitual @¢nders Restrictiorct, 1947 (Bom. LI of 1947).
The BombaywVarehouseg\ct, 1947 (Bom. V1 of 1947).

The Bombay Rents, Hotel and Lodging House Rates Corfiad| 1947 (Bom. VIl
of 1947).

The Bombay Rationing (Preparatory and Continuance) Meaf\oed947 (Bom. VIl
of 1947).

The Bombay Primary Educatigkct, 1947 (Bom. LXI of 1947).

The Bombay Prevention of Fragmentation and Consolidation of Holdikgs 1947
(Bom. LXII of 1947).

The Bombay Refugeeict, 1948 (Bom. XXII of 1948).

The Bombay Building (Control on ErectioArt, 1948 (Bom. XXXI of 1948).

The Bombay Land Requisitiofxct, 1948 (Bom. XXXIII of 1948).

The Bombay Secondary School Certificate Examinafion 1948 (Bom. XLIX of 1948).

The Bombay Lotteries and Prize Competitions Control Baed Act, 1948 (Bom. LIV
of 1948).

The BombayAnimal Contagious Diseases (Contréijt, 1948 (Bom. LIX of 1948).
The Bombayfenancy andgricultural LandsAct, 1948 (Bom. LXVII of 1948).
The Bombay Housing Boaréict, 1948 (Bom. LXIX of 1948).

The Bombay Childrer\ct, 1948 (Bom. LXXI of 1948).

The Bombay Khar Land&ct, 1948 (Bom. LXXII of 1948).

The Bombay Shops and Establishmehts, 1948 (Bom. LXXIX of 1948).
The BombayAnimal Preservatiori\ct, 1948 (Bom. LXXXI of 1948).

The Bombay Sugarcane Cesat, 1948 (Bom. LXXXII of 1948).

The BombayAnatomyAct, 1949 (Bom. XI of 1949).

The Bombay Nursing Homes Registratidot, 1949 (Bom. XVof 1949).

The Police Forces (Control and Directid®t, 1949 (Bom. XVI of 1949).

The Bombay SealAct, 1949 (Bom. XXII of 1949).

The Bombay Prohibitior\ct, 1949 (Bom. XXVof 1949).

The Bombay Repatriated Prisonéyst, 1949 (Bom. XXVII of 1949).



Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

SECOND SCHEDULE
PART I.

The Bombay Haqqa Prohibitiofact, 1839 (XX of 1839).
The InteresiAct, 1839 (XXXII of 1839).
The Indian SlavenAct, 1843 (Vof 1843).
The Judicial Ofcers ProtectiorAct, 1850 (XVIII of 1850).
TheApprenticesAct, 1850 (XIX of 1850).
The Caste Disabilities RemovaAtt, 1850 (XXI of 1850).
The Public Servants (Inquiriegt, 1850 (XXXVII of 1850).
The Legal Representativeslits Act, 1855 (XII of 1855).
The Indian FataAccidentsAct, 1855 (Xl of 1855).
The Hinduwidows’ RemarriagéAct, 1856 (XVof 1856).
The ForfeitureAct, 1859 (1X of 1859).
The Societies Registratiohct, 1860 (XXI of 1860).
The Indian Penal Code (XIV of 1860).
The PoliceAct (V of 1861).
The Sate Carriage#.ct (XVI of 1861).
The Government Sedlct, 1862 (1l of 1862).
The CarriersAct, 1865 (11l of 1865).

The Native Convertdarriage DissolutiorAct, 1866 (XXI of 1866).

TheActing JudgedAct, 1867 (XVI of 1867).

The Press and Registration of Bodkst, 1867 (XXVof 1867).
The Indian DivorcéAct, 1869 (IVof 1869).

The Court-Fee#éct, 1870 (VII of 1870).

The Female Infanticide Preventidwt, 1870 (VIII of 1870).
The CattleTrespasdct, 1871 (I of 1871).

The Pensionéct, 1871 (XXIIIl of 1871).

The Indian Evidencéct, 1872 (1 of 1872).

The Special Marriagéct, 1872 (1l of 1872).

The Indian Contracfct, 1872 (I1X of 1872).

The Indian Christian Marriagact, 1872 (XVof 1872).
The Indian Oathg\ct, 1873 (X of 1873).

The Indian MajorityAct, 1875 (IX of 1875).

The Indian Law Reportéct, 1875 (XVIII of 1875).
The Dramatic Performancést, 1876 (XIX of 1876).
The Specific ReliefAct, 1877 (I of 1877).

The IndianTreasure-trovéict, 1878 (VI of 1878).
The Legal PractitionerAct, 1879 (XVIII of 1879).
The Religious SocietieAct, 1880 (I of 1880).

The MunicipalTaxationAct, 1881 (XI of 1881).

The IndianTrustsAct, 1882 (Il of 1882).
TheTransfer of Propertyct, 1882 (IVof 1882).

The Indian Easemen«t, 1882 (Vof 1882).

[1950: Bom. 1V



1950 : Bom. V] Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

The Powers-of-Attornefct, 1882 (VII of 1882).

The Land Improvement LoaAst, 1883 (XIX of 1883).
TheAgriculturists’LoansAct, 1884 (1l of 1884).

The Births, Deaths and Marriages Registrafioty 1886 (VI of 1886).
The IndianTramwaydAct, 1886 (XI of 1886).

The Suitd/aluationAct, 1887 (VII of 1887).

The Provincial Small Cause Couktst, 1887 (IX of 1887).
The PolicéAct, 1888 (111 of 1888).

The Measures of Leng#ct, 1889 (Il of 1889).

The Revenue Recovefyet, 1890 (I of 1890).

The Charitable Endowmenrst, 1890 (VI of 1890).

The Guardians antVardsAct, 1890 (VIII of 1890).

The Prevention of Cruelty tanimalsAct, 1890 (XI of 1890).
The BankersBooks Evidencéct, 1891 (XVIII of 1891).
The Government Management of Private Estates1892 (X of 1892).
The PartitiorAct, 1893 (IVof 1893).

The LandAcquisitionAct, 1894 (I of 1894).

The Prisong\ct, 1894 (I1X of 1894).

The Crown GrantAct, 1895 (XVof 1895).

The Epidemic Diseaségt, 1897 (Ill of 1897).

The Indian Fisherie&ct, 1897 (IVof 1897).

The Reformatory Schoolsct, 1897 (VI of 1897).

The General Clausést, 1897 (X of 1897).

The Leperé\ct, 1898 (lll of 1898).

The Code of Criminal Procedure, 1898 (V of 1898).

The Indian Post Gite Act, 1898 (VI of 1898).

The Indian &ampAct, 1899 (Il of 1899).

The Government Buildingsct, 1899 (IVof 1899).

The Glanders and Fargyt, 1899 (XIII of 1899).

The Prisoneréct, 1900 (Il of 1900).

The Indian Foreign Marriagact, 1903 (XIVof 1903).
TheAncient Monuments Preservatidtct, 1904 (VII of 1904).
The Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (V of 1908).

The Indian LimitationAct, 1908 (IX of 1908).

The Criminal Law (Amendmengct, 1908 (XIVof 1908).
The Indian RegistratioAct, 1908 (XVI of 1908).
TheWhipping Act, 1909 (IVof 1909).

The Indian ElectricityAct, 1910 (IX of 1910).

The Prevention of Seditious Meetingst, 1911 (X of 1911).
The Indian LunacyAct, 1912 (1Vof 1912).

TheWild Birds andAnimals ProtectiorAct, 1912 (VIII of 1912).
The Oficial TrusteesAct, 1913 (Il of 1913).

TheAdministrator Generat’Act, 1913 (11l of 1913).
J-1079-2



Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

The Mussalmamvakf Validating Act, 1913 (VI of 1913).
The Indian CompanieAct, 1913 (VI of 1913).

The Destructive Insects and Peaist, 1914 (Il of 1914).
The LocaAuthorities LoansAct, 1914 (IX of 1914).

The Indian Medical Degreesct, 1916 (VII of 1916).

The Hindu Disposition of Propert#ct, 1916 (XVof 1916).
The Inland $2amVesselsAct, 1917 (1 of 1917).

The Destruction of Recordsct, 1917 (Vof 1917).

The CinematograplAct, 1918 (Il of 1918).

The Usurious Loangct, 1918 (X of 1918).

The LocalAuthorities Pensions and Gratuitidst, 1919 (1 of 1919).
The Poisondct, 1919 (XII of 1919).

The Provincial Insolvencyct, 1920 (Vof 1920).

The Indian Securitiegct, 1920 (X of 1920).

The Charitable and ReligiodsustsAct, 1920 (XIVof 1920).
The Indian Red Cross Sociefet, 1920 (XVof 1920).

The Identification of Prisoner&ct, 1920 (XXXIII of 1920).

The Indian Elections @¥nces and Inquirie8ct, 1920 (XXXIX of 1920).

The CottorilransportAct, 1923 (Il of 1923).

The Indian BoilerdAct, 1923 (Vof 1923).

TheWorkmens CompensatioAct, 1923 (VIII of 1923).
The Indian Oficial SecretsAct, 1923 (XIX of 1923).

The Legal Practitioners (@vhen)Act, 1923 (XXIII of 1923).
The MussalmakVakf Act, 1923 (XLII of 1923).

The Cotton Ginning and Pressing Factoies, 1925 (XII of 1925).
The Provident FundAct, 1925 (XIX of 1925).

The Indian Successiohct, 1925 (XXXIX of 1925).

The Contempt of Courtact, 1926 (X1l of 1926).

The IndianTrade UnionsAct, 1926 (XVI of 1926).

The Cotton Industry ¢&tistics)Act, 1926 (XX of 1926).
The Legal Practitioners (FeeAtt, 1926 (XXI of 1926).
The Indian Foresict, 1927 (XVI of 1927).

The Hindu Inheritance (Removal of Disabilitiesyt, 1928 (XII of 1928).

The Hindu Law of Inheritance (Amendme#tyt, 1929 (Il of 1929).
The Child Marriage Restraimtct, 1929 (XIX of 1929).

The Dangerous DrugAct, 1930 (Il of 1930).

The Indian Sale of Good&ct, 1930 (Il of 1930).

The Hindu Gains of Learningct, 1930 (XXX of 1930).

The MussalmalVakf Validating Act, 1930 (XXXII of 1930).

The Indian Press (Engency Powersfct, 1931 (XXIII of 1931).
The Indian Partnershifct, 1932 (IX of 1932).

The Criminal LanvAmendmentAct, 1932 (XXIII of 1932).

The Children (Pledging of LabouAct, 1933 (1l of 1933).

[1950: Bom. 1V



1950 : Bom. V] Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

The Indian Medical Counciict, 1933 (XXVII of 1933).

The Sugarcanéct, 1934 (XVof 1934).

The Parsi Marriage and Divoréect, 1936 (111 of 1936).

The Payment diVagesAct, 1936 (IVof 1936).

TheAgricultural Produce (Grading and Markinggt, 1937 (I of 1937).
The Hinduwomens Rights to Propertict, 1937 (XVIII of 1937).
TheArya MarriageValidation Act, 1937 (X1X of 1937).

The Muslim Personal Law (Sharidpplication Act, 1937 (XXVI of 1937).
The Cutchi Memors Act, 1938 (X of 1938).

The Criminal LavAmendmentAct, 1938 (XX of 1938).

The Employers LiabilityAct, 1938 (XXIV of 1938).

The Employment of ChildreAct, 1938 (XXVI of 1938).

The MotorVehiclesAct, 1939 (IVof 1939).

The Dissolution of Muslim Marriagéct, 1939 (VI of 1939).
The Commercial Documents Evidenget, 1939 (XVI of 1939).
The Medical Diploma#\ct, 1939 (XXVIII of 1939).
TheArbitration Act, 1940 (X of 1940).

The DrugsAct, 1940 (XXIII of 1940).

The Profession$ax Limitation Act, 1941 (XX of 1941).
TheWeekly HolidaysAct, 1942 (XVIII of 1942).

The Industrial &tistiesAct, 1942 (XIX of 1942).

The Hindu MarriedVomens Right to separate Residence and Maintenahce 1946
(XIX of 19486).

The Industrial Employment {&nding OrdersAct, 1946 (XX of 1946).

The Hindu Marriage Disabilities Removatt, 1946 (XXVIII of 1946).

The Essential Suppliesgmporary Powershct, 1946 (XXIV of 1946).

The Prevention of Corruptiofct, 1947 (1l of 1947).

The Industrial Disputeséct, 1947 (XIVof 1947).

The Requisitioned Land (Continuance of Powéys), 1947 (XVII of 1947).

The Indian Nursing Councict, 1947 (XLVIII of 1947).

The Pharmacyct, 1948 (VIII of 1948).

The MinimumWagesAct, 1948 (XI of 1948).

The Rehabilitation Finan@edministrationAct, 1948 (X1l of 1948).

The DentistsAct, 1948 (XVI of 1948).

The Displaced Persons (Institution of Suig}X, 1948 (XLVII of 1948).

The Electricity (SupplyAct, 1948 (LIVof 1948).

The Factoried\ct, 1948 (LXIII of 1948).

The Hindu Marriage¥alidity Act, 1949 (XXI of 1949).

The Payment ofaxes (Tansfer of Propertyfct, 1949 (XXII of 1949).

The Displaced Persons (Legal Proceedidgg) 1949 (XXVof 1949).

The Essential Services (Maintenance) Ordinahcke 1941 (X1 of 1941).
ParT 11.

The Bombay Financéct, 1932 (Bom. Il of 1932).



10

Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

[1950: Bom. 1V

THIRD SCHEDULE

Enactments

@)

Names of States

@

Amendments

©)

Bombay Akalkot,

Aundh, Bhor
Jamkhandi, Jath, Kurundwad
(Sr.) Kurundwad (39, Miraj
(Sr.), Miraj (Jr), Mudhol,
Phaltan, Ramdurg, Sangli,
Savnur SawantwadiWadi-
Jagir, Janjira, Dharampur,
Balasinor, Chhota-Udepur,
Lunawada, Rajpipla (includ-
ing Segbara), Baria, Bansda,
Sant, Cambayldar, Jawhar
Vijaynagar Sachin, Radhan-
pur, Palanpur, Jambughoda.,
Surgana, Tharad, Bhaderwa,
Mohanpur, Malpur, Mansa,
Wao, Khadal, Ghodasar
Vasna, Katosan, Sudasna,
Valasna, Ranasanjarsoda,
Ambahara, Punadra, llol,
Sanjeli.

and Kolhapur

The

Tenancy and
Agricultural
Lands Act,
1948 (Bom.
LXVII of
1948.)

The Bombay
Tenancy
Agricultural
Lands Act,
1948 (Bom.
LXVII of
1948).

In column 4 of the Schedule annexed to #ut,—

(a) In section 3-Aof the BombayTenancyAct referred to therein
for the words and figures “the eighth day of November 1947”
the words and figures “the eleventh dayAafgust 1949” shall
be substituted.

(b) In the proviso to sub-sectiofl) of section 4 of the Bombay
TenancyAct referred to therein, reference to “section 9 of
the Bombay Small Holders Reliéfct, 1938” shall be read as
reference to “any enactment corresponding to section 9 of
the Bombay Small Holders Reliéfct, 1938, if anyin any of
the States”.

(c) In the proviso to sub-sectiori)( of section 4 of the Bombay
TenancyAct referred to therein, for the words and figures
“the eighth day of November 1946” the words and figures
“the eighth day ofAugust 1948” shall be substituted.

(d) In sub-section(2) of section 4 of the BombayenancyAct
referred to therein—

(1) for the words and figures “the eighth day of November 1946”
the words and figures “the eleventh dayAafgust 1948” shall
be substituted,;

(2) for the words and figures “31st day of May 1947” occurring
in sub-clausgb)(i), the words and figures “31st day of May
1949” shall be substituted.

(3) for the words and figures “1st day of June 1947” occurring in
sub-clause(b)(ii), the words and figures “1st day of June 1949”
shall be substituted.

In column 4 of the Schedule annexed to #ut,—

(a) In section 3-Aof the BombayTenancyAct referred to therein,
for the words and figures “the eighth day of November 1947”
the words and figures “the first day of May 1950” shall be
substituted.

(b) In the proviso to sub-sectiofl) of section 4 of the Bombay
TenancyAct referred to therein, reference to “section 9 of
the Bombay Small Holders Reliéfct, 1938", shall be read as
reference to “any enactment corresponding to section 9 of
the Bombay Small Holders Reliéfct, 1938, if any in the
State”.

(c) In the proviso to sub-sectior{l) of section 4 of the Bombay
TenancyAct referred to therein, for the words and figures
“the eighth day of November 1946” the words and figures
“the first day of May 1949” shall be substituted.

(d) In sub-section(2) of section 4 of the BombayenancyAct
referred to therein,—

(1) for the words and figures “the eighth day of November 1946”
the words and figures “the first day of May 1949” shall be
substituted;

(2) for the words and figures “31st day of May 1947” occurring
in sub-clausgb)(i), the words and figures “31st day of May
1949” shall be substituted;

(3) for the words and figures “1st day of June 1947” occurring in
sub-clausgb)(ii), the words and figures “ 1st day of June 1949”
shall be substituted.




1950 : Bom. V]

Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. 11

Enactments

@)

Names of States Amendments

@ ®)

The BombayAgricul-
tural Debtors Relief
Act, 1947 (Bom.
XXVIII of 1947).

Akalkot,  Aundh, Bhor (1) In section 2—

Jamkhandi, Jath, Kurundwad (a) (i) In clause (2),“Co-operative Society” shall mean a

(Sr.), Kurundwad (1), Miraj society registered under any of the provisions corresponding to

(Sr.), Miraj (Jr) Mudhol, those contained in the Bombay Co-operative Sociétis 1925,

Phaltan, Ramdurg, Sangli, or a society registered under the sai.

Savanuy SawantwadiWadi- (i) in clause (5)(a)for the figures, letters and word “30th  Janu-

Jagir, Janjira, Dharampur, ary 1940” wherever they occur, the figures, letters and word

Balasinor, Chhota-Udepur, «1st January 1948” shall be substituted;

Lunawada, Rajpipla (includ- (p) for the words “the date of the coming into operation of this

ing Segbara), Baria, Bansda, act or the establishment of the Board concerned under the

Sant, Cambayldar, Jawhar  eneqledact,” wherever they occur the words, figures and letters

Vijaynagar Sachin, Radhan-  «pe 15¢h day of September 1948” shall be substituted.

pur, Palanpur, Jambughoda,(z) In section 4, for sub-sectionl) the following shall be

Surgana, Tharad, Bhaderwa, substituted, namely :— “(1Any debtor ordinarily residing in

yvggan?(ur:é(x?lpuéhgﬂ;;;:f any local area or his creditor may make an application on or
! ! before the 15th June 1949 to the Court for the adjustment of his

Vasna, Katosan, Sudasna, debts”.

Xalasna, Ranasanarsoda, (3) In section 7, for the figures, letters and word “1st January

mbahara, Punadra, llol, N ) p »
Sanjeli. 1938_ the figures, letters and word “1st January 1948"shall be
substituted.

(4) In section 22, the following proviso shall be added at the end,
namely :

“Provided further that where any amount due to a creditor is
determined by a competent tribunal or authority under any law
in force in any of the States relating to the conciliation or
adjustment of the debts of agriculturists corresponding to this
Act, the amount so determined shall be binding on the parties”.

(5) In section 23, in the proviso, after the figures “1879” the
words “or any enactment corresponding thereto” shall be
inserted.

(6) In section 24, sub-sectior?), for the figures, letters and
word “1stAugust 1947” the figures, letters and word “16th June
1949” shall be substituted.

(7) In section 25,—

(a) in clause () the words and figures “or by a Board estab-
lished under section 4 of the repealkett” shall be deleted:

(b) in clause i) for the figures, letters and words “15th day
of February 1939” the figures, letters and word “ 1st Janu-
ary 1948" shall be substituted.

(8) In section 32, sub-sectiorR)-

(i) for clause(c) the following clause shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(c) loans given by resource societies or by persons authorised
to advance loans under section 54 for the financing of
crops or for seasonal finance”.

(if) in the Explanation the words “under the repeaked”
and the words “ under thiact” shall be deleted.

(9) In section 56, for the words “date of the coming into opera-
tion of thisAct” the figures letters and word “15th June 1949”
and for the words and figures “the DekkhAgriculturists”
Relief Act, 1879” the words and figures “any enactment
corresponding to the Dekkhaxgriculturists, ReliefAct, 1879,
in force in any of the States” shall be substituted.




12 Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. [1950: Bom. 1V
Enactments Names of States Amendments
@ @ (€)

The Bombay
Agricultural
Debtors Relief
Act, 1947
(Bom. XXVIII
of 1947).

(10) In section 56, in sub-section (1)—

(i) for the words and figures “the Dekkh&wgriculturists’ Relief
Act, 1879, by the Bombapgricultural Debtors ReliefAct,
1939, the first mentionedct”, the words and figures “any
enactment corresponding to the Dekkh¥griculturists’ Re-
lief Act, 1879, in force in any of thet&es, such enactment”
shall be substituted,;

(ii) the words and brackets “with effect from the date of the
coming into operation of thidct (hereinafter in this section
referred to as the said date” ) shall be deleted;

(iii) for the words “for the period of three years from the said
date” the words, figures and letters “up to the 26th day of May
1950” shall be substituted;

(iv) for the first proviso the following shall be substituted,
namely :—

“Provided that any proceeding in or out of any suit
instituted on or before the 26th May 1950 shall be continued
and disposed of after the said date, as if the enactment
corresponding to the Dekkhaxgriculturists’ Relief Act, 1879,
had continued in force after the said date.”.

Kolhapur (1) In section 2,—

(i) in clause(2), “Co-operative Society “shall mean a society
registered under any of the provisions corresponding to those
contained in the Bombay Co-operative Sociefdes, 1925, or
a society registered under the said;

(ii) in clause(5)—

(a) for the figures, letters and word “30th January 1940”
wherever they occur, the figures, letters and word “1st January
1949” shall be substituted;

(b) for the words “the date of the coming into operation of
this Act or of the establishment of the Board concerned under
the repealed\ct” wherever they occurthe words, figures and
letters “the 1st May 1949” shall be substituted.

(2) In section 4, for sub-sectiofl) the following shall be substi-
tuted namely :—

“(1) Any debtor ordinarily residing in any local area or his
creditor may make an application before the 31st October
1949 to the Court for the adjustment of his debts :

Provided that any debtor ordinarily residing in any of the
villages of Mososhi, Soliwadé&ngale and Mosam forming part
of the RajapurTaluka of the Ratnagiri District or any creditor
of such debtor may make an application on or before the 31st
August 1950 to the Court for the adjustment of his debts.

(3) In section 7, for the figures, letters and word “lst January 1938"
the figures, letters and word “1st January 1949” shall be substituted.
(4) In section 22, the following proviso shall be added at the end,
namely :—
“Provided further that where any amount due to a creditor is
determined by a competent tribunal Authority under any
law in force in the Kolhapur State relating to the conciliation
or adjustment of the debts of the agriculturists corresponding
to this Act, the amount so determined shall be binding on the
parties”.




1950 : Bom. V]

Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. 13

Enactments

@)

Names of States Amendments

@ ©)

(5) In section 23, in the proviso, after the figures “1879” the words
“or any enactment corresponding thereto” shall be inserted.

(6) In section 24, in sub-sectior2)(—

(i) for the figures, letters and word “1&ugust 1947” the figures,
letters and word “31st October 1949” shall be substituted;

(ii) after the words “ transfer in the nature of a mortgage” the
following proviso shall be inserted—

“Provided that any agricultural labourer ordinarily residing in any
of the villages of Mososhi, SoliwadAngale and Mosam form-
ing part of the Rajapufaluka of the Ratnagiri District may
make such application on or before the 3Asgust 1950".

(iii) before the words “On hearing the application” the brackets
and figure “(3)” shall be inserted.

(7) In section 25,—

(i) in clause (), the words and figure “or by a Board established
under section 4 of the repealédt” shall be deleted;

(ii) in clause if), for the figures, letters and words “15th day of
February 1939”, the figures, letters and word “1st January
1949” shall be substituted.

(8) In section 32, in sub-sectio2)(—

(i) for clause ¢), the following clause shall be substituted,
mainly :—

“) loans given by resource societies or by persons authorised
to advance loans under section 54 for the financing of crops
or for seasonal finance”.

(ii) in the Explanation the words “under the repeated” and
the words “ under thig\ct”, shall be deleted.

(9) In section 56, in sub-sectiol)(—

(i) for the words and figures “the Dekkh&wgriculturists’ Relief
Act, 1879, by the Bombapgricultural Debtors ReliefAct,
1939, the first mentionedct” the words “any enactment
corresponding to the Dekkhagriculturists’ Relief Act, 1879,
in force in the Kolhapur State, such enactment” shall be substi-
tuted.

(ii) the words and brackets “with effect from the date of the
coming into operation of thidct (hereinafter in this section
referred to as the said date)” shall be deleted;

(iii) for the words “ for a period of three years from the said date”
the words, figures and letters “up to the 26th day of May
1950” shall be substituted;

(iv) for the first proviso the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely :—

“Provided that any proceeding in or out of any suit instituted
on or before the 26th May 1950 shall be continued and
disposed of after the said date, as if the enactment
corresponding to the Dekkhakgriculturists’ Relief Act,
1879, had continued in force after the said date”.




14 Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. [1950: Bom. 1V

Enactments Names of States Amendments

@ @ ©)

The Bombay Baroda and Danta. In column 4 of the Schedule annexed to #ftot,—
Tenancy and (a) in section 3Aof the BombayTenancyAct referred to therein
Agricultural for the words and figures “the eighth day of November 1947
Lands Act, the words and figures” the first day Afigust 1950” shall be
1948 (Bom. substituted;
LXVII of (b) in the proviso to sub-sectiorl)( of section 4 of the Bombay
1948). TenancyAct referred to therein, reference to “section 9 of the

Bombay Small Holders RelieAct, 1938” shall be read as
reference to “ any enactment corresponding to section 9 of
the Bombay Small Holders Religfct, 1938, if any in the
State”.

(c) in the proviso to sub-sectiori)( of section 4 of the Bombay
TenancyAct referred to therein, for the words and figures
“the eighth day of November 1946” the words and figures “the
first day of August 1949” shall be substituted;

(d) in sub-section ) of section 4 of the BombayenancyAct
referred to therein—

(1) for the words and figures “the eighth day of November
1946” the words and figures “ the first day Afigust 1949”
shall be substituted,

(2) for the words and figures “31st day of May 1947"
occur ring in sub-clauseb(i) the words and figures “31st
day of May 1950” shall be substituted,

(3)for the words and figures “1st day of June 1947” occurring
in sub-clauseh)(ii), the words and figures “1st day of June
1950” shall be substituted.

The Bombay Baroda and Danta. (1) In section 2—
Agricultural (i) in clause(2), “Co-operative Society” shall mean a society
Debtors Relief registered under any of the provisions corresponding to
Act, 1947 those contained in the Bombay Co-operative Societies
(Bom. XXVIII Act, 1925, or a society registered under the gait]
of 1947). (i) in clause (5)—

(a) for the figures, letters and word “30th January 1940”
wherever they occur the figures, letters and word “1st
January 1949” shall be substituted;

(b) the words “or the establishment of the Board concerned
under the repealeAct” wherever they occurshall be
deleted.

(2) In section 4, for sub-sectionl), the following shall be
substituted, namely :—

“(1) Any debtor ordinarily residing in any local area or his
creditor may make an application on or before the 31st
January 1950 to the Court for adjustment of this debts”.

(3) In section 7, for the figures, letters and word “lst January
1938". the figures, letters and word “1st January 1949” shall
be substituted.

(4) In section 22, the following proviso shall be added at the end,
namely :—

“Provided further that where any amount due to a creditor
is determined by a competent tribunal or authority under any
law in force in the Baroda or Danta State relating to the
conciliation or adjustment of the debts of the agriculturists
corresponding to thigct, the amount so determined shall be
binding on the parties”.

(5) In section 23 in the proviso after the figures “1879” the
words “or any enactment corresponding thereto” shall be
inserted.




1950 : Bom. V]

Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. 15

Enactments

@)

Names of States Amendments

@ ®)

The Bombay
Rents, Hotel
and Lodging
House Rates
Control Act,
1947 (Bom.
LVII of 1947).

(6) In section 24, in sub-sectio)( for the figures, letters and word
“1st August, 1947” the figures and word “ 1st February 1950” shall
be substituted.

(7) In section 25—

(i) in clause i), the words and figures “or by a Board established
under section 4 of the repeal@dt” shall be deleted,

(ii) in clause if), for the figures letters and words “15th day of
February 1939” the figures, letters and word “1st January 1949”
shall be substituted.

(8) In section 32, in sub-sectior2)(—

(i) for clause ¢€), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:—

“(c) loans given by resource societies or by persons
authorised to advance loans under section 54 for the financing
of crops or for seasonal finance”;

(ii) in the Explanation, the words “under the repeated’ and
the words “under thigct;” shall be deleted.

(9) In section 56, in sub-sectiorl)(—

(i) for the words and figures “the Dekkha&mgriculturists Relief
Act, 1879, by the Bombaggricultural Debtors’Relief Act,
1939, the first mentionedct”, the words “any enactment
corresponding to the Dekkhagriculturists’ Relief Act, 1879,
in force in the State” shall be substituted,;

(ii) the words and brackets “with effect from the date of coming
into operation of thidAct (hereinafter in this section referred
to as the said date)” shall be deleted;

(iii) for the words “for a period of three years from the said date”
the words, figures and letters “up to the 26th day of May
1950” shall be substituted;

(iv) for the first proviso, the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:—

“Provided that any proceeding in or out of any suit
instituted on or before the 26th May 1950 shall be continued
and disposed of after the said date, as if the enactment
corresponding to the Dekkhaxgriculturists’ Relief Act, 1879,
had continued in force after the said date.”

Baroda. (1) For clause (10) of section 5 the following shall be
substituted :—

“(10) “specified date” means—

(a) in the case of any premises let for the purpose of
residence, the first day of January 1943, and

(b) in the case of any premises let for non-residential
purposes, the first day of January 1944.

(10-A) “Standard rent” in relation to any premises let for the
purpose of residence or for non-residential purpose means—
(a) where the standard rent is fixed by the Controller under
the House Rent Control Order, 1947, made by the Baroda
Government, such standard rent, or
(b) where the standard rent is not so fixed, subject to the
provisions of section II—

J-1079-3



16 Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. [1950: Bom. 1V

Enactments Names of States Amendments

@ @ ©)

(i) the rent at which the premises were let on the specified date, or

(i) where they were not let on the specified date the rent at which
they were last let before that date, or

(iii) where they were first let after the specified date, the rent at
which they were first let, or

(iv) in any of these cases specified in section 11, the rent fixed by the
Court :
Provided that an increase in rent made in operation immediately
before the 30th day of July 1949, in accordance with the provision
of the said House Rent Control Order 1947, shall be deemed to be
included in the standard rent;”.

(2) In sections 7, 1 and 18 of the saiAct, for the words and figures
“the first day of September, 1940” wherever they occur, the words

“the specified date” shall be substituted.
* * *

1% * *
2% * * * * *
The Bombay Kolhapur State inclusive of
Sugar-cane Cess Jahagirs within the limits of the
Act, 1948 said State.
(Bom. LXXXII
of 1948).
The Bombay Alalkot. Kurund- Ramdurg.
Sugar-cane Cess Aundh.  wad (Jr).

For the words and figures “first day of January 1948” in section 15 of
the saidAct, the words and figures “first day of March 1949” shall
be substituted.

In section 15, for the words and figures “first day of January 1948”
the word and figures “23rd March 1948” shall be substituted.

Act, 1948 Bhor. Miraj Sangli.

(Bom. LXXXII Jam (Sr) Savanur-

of 1948). Khandi. Miraj Sawant-
Jath. @r) wadi.

Kurund- Mudhol Wadi
wad (Sr). Phaltan. Jagir
The Bombay Janjira
Sugar-cane Cess
Act, 1948
(Bom. LXXXII
of 1948).
The Bombay Ambaliara. Palanpur
Sugar-cane Cess Balasinor Punadra.

In section 15, for the words and figures “first day of January 1948”
the word and figures “14tApril 1948” shall be substituted.

In section 15, for the words and fiures “first day of January 1948” the
word and figures “28th May 1948” shall be substituted.

Act, 1948 Bansda. Radhanpur

(Bom. LXXXII  Baria. Rajpipla.

of 1948). Bhaderwa. (including
Cambay Segbara).
Chhota- Ranasan.
Udepur Sachin.
Dharampur Sanijeli.
Ghodasar  Sant.
Idar. Sudasna.
llol. Surgana.
Jambughoda. Tharad.
Jawhar Valasna.
Katosan. Varsoda.
Khadal. Vasna.
Lunawada. Vijayanagar
Malpur. Wao.
Mansa.
Mohanpur

The entry relating to the Bombay Primary Educatfct, 1947 (Bom. LXI of 1947), was deleted by Bom . 46 of
1950, s. 2.
2All the entries relating to the Bombay SalEsx Act, 1946, were repealed by Bom. 24 of 1952, s.(47



Replacement Series No VI p. 130

1950 : Bom. V] Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. 17
Enactments Names of States Amendments
@ @ ©)
The  Bombay Danta. In section 15, for the words and figures “first day of
Sugar-cane Cess January 1948” the word and figures “4th November
Act, 1948 1948” shall be substituted.
(Bom. LXXXII
of 1948).
Th? _ Bombay Baroda. (1) After section 74, the following section shall be
District  Mu- inserted, namely :—
nicipal Act,
1901 (Bom. Il “74A. The State Government may at any time Bgwer of
of 1901). order in writing withdraw any exemption fronfovernment

or concession in respect of, any tax granted@dvithdraw

any person by the Government of the for exrﬁ‘r:nepstslti);lnfm
Baroda $ate by an order issued under the ‘&anted in
Class MunicipalitiesAct (BarodaAct No. XII of respect of

1949)."] taxes.
2[(2)] In section 91A—

(i) after sub-section(2), the following shall be
inserted, namely :(—

“(2A) It shall be the duty of every
Municipality to maintain every regular line of
the public street prescribed or sanctioned by the
Government of the former Baroda State at any
time prior to the 30th day of July 1949 :

Provided that the Municipality may alter or
cancel any such regular line if having regard to
the needs of traffic.

(a) it was before the aforesaid date classified by the
Municipality, with the sanction of the Govern-
ment of the former Baroda State, as unimpor-
tant, or

(b) it is so classified by the Municipality with the
sanction of the State Government within two

Bom. years from the commencement of the Bombay
XXX Merged Sates (Laws) (Secondmendment)
of 1951. Act 1951.”

(ii) in sub-section (3), the following shall be added
at the end, namely :(—

“Explanation.—For the purposes of this
section, ‘the regular line of the public street’
shall include a regular line of public street
prescribed or sanctioned by the Government of
the former Baroda State at any time prior to the
30th day of July 1949."]

! This entry was inserted by Bom. 12 of 1952, gap
2 This entry which was inserted by Bom. 32 of 1951, $AR was renumbered g2) by Bom. 12 of 1952, s. fa).



18 Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. [1950: Bom. 1V

Enactments Names of States Amendments

@ @ ©)

The Bombay Baroda—eontd. (3)] After section 180 of the Bombay District Municipal
District Municipal Act, 1901 (Bom. Il of 1901), the following section shall be
Act, 1901 (Bom. llI inserted, namely :—

of 1901)—contd.

“180-A. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in the
foregoing provisions of thiéct, such rules, by-laws, orders
made, issued or sanctioned by or in respect of any of the
Municipalities whether constituted under theClass Munici-
palities Act (Baroda No. Xl of 1949) or the B Class Munici-
palitiesAct (Baroda No. XIVof 1949) of the former Baroda
State (hereinafter called “the said Municipalities” and “the
said Baroda Municipalitief\cts” respectively) as were in force
immediately before the 30th day of July 1949 under the said
Baroda MunicipalitiesActs, shall in so far as they are consis-
tent with the provisions of the Bombay District Municipal
Act, 1901 (Bom. Il of 1901), shall be deemed to have been
made, issued or sanctioned by or in respect of the said Munici-
palities under the appropriate provisions of the gation the
said date and continue in force until altered, repealed or amended
by a competent authority

(2) All references to the Baroda Government or to any
Officer of the Baroda Government in any such rules, by-laws
or orders shall be construed as references to the Government
of Bombay or the corresponding officer of the Government
of Bombay as the case may be; and all licenses, permits or
permission issued or given under any such rules, by-laws
or orders shall also continue in force until superseded or
modified by a competent authority

[The Bombay Baroda—eontd. 2[(Al) After section 4, the following section shall be

Municipal Boroughs inserted, namely :—

Act, 1925 (Bom.

XVIII of 1925). Inclusion of “4A. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in thist
certain industrial or the Bombay District Municipafct, 1901 (hereinafteBom.
areas in Baroda referred to as the District Municipdlct) the area known a$ll of
Municipal area the Industrial Zone to the north of tidembie Chemicall901.
from 1stAugust Works Co. Limited, and the area covered by the said Chemical
19409. Works, and described in Schedule |A, hereinafter referred to as

the said areas, shall be deemed to have been included within the
limits of the former Baroda Municipal District from the 1st
day of August 1949 to the 30th day éfril 1950 (both inclu-

sive) and within the limits of the Baroda Municipal Borough
with effect from the 1st day May 1950.

This entry was renumbered by Bom. 12 of 1952, §a)2
2This portion was inserted by Bom. 32 of 1951, B2
SEntries (A1) and (A2) were inserted by Bom. 21 of 1953, s. 2.



Replacement SeriesNo VI p. 131
1950 : Bom. V] Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. 19

Enactments Names of States Amendments

@ @ ©)

The Bombay Munici- Baroda (2) Any appointment, notification, notice, order,
pal BoroughsAct, Scheme, licence, permission, rule, by-law or form or any tax
1925 (Bom. XVIII made, issued or imposed or purported to have been made
of 1925)—contd. issued or imposed and anything done or purported to have

been done in respect of any such appointment, notification,
notice, order scheme, licence, permission, rule, by-ldarm

or tax, under the District MunicipaAct or this Act, in
respect of the said areas, in so far as such appointment,
notification, notice, order, scheme, licence, permission,
rule, by-law form, tax or thing is not inconsistent with the
provisions of the District Municipalct or thisAct, as the
case may be, shall be legal and valid and shall be deemed to
have been legal and valid in respect of the said areas from
the dates on which it was made, issued, imposed or done, as
the case may be and shall continue in force unless and until
it is superseded by any other appointment, notification,
notice, order scheme, licence, permission, rule, by-ldarm

or tax made, issued or imposed or anything done under
this Act.”.

1(A2) After Schedule I, the following Schedule shall be
inserted, namely :—

SCHEDULE IA.

Beginning from the East-South corner of Survey No. 104
of the Subhanpura village and going along the
northern boundary of Survey Nos. 105, 102, 106, 149, 150,
156/1 and 157, then crossing the road and starting from the
South-West Corner of Survey No. 94, going in North along
the village site boundaries of the village Subhanpura up to
Survey No. 92 and going through Survey Nos. 1107, 1108,
1109, 1116, 1117, 1118, 1123, 1168, 22, 21, 17 and 18 of the
Gorwa village then turning to East and going through Survey
Nos. 19 and 20, then crossing the road going along the Gorwa
village site boundary up to South-East corner then crossing
the road and turning North and going in the North along
the Western boundary of the road passing by the Gorwa
village site, then passing through Survey Nos. 1, 2,
626, 627, 628 and 624 up to the Northern
end of the Industrial area, then turning East and
coming up to the North-@st corner of Survey No. 624
in the Industrial area and then walking along the
northern limit of the road and then passing through Survey

!Entries (A1) and (A2) were inserted by Bom. 21 of 1953, s.2.



20 Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act. [1950: Bom. 1V

Enactments Names of States

@) @

Amendments

©)

The Bombay Mu- Baroda
nicipal Boroughs

Act, 1925 (Bom.

XVIII of 1925)

—contd.

Power of
Government
to withdraw
exemption or
concession
granted in
respect of
taxes.

Nos. 624 and 628, crossing the road and passing through
Survey Nos.700, 699, 698, 694, 695 760, 761, 759, 758,
766, 767, 754 and 768 up to the North-East corner of the
Industrial zone in Survey No. 769, then turning South and
going along the eastern boundary of Survey Nos. 753, 752,
751, 1014/1, 1013, 10111/1, 1010/1, 1009, 1007/1-2, 1006,
1005/1-2, 1004, 1003/1, 1001, 1000 and 999 and then
walking along the Railway siding of tiidembic Chemical
Works up to its junction with the main lines, then turning
to theWest and reaching the southern boundary of Survey
No. 984 of Gorwa village and walking along the eastern
boundary of Survey Nos. 627, 626, 625 and 624 up to its
South-East corner and then turniwgst and walking along

its southern boundary and reaching SoutéstWcorner of
Survey No. 623 and then turning towards North along the
boundaries of Survey Nos. 623 and 622 and then crossing
the road and reaching the South-East corner of Survey No.
1084 of Gorwa village and turning to tiWgest along the
souhtern boundaries of Survey Nos. 1084, 1085, 1088,
1091 and 1092 reaching to the main road of the Industrial
zone.”]

1[(1) After section 103, the following section shall be
inserted, namely :—

“103A. The State Government may at any time by
order in writing withdraw any exemption from, or any
concession in respect of, any tax granted to any person by
the Government of the former Baroda State by an order
issued under the “A” Class Municipalitiésct (BarodaAct
No. XIl of 1949)."]

2[(2)] In section 118,,—

(i) after sub-section2) the following shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(2A) It shall be the duty of every municipality toain-
tain every regular line of the public street prescribed or
sanctioned by the Government of the former Baroda State
at any time prior to the 30th day of July 1949 :”

This entry was inserted by Bom. 12 of 1952, gbp
2The brackets and figure “(2)” were insertebid.



Replacement SeriesNo I X p. 122
1950 : Bom. V]

Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

21

Names of States

@

Enactments

@)

Amendments

©)

The Bombay Munici- Baroda
pal Boroughs Act,
1925 (Bom. XVIII

of 1925)—contd.

Bom. XXXII
of 1951.

IThe Bombay All merged States
Medical Practitio-

ners Act, 1938

(Bom. XXVI of

1938).

The Bombay All merged States

Medical Act, 1912
(Bom. VI of 1912).

section 7, every person—

XXVII of
1933.

Provided that the mmicipality may alter or cancel any
such regular line if having regard to the needs of
traffic—

(a) it was before the aforesaid date classified
by the municipality with the sanction of the
Government of the former Baroda State, as
unimportant, or

(b) it is so classified by the municipality with the
sanction of the State Government within two years
from the commencement of the Bombay Merged States
(Laws) (SecondAmendment)Act, 1951.”

(ii) in sub-section (3), the following shall be added
at the end, namely :(—

“Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,
“the regular line of the public street” shall include a
regular line of public street prescribed or sanctioned
by the Government of the former Baroda State at any
time prior to the 30th day of July 1949".]

In sub-section (3) of section 1, the following
proviso shall be added at the end, namely :—

“Provided that in all merged States, Part Il shall
come into force on such date as may be specified by
the State Government by notification in tldficial
Gazettein this behalf, notwithstanding the fact that
the aforesaid period of two years or five years, as the
case may be, may not have expired from the date on
which Parts | and Il may have come into force in any
area forming part of the said State.”]

After section 8, the following new section shall be
inserted, namely :—

“8A. Notwithstanding anything contained inRegistra-
tion of

medical
(a) whose name, immediately before the date @fracti-

memer of the &ate with the Ste of Bombaystood tioners
registered as a medical practitioner in the register gfgis-
medical practitioners maintained under any law faered in
the time being in force in the merged State; and. merged
States.

(b) who holds any of the qualifications specified
in the Schedule to the Indian Medical Counkit,
1933, or thisAct, shall be deemed to be a medical
practitioner registered under thigt.

This entry was added by Bom. 44 of 1950, s. 2.
2These entries were added by Bom. 21 of 1951, s.2.



22 Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

[1950: Bom. 1V

Enactments Names of States

@) @

Amendments

©)

The Bombay All merged States
Medical Act,

1912 (Bom.
VI of 1912)
—contd.

The Bombay All merged States
Medical Prac-

titioners’ Act, . .
Registration of

1938 (Bom. : )
XXVI of persons rzglstere
1938). in merged States.

Registration of
other persons
registered in
merged States.

! [The Bombay All merged States
Local Boards

Act, 1923
(Bom. VI of
1923).

(2) If any question arises whether any person is deemed
to be a registered medical practitioner under sub-sectipn (
the matter shall be referred to the Surgeon General with the
Government of Bombay for decision and his decision shall be
final.”

(1) After section 17, the following new section shall be
inserted, namely :—

“17A. (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in
section 16, every practitioner, whose name immediately
before the date of merger of the State with the State of
Bombay stood registered as a practitioner in the register
of practitioners maintained under any law for the time
being in force in the merged State corresponding to this
Act shall be deemed to be a practitioner registered under
this Act.

(2) If any question arises whether any person is
deemed to be a registered practitioner under sub-section
(1), the matter shall be referred to the Surgeon General
with the Government of Bombay for decision and his
decision shall be final”.

(2) After section 18, the following new section shall be
inserted, namely :—

“18-1A. (1) Any person other than the one
specified in section 84f the Bombay Medicalct, 1912, Bom.
or section 17Aof this Act, whose name immediatelyV! of
before the date of the merger of the State with the stdRl2-
of Bombay stood registered in the register maintained
under any law for the time being in force corresponding
to either of the aforesaiélcts shall be entered in the list.

(2) If any question arises whether a person is entitled
to have his name entered in the list under sub-sectipn (
the matter shall be referred to the Surgeon General with
the Government of Bombay for decision and his decision
shall be final.]

To section 93, the following sub-section shall be added,

namely :—

“(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sec-
tion (1), the Sate Government mayaving regard to the
standard rate of assessment in any area, by notification
in the Official Gazettedirect that no cess shall be levied
in such area for such pariod or that the cess shall be levied
in such area for such period at such lower rate, as may be
specified in the notification”.]




1950 : Bom. V] Maharashtra Merged States (Laws) Act.

FOURTH SCHEDULE
1. The Agricultural BanksAct, 1924 (Barodact XVIII of 1924).

2. The CasteTyranny Removalct, 1933 (Barodact LV of 1933).
3. The Kolhapur Hill &tion Act, 1945 (Kolhapuiict LXII of 1945).

4. The Sawantwadi Prevention of MalaAat, 1947.
FIFTH SCHEDULE

|
Enactments
The Government Loan Rules, 1931
TheWatan Rules, 1932
1% * * *
The HinduAct, 1937 (XXXVII of 1937)

The Maharaja Sayajirao University of Baroda
Act, 1949 (XVII of 1949) as amended by the

Baroda $ate (Application of Laws) Ordget949.

The Okha Port Rules
The Rules (Digest) of Hindu La#920

Names of States.

Baroda.
Baroda.
*

Baroda.

Baroda.

Baroda.

Kolhapur

23

The entry relating to the Dabhel Simlak Madressa, 1941 (Il of 1941) was repealed by Bom. 45 of 1955, §1)2

J-1079-4



CENTRAL JAIL PRESS, NAGPUR

CJPN (J-1079)--9-2013--3,277 bks./13 lvs.--PR 8*



M ahar ashtra Gover nment Publications
can be obtained from--

*THE DIRECTOR
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS
Maharashtra State
Netaji Subhash Road, MUMBAI-400 004.
PHoNE : 23632693 23630695
23631148 23634049
* THE MANAGER
GOVERNMENT PHOTOZINCO PRESS AND Book DEPoT
Photozinco Press Area, Near G. P. O.
PUNE—411001.
PHoNE : 26 12 58 08 2612 8920 202 58 22

*THE MANAGER
GOVERNMENT PRrRESS AND Book DEepor
Civil Lines
NAGPUR—440 001.
PHONE : 256 26 15

*THE ASSISTANT DIRECTOR
GOVERNMENT STATIONERY, STORE AND Book DEpoT
Shaha Ganj, Near Gandhi Chowk
AURANGABAD-431 001.
PHONE : 233 14 68

*THE MANAGER
GOVERNMENT PRESS AND STATIONERY STORE
Tarabai Park
KOLHAPUR---416 003.
PHoNE :265 03 95 26504 02

AND THE RECOGNISED BOOK SELLERS




