
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 1, 2025/{ÉÉè¹É 11, ¶ÉEäò 1946 1

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. VII OF  2025.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 1st January 2025).

An Act further to amend the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and
Cash Grants Act, 1954.

WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session ;

AND WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that
circumstances existed which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate
action further to amend the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants
Act, 1954 for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; and, therefore, promulgated
the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants (Amendment) Ordinance,
2024 on the 24th September 2024 ;

Hyd. Act
No. VIII
of 1955.

Mah.
Ord.

VIII of
2024.

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö-7--1

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 11, +ÆEòú 1(7)] ¤ÉÖvÉ´ÉÉ®ú, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 1, 2025/{ÉÉè¹É 11, ¶ÉEäò 1946 [{ÉÞ¹ ä̀ 2,  ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä  27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 7

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ
¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants (Amendment)
Act, 2024 (Mah. Act VII of 2025), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

SATISH  WAGHOLE,
Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

RNI  No. MAHENG /2009/35528

(1)



2 ¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÉxÉä́ ÉÉ®úÒ 1, 2025/{ÉÉè¹É 11, ¶ÉEäò 1946

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Ordinance, by an
Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in the Seventy-fifth Year of
the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and
Cash Grants (Amendment) Act, 2024.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 24th September
2024.

2. In section 2A  of the Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants
Act, 1955 (hereinafter referred to as “the principal Act”), to
sub-section (3), the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“ Provided that, where in exceptional cases, upon complaints
regarding legality of decision of officer under sub-section (1), the State
Government is satisfied that it is necessary to examine the legality,
propriety or regularity of such orders even after expiry of the period of
one year, the State Government or the Divisional Commissioner
authorised by it, may exercise such powers after expiry of the said
period.”.

3. In section 6 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3),—

(1) in clause (a),—

(a) in the first proviso, for the words “fifty per cent.”,  the words
“five per cent.” shall be substituted ;

(b) in the second proviso, for the words “fifty per cent. of the
current market value of such land”,  at both the places where they
occur, the words “five per cent. of the current market value of such
land” shall be substituted ;

(2) in clause (b), in the proviso, for the words “fifty per cent.”, the
words “five per cent.” shall be substituted.

4. (1) The Hyderabad Abolition of Inams and Cash Grants
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2024, is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
provisions of the principal Act, as amended by the said Ordinance, shall be
deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the case may be, under the
corresponding provisions of the principal Act, as amended by this Act.

Short title and
commencement.

Amendment
of section 2A

of Hyd. Act
No. VIII of

1955.

Hyd. Act
No. VIII
of 1955.

Amendment
of section 6 of
Hyd. Act No.
VIII of 1955.

Repeal of
Mah. Ord.

VIII of 2024
and saving.

Mah.
Ord. VIII
of 2024.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.


