RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/31732

Y 9, 31k ¢ ] THAR T FYAR, Ao ¥-20, R038/ THlfdeh 23-2%, Ih 2R%¥3  [Usd 28, fohmar: ®U .00

WTTerehe UehTIT

TERTSE ITHAT Shsid ST raHi~ara q&r Sheter (9T Ueh, Ueh- 37 JATIUT Ueh—oT ATHER
Ufag el o T 3TeyT Aicafaier) fam o e

Taa fawmT

TG HTHT A, EATHT TS =,
AT, HaTg Yoo 03, faieh ¢ Aedar 032,

Irferg==T

WATS Wi,

i TR 0§ /0,55, ¥4 & /HdT-¥,— TRATEAT HITETEAT 3TTEE 3 0% TAT WIehIGR Wal sholedT STfershi=n
AR Fe FERTT TITA, ATER, HERTG AR HalT ( Fgfererdar sTerTefeRton) =, 2<% AT S0 Femon
FRUATS Y& 7w i STed:—

9. a femig, Herrsg AR Har (e SRR ) (gErom) fom, 3032 310 w=ura,

2. WRRTE AN Har (Frafadare sfermeienion) fom, 2:¢% (1d Age s fHeer “qe fem” o7 shett
M) e faw 3 = dre-fam (2) we,—

(%) T (T) TEieT “qRard e I HeTerarkiess” a1 TSR “fhdr Hererss, @iar o smR” &
TR STTeT SREe hUaTd Jsel ST AT FeHaIeie SiIel TRaet huard STl 3T -uard Ao

(@) G () 7el,—
(TH) SU-TE (UH) TV IE;
(39) 3T-We () TefieT “of STHITATR” BT oIt M504 Jge.,

()




R TERTE I TASTIS, AT IR-37, THAR § AR, ARa ¥-20, 018 /aIldeh 23-2 R, Ieh 2¥3
3. oA frramien fam o we,—
(&) Tre-fram (2) Tl “Teh-garaisT” a1 HTHuasT “Hes <ok B HSTeh STt shiuaTd deat STITur
T feieh e TR R0 0] TH RETT VAT ST ST AU Isa;
(@) Te-fm (2) 9 Wieiiel ST THIfae SHauand Jgef —
9. — T, & ToFRaNT Ufeh Teurl 316,
(1) Ure -fam (R ) Wit “Teh-garaier” a1 HeTpuast ‘e eoh” 81 Aol SRl shudld Jgat ST
1 i R TgaT R0 0% YR JREET FUATA AT STEAT HIFUETT 95T
¥, A e (oM ¢ AR qeier e, Siel Sraet ShiuaTd J5at ST dl ferieh 30 7 R << TR STal areret
TG ST T TS0 J5e:
(W) “c3. fafaaaaren sioRmfiehd T g :-TTa-T hiu—
(2) (W) A1 T DI HHar=ar i ¢ ufiret ¢y AsH fehal &H®, 3t fAafaad-ran
T SR ShelT ST ST I HHETTATEIed, @i STYRTNERA sholell ST e Hef-gr
TR o ol ST, T U 3.
() TR SHHET T AT T STYRTe N ShelT T8 STIfOT eI TRt gy shreta
3.2 TffeT 2R ¢y TaT= qUf SHTeTa STa, TR Haheull fgfdera-rer STeRmeNgRd 9T foieh § Tt 2’y TR
T: quaTd A,
(R) SR Ure-am () 7o fHafaad=raT S{eRTefiehd shetell AT Y: foetT STUar qrf TRt
Tk AT aEReh FT-Uh Hefel 37T, Feiifaasican qot W fHafera S aawor Mfeehioneh e Het i,
(3) FafaaaTaReRT feAi® ¢ TreT 2.y ST fehal @R e TR FeRrT 9 qof shail
ST STIOT @R el Jog SeT, T ShIEe¥i aRd a@id, ferieh ¢ Wit ) ¢y IR fohar frrgiren

ARG TeRT Y ST ARG Ut STeiie, ATieh! S ol arie 2189e o aRaEurgH, fHafaadeamesren
= TRETI A qehaleh! [He30aT TahaR STEdie!. a1 ST, SRR aRaHT S@iet fafaad
oot WIS 37ST h¥dl Jsel.

(%) YR hetedn AAT Hifgdt Fafaad He STewd Sayd T8e 79N Sradd fHafddd
Hferaor wifkreRToT, o mfed!, ST eRaT s fAafaaa Wer STeT hiee &I @ oIl ST
T T B,

() frafaaa Gfaawoer miteor, sor aran i fAgfaeaT Tem oTeeT Fieet ST8e =
IR, T S 7o STIaqeAT STehd o TS aleul hUardTa! Fedeh a1 FehIur Hqof
TIRNE g1 feeted fHgfera-T= ehids Fhesala.

(&) S T4 TMEHT FHATHAT FIeIeh &l SUSHAMHE, TR Geie, T Seer
SIS HTTE Bdet STEe ST g faaraHTeaT Ush-gaiieT YR S{vRmeihd qed, a fafaadren
Teh-aATeT ST STORTSTR0T sheaHaR SaRd fgfiera-TeaT Wi PR qedsdeh sifaq ey
RRel e / TeRuarEr fashed faetell ST o T3 I ARt fHgfadaTeres oo 98
AR o AT TRIEI ST ShIUTATR! AT HesuaT FahaR STHUIR AR, ”;

() 2731 R STIeT SRaet heted oM ¢ 31 7e, —

(T ) re-fom () 7, W (&) A, Wielier TR THIfate Hvard Jgat 31 d fS. 3¢
T 238 0 IR WA el ST HIHUAT JgeT: —




HERTE I USTU, WRT IR -37, THAR o FEaR, AreRaw ¥-¢0, 0% /T 23-2 R, ITeh 2R%3 3

‘T TRTUT, — I S EI=T e Yaf-afae feriehaR fHafaaamraT 9T sierTefiehd et
ST 3TN dTedrd, e Agfaaa-Ter S, ST feiehlel SfeRTeiehd shetell STHe & feriehTarg JerT
o qof SRR T: Juard e,

(3 dre-fam (R ), ITesvard JEeT 0T AT 5.2 et 208 4 TR STEBUTT STEAT ST WU
REGE

(A1) dre-fR (&), AU J5t ST Al 3.6 W ]]\ TR NG STl ST A0
RECH

w. A framren e o1 W, Ieiet fem T Treel Shivard AgeT ST ot .8 W @] R\ U STIaT afae
FHIUATT ST ST WA g

“¢q. TSR & IUSHATTE fohal TareR Wi fohar Tenfe Hried Yo el e Haedmdy,
THIehH! 31 TR THIhRAA 3T ST YMHehid === aredrd, - feciean fHafadanren tw-gdrai
T SRR T AT GEROT U, - T8 AR HHATT Wi+ &5 SUshHmHe fehall Tama
ey foha Tenfer HRiTe, Tod: el HIHTeH SacaT-R, TohiehH! 3l Y TiehRetedT shHar=iea I
feeTean fgfaadmTean Ueh-qaraieT SaeaT MHT=AT ThHer FEROT I dedldes R shetedn fHofRgaR

o~

Sfraftra sevard Idrer.”
&, YA fami= e § = die-fam (3) 7o, —
(TH) T (T), AL SIS ‘TR T—GA” BT FSTehy 3Tl 3T d2del @Aarst “Hes fHafcaa-r=n <gr1

CHRRITEA" BT TSR Rl U A
(3F) TS (&), e <o 1 foantoft “SivR SU” BT FoTeht AT=AT SATehUTeh hhRIHE ST 318 T &
foahTolt @ISt “Hes fHafaad-T= ga1 eoh” AT AU WHRIHE ST HIvITd Jsal.

v, T famie fam o Hel,—

() forem WgehTga Ereiiel W TS HIvaTd deat ST e, & A 2R ¥ TR A v
3eT ST AU dsel:

TR fafafdredian Tug sheft 3Tiet 3Tfor eeAT=an fHufaR e fgfaedard gemon swoard et

ST ST eTaft TATaT e h0aTd el 3THA W, FHIRTdaTeRanH $osT Heiid shell 3THd ),

o genia sifow fafaaarT=an Th-garaie saean Haieqdd @ Sifad fgfaea-ren sieRmefewem=r

TR YR o A6 hUA df I Teret.”;

() 3T IR STaT GRAA cheledl W ehIed “Teh-Jarier” AT HeTgIuast ‘e eadh” BT ATt araa
THIOATA A ST T 1S, 39 T 0 0% TRI T hIUATT AT ST WU A5cT;

(T) TR FehR HHITTEE Sheledl TP Jeiet Teh STaT SRae] Shivdld Jsal: —

‘TR ST 3T o, FENIT o SR STGUTFER, WA, S[AeTal THTe, o= 30fid saet shell
ST Haferd MieehTaThs 3751 HIEX Yl Jgat. SR FHgaad-eReh, Tehr=T TS 375t hild J4a
fohar a vaer TEehRa T8 W, T, YO SIRTNROTAS! Segeh Al 1 fed sRuard 5. .

(=) Toemm wRawme, -
(TFR) “Ar” 1 ASTHUeS “ORq ST0RE] 3T hl” 2T HSTeh SRae Shiudrd Jeot:




¥ TERTSZ IITE SIS, AT ¥R-31, THaR o U, A@aT ¥-20, 303 /lideh 23-2 %, Teh 2743

(3 a1 =7 foehoft “SfeR 0" BT HSTehY ATAT ARk HRIHE STell 318 &l 1 foshmit

¢. At fam o3 Heier,—
(%) Ure-f7m (R ) I SH= 3Mebid ‘= A1 ASTFIAR “HET” BT AR TRael huand Aset;
(@) die-f7ae (3) 7ed “TREE!” A1 ApAast “AREud” 31 Aolgh Sl hivdd JscT;
(1) Hre-Fem () Wed WehIdicr-

(T) T (T Tasi Ieial T SRael HIuAd Jsal ST d feieh 3 A6 £’ 0 TRIH Sl Sivdmd
T ST WU g~

“(d) W () wed fafafdse helean wemasi-a ued Seter fHafaad-ren sivrmefieomn
3TN HIVIATE! 3751, T doseR T ST ATe! AT hRUNEE theledUard JuIR el 31T SR fgferaren
STORTSTRIUTET THT 3751, IR hHATATAT Helgai=AT iR fohal ®el shierd WEr wr
T 3T R, T fgfaaare SToRmeieRoT @ Janf-acdren Yoo feast ffved aga.”.

(S) W () I IAAYHII SRIA SHI0Td STAT e (H) U 8.

2. WA fami= fam R0, weltet Wre-fram (2) = @e () welied “Serr” a1 HeTpauast “oiar qiet

Ro. WwH = fem R, e Uie-fw () = W () weled ‘SR ToRIigd” A1 oGSt ‘Yo
g TeIaT=T SaT Taerlig " BT HSTeh Qe ShuaTd Asa.

R2. A = 3%, el Uie-Tem (2 Weliel Tqehered T2l “QivR SUaT” BT Holg Tl SAThiureh
TRORRIHE ST 59T fSahTull ST1eT o718, @muastt fael “Hes FgferaTea1 a1 2aeh” &1 HSTehY e ST UTeh th{hRITE
I FRUATA I,

3. A frIed STeeiedn TYAT - T Hes WIEeTyHror GeRoT SHudrd Id 18,
(%) WT-Tsh e,
() STIFAIT 22 W,
(%) @ (T) AEfeT “/ STBMNER” F “/ STRNIRT” & HSThL SMe5UETd Jdia;
(@) G () =resvard IEa;

(SFT) S Hefiet “TehgeiarsT” a1 AeTgIuast “Hled edeh” TSTehT el heuaTd Jget ST o ferieh
R0 TR Q00 TR R FHRUATT ST ST HIHUATT IS,

(W) W I T afi=aie ¥ Heliet “R68” BT HSTehY aTesdTd A5,
3. A FAuMEd Seeiedl 74T - o Hed WGy M0 YERT Huald I9d 318, —
() TerierraTeiier sharHeiet HTehR TesveTd A5a;
(&) NT-Ueh A,
(Th) TR ¢ AL, -
(%) T (T) Tl “/ ITRMAR" G/ ITRNIRI § AR R0 AdieT;
(@) @S (i) FMeavdrd JEe;




HERTS IE TSTUS, ST 9R-37, THAR o IR, e ¥-20, 0% /THlfdHh 3-8, Ieh 2R%3 4
(3) & TelieT “TehqarisT” a1 TTepRIuasT ‘e < 2T HSiehy GRaet shivard Jsat ST
&, 310 TgaNl R0 0% TG S FIUATT STeAT SFHEITE HIUIT 5
(1) AT A FefieT uResE ¥ el “Re 8" BT HSTehR SRTesuad Use.
R¥. & (M Seeiedn AT - | 7 WIeTeTs o FERvT hudnd Iq 317,

(%) ANT-Tsh He,
(Th) STIRAI 22 HeEA, -
(%) T (T) T “/ TR T “/ TR 7 AT TG30ATd Idie;
(@) W (&) aesverd Ig;

(3) & TelieT “Tehqaraisr” AT FTepRIuasT ‘e <ah” BT HSiehy GRael hivard Jgat ST
fariah 9 Tl 20 0% TR TRI HIATT ST SIS WU d5T;

(@) 9N =R 0&d, 3TJshHIeh ¢ Heliet, “35 & -Fgfead a s darf-gfa eny-i-fFafaeaar sirmiea
oo A1 ASTRAIEst, “32 e o IRaeid g a8 ToTahR Sael Shiuard J5al.

4. H'@Tﬁ?ﬂm?h@ﬁwm—@ feier 2 Tjﬁ R0 24 T STeEUTd I

Q€. AT T o, Jeiel AT SIS GRael ShivdTd dgel ST al i 2 URIeT £ {44 TRIH STaT araet shevdrd
ST STHET AU 5 :—

i
[ frem ¢31(y) we) ]
faftraa wferawor eom=n MR SR TR - Eema=sTadid fgfada wer steer fifaa
IO RIS -l T,
( Fgfrrara dfaawor seum=n wfresr=ren qusiiet )

o e~ N N
L HIRETTEIRDIA AT
o a o .
R. HO|||"|°c|( IHTTQAlh e e s an e
3. |5< Elglil ”azlgal ”E" 3'&3'5;”5; ..................................................
¥, U@ AT TEH e
\* | El |E| || I alg [lgil C|3E| [ | |; | 00000000000000000000000000000000000000000000000
’?‘QJT&'HW W .
- SNTTHEE TN THAN DN L DT EEIENE TN LE FHE N TUTTIT0 % 0000000000000 000000000000000000000000000000000000
9 ‘wli\q(—l Sh L] :
. SNTTHEETINL TN T 710 D ZENTURLE IR UUTHY % 4000000000000 000000000000000000000000000000000000e
l q‘{-gﬂliqi %Q’qTqER iqa50|"qT :
- SN TELLE TEAL TN 7T T EANE N DT T 7T 0000000000000 000000000000000000000000000000000000
;o 3 3Tf\|!|| ) |;| %liil 3 E 5 | El ooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooooo
afe a@l 3]'&‘1%{ ﬂaé

STt MR 23feeRry.



g HERTSZ IR AU, WRT IR-37, THAR o A, Fea’ ¥-20, 032 /e 3-8, T1h 2%¥3
;Iﬁy
TR (Al o STTdI-2 ), HERTE, H,
TR (1T F SATRII-R ), HeRME, AR,

Qu. T femT=a foerm qoreTel “TardT-Ueh” 37T el shHich SUATd Asel ST TekdT-Ueh o Jetel ekl
STTET SR FHROATd IS i—

“AeRIT-g
[Fram ¢ (2); 38 (19); ¢ (W) IR (2) T (R) Tl ]
(fe. Theamdl 300 WEH @1Y)
st Teh TURT fHafaaa-TehRar STeRTeNRI qed
TA-Toz Fgfiea x ¥o dh X 2R X T FHHATATT Yob TSI feAiehIaR STERIT Jeiel STt o=
TR SRR 4.

e Y WA S T et Y GG S WU W o GE S W

BV B B

R0 R.2% %2 R.09Y &3 £.0%3
2 R.%¢4% ¥ R.04R &3 ©.R¢R
R R.2¢% %3 R.0%o0 §% ©.L&R
3 R.%¢Y %% R.02% &4 ©.3%
¥ R.%¢¥% ¥4 LRR% &8 ©.4%2%
R4 R.%¢3 ¥g L.Re? g9 9.%32%
R& R.8¢R %o LR¥3 §¢ ©.R&R
9 R.2¢0 ¥¢ CR23 &% ©.043
Y R.29¢ %R .LLl 9o §.4R9
RR R.%6§ Yo .68 ©g §.903
30 Q.23 42 Lol e §.40%
3R Q.28% 4R 2112 ©3 §.R%§
3R R.28% 43 L.9% 0¥ §.0L4
33 R.248% YWY .89 oy EWACY
3% R.24% 4Q &RV g 4.040
ES R.2¥Y u& L3R v 4.%%3
3% R.23% Yo 43R 14 4%
39 R.2R%§ Y4 £.6%% IS 4.02¢
3¢ R.22% 4R .3 o ERAL
R R.203 §o LR A ¥.82%
¥o R.0%0 &2 L.2R%

HERIST SHTTeT AT STCRTER J e,

ICGIGRIF
IR 3T9R O3] 9fEra.



HERTEZ I USTU, WRT IR -37, THAR o FEaR, Areaw ¥-¢0, 0% /T 23-2 R, Ieh 2R%3 9
FINANCE DEPARTMENT

Madam Cama Marg, Hutatma Rajguru Chowk,
Mantralaya, Mumbai 400 032, dated the 1st November 2021.

NOTIFICATION
CONSTITUTION OF INDIA.

No. MSC-2019/C.R.451/SER-4.—In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to article 309 of
the Constitution of India, the Governor of Maharashtra is hereby pleased to make the following rules
further to amend the Maharashtra Civil Services (Commutation of Pension) Rules, 1984, namely :—

1. These rules may be called the Maharashtra Civil Services (Commutation of Pension)
(Amendment) Rules, 2021.

2. Inrule 3 of the Maharashtra Civil Services (Commutation of Pension) Rules, 1984 (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal Rules”), in sub-rule (1),—

(a) in clause (a), after the words “Auditor General of India” the words “or Director, Accounts
and Treasury” shall be added and shall always be deemed to have been added;

(b) in clause (d), -
(i) sub-clause (i) shall be deleted;
(i1) in sub-clause (ii), the words “including sub-treasury,” shall be deleted.
3. Inrule 5 of the principal Rules,—

(a) in sub—rule (1), for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009 ;

(b) Following Note be inserted after sub-rule (1).—
Note — However, this entitlement would be optional.

(¢) in sub—rule (2), for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009.

4. After rule 8 of the principal Rules, the following rule shall be added and shall be deemed to
have been added with effect from the 30th May 1988, namely:—

(A) “8A. Restoration of commuted portion of Pension.—

(1) (@) In cases, where Government Servant who has commuted a portion of his pension
on the 1st April 1985 or thereafter, his pension shall be restored after completion of fifteen
years of his retirement.

(b) In cases, where a Government Servant commuted a portion of his pension and
completed fifteen years before the 1st April 1985, his pension shall be restored with effect
from the 1st April 1985.

(2) Each pensioner, who is eligible to get the commuted portion of his pension restored
under sub-rule (1) above shall apply in the Form-F duly completed, to the Pension Disbursing
Authority.

(3) In cases, where the pensioner has completed fifteen years from the date of retirement
on the 1st April 1985 or thereafter and had died subsequently, his legal heirs are also
entitled to receive arrears with effect from the 1st April 1985 or from date of completion of
fifteen years from the date of retirement whichever is later, till the date of the pensioner’s
death. For this purpose, legal heirs may also apply to the Pension Disbursing Authority.

(4) In the cases, where the pension payment order does not contain information
regarding commuted portion, the Pension Disbursing Authority shall obtain the information
from the Accounts Officer who had issued the pension payment order.



¢ TERTS IMH TSI, U =R -3, THAR § FLAR, AR al ¥-20, 012 /Hifdeh §3-2 R, I 2¥3

(5) The Pension Disbursing Authority shall intimate to the Accounts Officer, who had
issued the pension payment order, the full particulars of each pension case alongwith the
amount of pension restored for verifying its correctness in the Form G.

(6) The State Government employees, who had absorbed under Public Sector
Undertaking, Autonomous Bodies, Local Bodies, etc. and have received or opted to receive
commuted value for one third of pension as well as terminal benefits equal to the commuted
value of the balance amount of pension after commuting one third of pension, are not
entitled to any benefit under these provisions as they have ceased to be State Government
Pensioners.”;

(B) In rule 8A as so added,—

(i) in sub-rule (1), after the clause (), the following Explanation shall be inserted and
shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the 28th March 1990, namely:—

“Explanation.—In cases, where a Government Servant commuted the portion of
pension after the date of retirement, his pension shall be restored after completion of
fifteen years from the date of commutation of pension.”;

(i1) sub-rule (2) shall be deleted and shall be deemed to have been deleted with effect
from 2nd July 2015;

(ii1) sub-rule (6) shall be deleted and shall be deemed to have been deleted with effect
from 26th May 1997.

5. After rule 8A of the principal Rules, the following rule shall be added and shall be deemed
to have been added with effect from 26th May 1997, namely:—

“8B. Revision of the restored amount of one-third commuted portion of pension in respect
of the State Government employees who had drawn lumpsum amount on their absorption in a
Public Sector Undertaking or Autonomous Body or Local Body.— The cases of the revision of the
restored amount of one-third commuted portion of pension of absorbed Government employees,
who had drawn lumpsum amount on absorption, in a Public Sector Undertaking or Autonomous
Body or Local Body shall be regulated as per the Government Resolution issued by Government
in this regard, from time to time.”.

6. Inrule 9 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (3),—

() in clause (a), for the words “one hundred rupees” wherever it occurs, the words “ten per
cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted;

(1) in clause (), for the words “one hundred rupees” or “rupees one hundred” wherever it
occurs, the words “ten per cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted.

7. In Rule 10 of the principal Rules,—

(a) before the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted and shall be deemed
to have been inserted with effect from 11th March 1994, namely:—

“Provided that, if a pensioner has specifically mentioned the amount of commutation of
his final pension in his application of commutation of pension and as a result of Government
decision his final pension has been revised and enhanced retrospectively, if the pensioner
expresses his willingness, he is entitled to revised and enhanced amount of commutation
of his final pension upto one-third of revised final pension:”;

(b) in the proviso as so added, for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be
substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February
2009;

(c) after the proviso as so inserted the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

Provided further that, as per revised Pay Commission Order, the Government has
changed the pay scale and pension has been revised and enhanced retrospectively, the



HERTE I USTU, WRT IR -37, THAR o FEaR, Area] ¥-¢0, 0% /Tl 23-2 R, Ieh 2R%3 ]

pensioner may opt for difference of commutation, and he may submit the application to the
concerned authority for the same within six months from the date of order issued by the
Government. If the pensioner does not apply or opt for the difference it is presumed that
he is not interested for revised commutation.

(d) in the existing proviso,—
(1) for the words “Provided that” the words “Provided also that” shall be substituted;

(i1) for the words “rupees one hundred” or “one hundred rupees” wherever it occurs,
the words “ten per cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted.

8. Inrule 13 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (3),—

(i) for the words “pension papers prior to” the words “pension papers up to” shall be
substituted ;

(1) in the proviso,—

(a) for clause (c) the following shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from 3rd March 1990, namely:—

“(c) no such application of commutation of pension received after period specified in
clause (b) shall be rejected on the ground of not received it in time and if such application of
commutation of pension is received by the Head of office on or before the date of retirement
of Government servant, the commutation of pension shall become absolute on the next day
of his retirement.”.

(b) clause (b) and clause (¢) as so substituted shall be deleted.

9. Inrule 20 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (1), in clause (), after the word “the request”
the words “to the Audit Officer” shall be substituted.

10. In rule 22 of the principal Rules, sub-rule (1), in clause (b), for the words “one hundred
rupees” the words “ten per cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted.

11. In rule 25 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (1), in clause (b), for the word “subject” the
word “send” shall be substituted.

12. Inrule 31 of the principal Rules, in sub-rule (1), in the proviso, for the words “one hundred
rupees” wherever it occurs, the words “ten per cent. of basic pension” shall be substituted.

13. In Form A appended to the principal Rules,—
(a) in Part-I,
(1) in serial No.11,—
(a) in clause (a) the words “/ Sub-Treasury” shall be deleted,;
(b) clause (b) shall be deleted;

(i) in the Note, for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009;

(b) In part I1II, in para 4, the figures “266” shall be deleted.
14. In Form B appended to the principal Rules,
(a) In the bracket mentioned below the title, the sentence is deleted.
(b) in Part-I,
(1) in serial no.8,—
(a) in clause (a) the words “/ Sub-treasury” shall be deleted,;

(b) clause (b) shall be deleted;



R0

15.

HERTE I USTU, SRT =R -37, THAR o FEaR, Aees) ¥-¢o0, 0% /Tifdeh 23-2 R, ITeh 2R%3

(1) in the Note, for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009;

(c) In part III, in para 4, the figures “266” shall be deleted.
In Form C appended to the principal Rules,—
(a) in Part-I,
(1) in serial No.11,—
(a) in clause (a), the words “/ Sub-treasury” at both the places, shall be deleted;
(b) clause (b), shall be deleted ;

(i1) in the Note, for the words “one-third” the words “forty per cent.” shall be substituted
and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 27th February 2009.

(b) In part IV, at serial No. 8, for the figures and words “266-Pension and Other Retirement

Benefits-B-Commuted Value of Pensions” the words “Mention Proper Budget Head Here” shall
be substituted.

16.
17.
18.

In Form E, in Part I, after the words “here enter the” the words “name of” shall be inserted.
Form F appended to the principal Rules shall be deleted with effect from 2nd July 2015.
After Form F, the following form shall be added and shall be deemed to have been added

with effect from the 1st April 1985, namely :—

“FORM—G
(See Rule 8A(5))

Form of Intimation by the Pension Disbursing Authority to the Pension Payment Order Issuing
Authority regarding restoration of Commuted Portion of Pension.

© ©® % oA W=

To,

19.

(Particulars of Pension Disbursing Authority)

Name of Pensioner et e e e e e eee e e a——e e e et e e e s e attaaeeenaaaeas
Date of Retirement et eeeee e eeee e e ———e e e ettt eeeeaataaaeeenraaaas
Pension Payment Order No. L ettt —ee e e e e e e eeeee——————eaeaeeeaaaaananaes
Amount of Original Pension L ettt ———e e e e e e et eeee——————eaeaaeeeaaeanaaaas
Amount of Pension Commuted ettt et ee e e—er—eeeeeeeea e e e —————aaaeaeaaaanns
Amount of Pension restored ettt eeeeeeererreeeeeeeeaeaaata—araeaaaeeeeaananaaae
Effective Date of restoration L et teeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeeaeaeaaa—a——eaaaeeeeaaannnnas
Amount of Pension after restoration :...........cccccoiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeeis

Additional remarks, if any L ettt et eeeeeeeeteeeeeeeeaeaea——————aaaaeeeaaaanaanas

(Signature of Office-in-charge)
Pay and Accounts Officer, Mumbai /
Treasury Officer.

The Accountant General (A & E)-I, Maharashtra, Mumbai.
The Accountant General (A & E)-II, Maharashtra, Nagpur.”.
The existing table to the principal Rules shall be renamed as “TABLE-I” and after TABLE-I

as so renamed, the following Table shall be added, namely:—



TERTS IH AT, U7 =R -3, THAR § FEIER, Tea ¥-20, 012 /Hifdeh §3-2 R, I 2¥3

“TABLE-II

[See rules 8 (1); 26 (7); 28 (5) and 29 (1) & (2)]
(applicable from the 27th February 2009)

Basic Formula: Basic Pension x 40% x 12 x commutation value at age next birthday

Commutation value for a pension of rupee 1 per annum

based on the date of original application of Government servant.

2R

Age next Commutation Age next Commutation Age next Commutation Value
birthday Value expressed Dbirthday Value expressed birthday expressed as number
as number of as number of of year’s purchase
year’s purchase year’s purchase

20 9.19 41 9.075 62 8.093
21 9.187 42 9.059 63 7.982
22 9.186 43 9.040 64 7.862
23 9.185 44 9.019 65 7.731
24 9.184 45 8.996 66 7.591
25 9.183 46 8.971 67 7.431
26 9.182 47 8.943 68 7.262
27 9.180 48 8.913 69 7.083
28 9.178 49 8.881 70 6.897
29 9.176 50 8.846 71 6.703
30 9.173 51 8.808 72 6.502
31 9.169 52 8.708 73 6.296
32 9.164 53 8.724 74 6.085
33 9.159 54 8.678 75 5.872
34 9.152 55 8.627 76 5.057
35 9.145 56 8.572 77 5.443
36 9.136 57 8.512 78 5.229
37 9.126 58 8.446 79 5.018
38 9.116 59 8.371 80 4.812
39 9.103 60 8.287 81 4.611
40 9.090 61 8.194 .

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

Additional Chief Secretary to Government.

NITIN GADRE,

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY DIRECTOR,
RUPENDRA DINESH MORE, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD,
MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004. EDITOR : DIRECTOR, RUPENDRA DINESH MORE.



