
1. Jamner Panchayat Samiti awarded the second prize in 
the Yashwant Panchayat Raj Campaign.

 

Jamner Taluka Panchayat Samiti awarded the Second Prize worth Rs. 17 Lakhs at 
the State Level in the Yashwant Panchayat Raj Campaign for 2023-24 

Due to the effective implementation of various Central and State Government 
schemes and maintaining excellent standards of administrative management, 
Jamner Taluka Panchayat Samiti has been declared the recipient of the second 
prize worth Rs. 17 lakhs at the state level under the Yashwant Panchayat Raj 
Campaign for the year 2023-24. Mrs. MeenalKarnwal, Chief Executive Officer of 
the Zilla Parishad, has congratulated the officers and staff on receiving this award. 



The contribution of Panchayat Raj institutions — Gram Panchayats, Panchayat 
Samitis, and Zilla Parishads — is significant in the development of rural areas. All 
rural development schemes are implemented through Panchayat Raj institutions. 

 

Panchayat Raj institutions play a vital role in the development of rural 
Maharashtra. Major development schemes of the state are implemented through 
these institutions. It is necessary to encourage Panchayat Raj institutions based 
on their performance, enhance their efficiency, and foster healthy competition 
through recognition of excellent work. 

To promote this, since the financial year 2005-06, the state government has 
initiated the “Yashwant Panchayat Raj Campaign” award scheme at both 
divisional and state levels for district councils, Panchayat Samitis, and Gram 
Panchayats performing exceptionally in management and development activities. 

Under this campaign, Jamner Panchayat Samiti of Jalgaon district has been 
awarded the second prize worth Rs. 17 lakhs at the state level for their 
outstanding work. 

Mrs. MeenalKarnwal, CEO of the Zilla Parishad, has also made special efforts for 
the effective implementation of the Panchayat Raj campaign and is actively 
working towards making all Panchayat Samitis in the district more people-centric. 

 


